S&MD RFQ #822

FACE

VENDOR TYVEK SUITE SHIELD

RAEBUCK 4.35 FAILED TESTING $4.10
GLOBALXNET $4.77 $6.00
SHOPEMALL $4.88 $2.44
INOVATIVE $6.03 $1.14
POWER DYNAMICS $6.74 $4.57
ARAMARK $7.15 $4.95
FRONTLINE $7.50 $2.95
KENETIC $7.62 $0.75
SOULS $8.50 $2.24
USTTG $8.75 $2.05
GLOBAL TRADING $9.60 $23.00
NEWPORT $9.95 $1.10
10T $10.00 $1.15
DMARCK $11.37 $1.15
CLEAN & HEALTHY $12.25 $1.25
GALLS $12.30 $1.95
ACTION $14.25 $2.45
ATLANTIC MED $22.00 $3.50
ID&C $25.99 $1.99
IBILEY $32.20 $1.90
Y-NOT $43.00 $1.74
STAR POLY no bid $1.50
LIBERTY no bid $1.85
ALL FLORIDA PAPER no bid $2.20
ARMCHEM no bid $6.47
GALLOWAY no bid $2.82
SHARP no bid $1.57
CPR SAVERS no bid $3.50
RN WELLNESS no bid $1.79
FOOD MARKETING no bid $1.79
DORAL DIGITAL no bid $1.32
GLOCECOL no bid $1.09
SUSSMAN no bid $3.55
BROWN MED INC no bid $2.40
MEDIMPORTS no bid $2.80
PLAN B $0.69




