
STORES AND MAIL DISTRIBUTION

REQUEST FOR QOUTE

TABULATION

RFQ # item #820

COMPANY NAME

ADULT 

SURGICAL 

MASK FACE SHIELD GOWN 

SHOE COVER 

ADULT

SHOE COVER 

CHILDREN

ESTIMATED 

DELVERY

Action Group MGMT, LLC $14.00 $2.80 $4.50 $0.30 $0.30 1-2 weeks

Adorama $11.05 $0.85 $3.25 $0.22 $0.22

Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel $31.00 No Bid $7.73 No Bid No Bid 7-10 days

Atlantic Medical Gear $14.50 $4.00 $3.95 $0.21 $0.21

Mask/5 days; 

Shield/ASAP; All 

other items/14-21 

days

BizGifter $9.50 $1.55 $2.52 $0.41 No Bid

Mask/3-5 days; 

shield & shoe 

covers/5-7 days

Caprice Electronics Inc $7.50 $1.35 $1.92 $0.45 No Bid

Mask, Faceshield/5-

10 days; Gown/21-

60 days; Shoe 

cover/30 days 

Charter Trading Corporation $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 weeks

Clean and Healthy Products Inc. $9.20 $1.65 $4.10 $1.68 $1.68 7-10 days

COMPEQUIP SOLUTIONS LLC $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ASAP

Disaster Program $24.50 $2.95 2.55/1.45 .24/.11 .24/.11

Doral Digital Reprograhics $13.25 No Bid $4.95 $0.21 $0.21 30 days

East Continental Supplies $12.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5-7 days

East Continental Supply $12.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5-10 days

EW Polymer Group LLC $10.50 $1.00 $7.50 $0.07 $0.07 25 days

EW Polymer Group LLC $15.50 $2.58 $7.50 $0.09 $0.09 10-12 days

Galloway Office Supply $14.50 $1.99 $2.29 $0.26 $0.26 25 days

Gassant Enterprises, LLC $37.50 $3.00   No Bid No Bid No Bid 7-10 days

Gemma Suits LTD (DBA) Mask Supply $15.00 No Bid $4.45 $0.20 No Bid 30 days

Gemma Suits LTD (DBA) Mask Supply $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30 days

Germbusters 305 $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 500,000 MIN Order

Global Geeks Inc. $9.00 $1.99 $4.25 $0.60 $0.65

Mask/1-2 days; All 

other items/3-7 

days

Global Logistics Exhange $9.00 $0.99 $1.79 $0.08 No Bid

Mask/30 days; 

shield/5 days; 

Gown& show cover 

/40 days; shoe cover 

adult/40 days

Global Trading  Inc $17.50 $7.50 $7.50 $2.50 $1.12 14-21 days

Globalxnet Technologies, LLC. $16.00 $3.00 $3.00 $0.30 $0.25

Face Shield/7 days  

All other items 14 

days

Hans Development Group LLC $6.99 No Bid $3.25 $0.25 No Bid 30 days

Henry Schein Medical No Bid No Bid $2.79 $0.22 No Bid 5 days

Holsen Inc $13.50 $1.92 $1.53 No Bid No Bid

Mask/30 days; Face 

shield/3 weeks; 

Gown/7 weeks

Huajian US Services, Corp. $7.25 $1.75 $1.75 $0.17 $0.17

Mask&Face Shield/1 

week  Gown& Shoe 

Covers/3 weeks

Ibiley Uniform Inc. $8.00 $3.06 $1.64 $0.19 $0.19

Mask/Ready or 30 

days; Gown/10 

days; All other 

items/In stock

Ibiley Uniform Inc. $10.50 $1.24

Mask/Ready; 

Gown/30 days

ID&C (US) LLC $9.95 $1.30 $5.75 $0.15 No Bid

Mask & Face shield/ 

2 weeks; Gown & 

Shoe Cover/3-4 

Weeks

ID&C (US) LLC $14.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mask/2 weeks

ID&C (US) LLC $15.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mask/3-4 weeks

Innovative Incentives Inc. $10.50 No Bid $2.70 $0.60 No Bid

Mask & Shield/7-10 

days; Gown/14-21 

days

Innovative Incentives Inc. No Bid No Bid $3.30 No Bid No Bid 14-21 days

Intco Medical Industries $13.00 $1.50 $2.50 $0.18 No Bid 20 days

IOT LLC $11.00 $1.50 $2.95 No Bid No Bid 7 days

Kinetic Energy Consultants LLC $10.50 $0.60 $5.95 $0.50 $0.50

Kinetic Energy Consultants LLC $10.50 $2.00 $5.95 $0.50 $0.50

Lace Food Service $9.74 $1.98 $2.20 $0.23 $0.23 30 days
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Latamxport LLC $27.00 $4.05 No Bid $0.50 No Bid Ready for Delv.

LBK Christmas by Krebs No Bid $3.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5 days

Mersi Distribution LLC $5.70 No Bid $2.55 $0.82 No Bid 30-35 Days

Mo' Money Associates, LLC $5.95 No Bid $1.35 $0.20 $0.20

Mask/40-45 days; 

Gown/75-85 days; 

Shoe covers/60-75 

days

Onan Capital Inc $7.75 No Bid $1.25 5 days ARO

Plan B Concepts $8.98 $1.18 $2.98 $0.24 $0.45

Mask/17-19 days; 

shield & kid shoe 

cover/12-14 days; 

Gown & Adult shoe 

cover/ 45 days

Power Dynamics Corp. $23.76 $3.69 $3.49 $0.92 $0.82

Mask/10 All other 

items/15 days

PPE M Plus, LLC $20.00 No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid

Presidential Procurement IMPEX LLC $13.11 No Bid $3.90 No Bid No Bid

Mask/14 days; 

Gown/20 days

Promo 1 America $14.00 $2.14 $3.13 $0.63 $0.54

Mask/20 days; 

Gown/15 days; 

Shield and Kid Shoe 

cover/30 days; Adult 

shoe cover/28 days

Promotional Designs $7.50 No Bid $1.45 $0.05 No Bid

Mask 15 days; 

Gown/35 days; Shoe 

cover/ 20 days

Pyramid School Products $14.98 $2.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mask 14-21 days; 

Shield/21-30 days

Salk Marketing Group $12.00 $1.79 $4.30 $0.38 $0.38

Mask & Shield/10 

days; all other 

itemsd/30 days

Sarandrea Associates Group Corp $9.60 $1.39 $1.67 $0.38 No Bid 30 days

School Health Corporation $21.04 $4.85 $1.78 $0.40 No Bid

In stock-within 1 

day 

Sharp Marketing, LLC $9.88 $1.30 $1.50 $0.25 $0.25

Mask/30 days; 

Shield/1 day; 

Gown/7 days; shoe 

covers/49 days

Shenzhen Hezheng Industrial Delopment Co, 

LTD $8.00 $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 days

Shieldward $19.50 $2.25 $3.00 $0.60 $0.60 10-14 days

Souls, Inc $13.50 $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5 days

Sumymca International LLC $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10 days

Suncoast Mrketing, Inc. $10.00 $0.89 $0.96 $0.11 $0.11

Mask/30-45 days; 

Face shield/8-12 

days; Gown/35-45 

days; shoe 

covers/40-50 days

Sussman & Han $27.50 $3.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3-5 days

Techniworld $9.00 $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7 days

Tempted Apparel $11.00 No Bid $2.00 No Bid No Bid

Mask/5-7 days  

Gown/6-7 weeks

TFH Global Inc. $12.00 $1.25 $2.60 $0.35 No Bid

Face Shield/7 days  

All other items/ 4-6 

weeks

The Alison Mfg Co. dba The Alison Group $17.50 $1.95 $0.55 $0.10 No Bid 30-70 days

Tomahawk Safety $29.00 No Bid $2.49 No Bid No Bid

Mask-

Immediate/Californi

a; Gown/Aug. 3, 

2020

Trans Terra Technologies LLC $6.00 $2.50 $1.50 No Bid No Bid 6 days

U. S. TTG LLC $9.50 $2.05 No Bid $0.22 $0.25 30 days

Unispace Health $8.50 $0.91 $2.70 No Bid No Bid

Mask & Gown/1 

week; Face shield/1 

week

USA Medical Supply $18.50 $0.87 $2.36 $0.08 No Bid 10-14 days/SM

USA Medical Supply $6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10-14 days/MM

Vaswani Inc. $29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2-3 weeks

William V. Macgill & Co. $19.50 $5.21 $4.00 No Bid No Bid 7-10 days

Y-Not Design and MFG. Inc. $13.00 $2.39 $2.95 $0.32 $0.31 1 week

A low quote does not constitute an automatic award. All quotes will be reviewed by the administrator to determine the lowest bidder meeting specifications and conforming to the scope of work.  Low bidder meeting 

the specifications must preform the scope of work at the price quoted, in the time frame mutually agreed upon. Failure to timely complete the work constitutes  a DEFAULT of agreement, and vendor is subject to 

removal from quotation list.
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