
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA 

Procurement Management Services 

NOTICE OF AGENCY DECISION 

A decision to award the Request for Quotation (RFQ) below, has been made as follows: 
 
Date:    January 24, 2012     
 
Term Bid No./Name: 081-JJ09  – Maintenance and Repair Operations (MRO)  
                                           Products (Pre-Qualification of Bidders)  
 
RFQ #:   081JJ09-0043 – Plumbing Supplies 
 
Term:    1/27/12 – 11/16/12 
 
Project Title:   Stock replenishment inventory 
 
School/Site:   Maintenance Materials Management (MMM) 
 
Opening Date:  January 12, 2012 
 
Buyer: Oretha Houser, C.P.M., CPPB 

Procurement Management Services 
Room 352, SBAB 
1450 N.E. 2 Avenue 
Miami, FL  33132 
 

Department Contact: Thomas Jones, Coordinator II 

AWARDEES: 

LEHMAN PIPE $     13,029.36      Item: 1 

LION PLUMBING $    111,045.11     Items: 4, 5, 6, 7, 9, 11, & 13 

TOTAL AWARDS:             $    124,074.47 

    Items: 2, 3, 8, 10, & 12 – PENDING FURTHER EVALUATION 

 “Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure 
to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall 
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.”  

Subsequent to compliance with FS 120.57(3) a purchase order will be issued for this service, as 
needed and/or when funded. THIS IS NOT A NOTICE TO COMMENCE (NTC) WORK. 



SPREADSHEET
The School Board of Miami-Dade County,  Florida

PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 

RFQ No. 081-JJ09-0043
PLUMBING SUPPLIES

 

M/TE = ALTERNATE BRANDS REQUIRES 

EVALUATION PRIOR TO ACCEPTANCE

ITEM # M-DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM ANNUAL 

EST. 

QUANTITY

UOM LOWEST 

EXTENDED 

PRICE

Interline 

Brands, Inc. 

d/b/a 

Sexauer

EXTENDED PRICE ENTER 

MANUFACTURER 

NAME/PART NO. FOR 

EACH LINE ITEM. 

FAILURE TO PROVIDE 

THIS INFORMATION 

WILL RULE YOUR 

QUOTE NON-

RESPONSIVE

Lehman Pipe EXTENDED PRICE ENTER 

MANUFACTURER 

NAME/PART NO. FOR 

EACH LINE ITEM. 

FAILURE TO PROVIDE 

THIS INFORMATION 

WILL RULE YOUR 

QUOTE NON-

RESPONSIVE

Lion Plumbing EXTENDED PRICE ENTER 

MANUFACTURER 

NAME/PART NO. FOR 

EACH LINE ITEM. 

FAILURE TO PROVIDE 

THIS INFORMATION 

WILL RULE YOUR 

QUOTE NON-

RESPONSIVE

  Pr ice shall be 

per  unit of 

measure

$ $ $ $ $ $

TOTAL  

1 595-0686 / 

1005284 

SEAT,TOILET,BLACK,ELONGATED, WITH SELF-

SUSTAINING HINGE. APPROVED BRAND:

BEMIS-1955 SSC OR EQUAL,(ADULT)

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: BEMIS

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 1955 SSC

                                

932 EA $13,029.36 $17.25 $16,077.00 BEMIS 1955SSCT SX-278178 $13.98 $13,029.36 BEMIS 1955SSCT (AWARD) $14.50 $13,514.00 BEMIS 1055SSC BLACK 

2 600-1513 

1005457

CLEANER,PVC,QUART-

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: GENERIC

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: NONE

286 CN $1,455.74 $6.45 $1,844.70 IPS WELD-ON P68 SX-

470225
$5.23 $1,495.78 OATEY 30805 $5.09 $1,455.74 CLEAR CLEANER OATEY 

#30805                          OR 

$6.49 -PURPLE CLEANER -

OATEY #30758  (M/TE)

3 594-3434 / 

1005246 

FAUCET,GOOSENECK,W/WRIST BLADE. APPROVED 

BRANDS: CHICAGO BRAND-895-

317;CENTRAL BRASS-0094-GSEAELS; KOHLER PART # 

K-13335

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: KOHLER

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: K-13335

151 EA $7,787.07 $129.50 $19,554.50 CHICAGO 895-317 CP SX-

151605
$56.18 $8,483.18 0094GSAELS CENTRAL 

BRASS
$51.57 $7,787.07 CENTRAL 0094-6SAELS 

(M/TE)

4 113-0129/ 

1002698 

BUBBLER,VALVE TYPE CHROME TYPE - 12000 A 

NORMAL PRESSURE

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: EBCO/OASIS

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 030774-006             

177 EA $13,374.12 $92.50 $16,372.50 EBCO 12000 SX-172908 $75.73 $13,404.21 OASIS 030774.006  $75.56 $13,374.12 OASIS 030774-006   (AWARD)  

5 590-2592 / 

1004929 

FAUCET,WALL-TYPE,SWNG L SOAP - DISH W/8" SPOUT 

NUT METAL

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: CENTRAL BRASS

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 0047UA

230 EA $14,283.00 $67.45 $15,513.50 CENTRAL BRASS 0047-UA 

SX-206169
$67.65 $15,559.50 0047UA CENTRAL BRASS $62.10 $14,283.00 CENTRAL 0047-VAI  

(AWARD) SHOULD BE AS 

SPEC.

6 588-3636 / 

1004760 

VALVE,PRESSURE & TEMP-1" - FEMALE MZ 125 PSI 6"-

LN

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: WATTS

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: N240X

5 EA $1,517.10 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $339.30 $1,696.50 WATTS N240X $303.42 $1,517.10 N240X WATTS  (AWARD)

PH 305-995-2349

ohouser@dadeschools.net
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SPREADSHEET
The School Board of Miami-Dade County,  Florida

PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 

RFQ No. 081-JJ09-0043
PLUMBING SUPPLIES

 

M/TE = ALTERNATE BRANDS REQUIRES 

EVALUATION PRIOR TO ACCEPTANCE

ITEM # M-DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM ANNUAL 

EST. 

QUANTITY

UOM LOWEST 

EXTENDED 

PRICE

Interline 

Brands, Inc. 

d/b/a 

Sexauer

EXTENDED PRICE ENTER 

MANUFACTURER 

NAME/PART NO. FOR 

EACH LINE ITEM. 

FAILURE TO PROVIDE 

THIS INFORMATION 

WILL RULE YOUR 

QUOTE NON-

RESPONSIVE

Lehman Pipe EXTENDED PRICE ENTER 

MANUFACTURER 

NAME/PART NO. FOR 

EACH LINE ITEM. 

FAILURE TO PROVIDE 

THIS INFORMATION 

WILL RULE YOUR 

QUOTE NON-

RESPONSIVE

Lion Plumbing EXTENDED PRICE ENTER 

MANUFACTURER 

NAME/PART NO. FOR 

EACH LINE ITEM. 

FAILURE TO PROVIDE 

THIS INFORMATION 

WILL RULE YOUR 

QUOTE NON-

RESPONSIVE

7 595-0112 

/1005266  

VALVE,CLOSET,1.6 GALLON-

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: SLOAN REGAL OR 

EQUAL

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 111YB REGAL

200 EA $12,096.00 $72.75 $14,550.00 SLOAN 111-XL SX-304543 $61.04 $12,208.00 SLOAN REGAL 111XL $60.48 $12,096.00 SLOAN 111YB  (AWARD)

8 590-2151 / 

1004908  

PLUG,CLEANOUT,2 1/2" COUNTERSINK F/3 FOR C/O 

PLUG#3

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: PHELPS DODGE  

25-631

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: NONE

6 EA $16.92 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $2.82 $16.92 CPC250  MATCONORCA 

(M/TE)
$5.03 $30.18 PASCO 1854

9 590-2550 / 

1004927 

FAUCET,LAV COLD CP ,SINGLE BRASS BASIN FAUCER

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: CHICAGO

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 700COLDCP                                         

48 EA $2,693.76 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $61.71 $2,962.08 700COLDCP CHICAGO 

FAUCET
$56.12 $2,693.76 CHICAGO 700COLD CP  

(AWARD)

10 590-2789 / 

1004938  

WASTE,2" FOR USS,CAFE SINK -

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: FRANKLIN

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: T & S B 3913

85 EA $2,614.60 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $31.25 $2,656.25 B-3913 REPLACED BY T&S 

B-3952
$30.76 $2,614.60 T&S B-3952  (M/TE)

11 590-2703/ 

1004933 

FAUCET,LAVATORY,SELF CLOSING,PUSH, MFG 

NAME:T & S MFG PART NO:

B-0712

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: T & S

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: B-0712

   

1303 EA $59,638.31 $93.25 $121,504.75 T & S BRASS B-0712 SX-

470539
$46.19 $60,185.57 T&S B-0712 $45.77 $59,638.31 T&S B-0712  (AWARD)

12 595-4185 / 

1005341 

TAILPIECE,1-1/2" X 12" CP,  17 GAUGE

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: CONNECTICUT 

STAMPING

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 4812-12

217 EA $1,200.01 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $6.97 $1,512.49 OATEY 803-17-1  $5.53 $1,200.01 PASCO 34354 (M/TE)

13 595-5114 / 

1005358 

FAUCET,LAVATORY 4" SPREAD-

SPECIFIED MANUFACTURER NAME: CENTRAL BRASS

SPECIFIED MFG PART NO: 1137-A

179 EA $7,442.82 $44.50 $7,965.50 CENTRAL BRASS 1137-A SX-

206334
$45.29 $8,106.91 1137-A  CENTRAL BRASS $41.58 $7,442.82 CENTRAL 1137-A (AWARD)

TOTAL $137,148.81 $213,382.45 $141,316.75 $137,646.71

PH 305-995-2349

ohouser@dadeschools.net
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