
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING

Procurement Management Services
1450 N.E. 2nd Avenue, Room 650

Miami, FL 33132

BID/RFP ADDENDUM

BID/RFP TITLE: _________________________________________________________BID/RFP No.

Addendum No.

Direct All Inquiries To
Procurement Management Services

Buyer's Name:

Date:

PHONE:   (305) 995- 
Email:

TDD PHONE:  (305) 995-2400

All information, specifications terms, and conditions for the above-referenced BID/RFP, are included on the document
posted on the Procurement Management website at http://procurement.dadeschools.net   

1. If your bid/proposal has not been submitted, substitute the pages marked REVISED and mail your
entire bid/proposal package. REMEMBER TO SIGN THE BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM.

2. If your bid/proposal has been submitted, sign and return this addendum form with the revised pages
by the time and date indicated on the Bidder Qualification Form.  BY SIGNING THIS ADDENDUM,
THE VENDOR AGREES TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THE BIDDER
QUALIFICATION FORM AND ALL RELATED BID DOCUMENTS.

OR

I acknowledge receipt of Addendum Number 

PLEASE NOTE: If your firm has forwarded a copy of this bid/proposal to another vendor, it is your responsibility to
forward him/her a copy of this addendum.

(PLEASE TYPE  OR PRINT BELOW)
LEGAL NAME OF BIDDER: ________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________MAILING ADDRESS:

CITY, STATE ZIP CODE: __________________________________________________________________________________

FM-4254 Rev. (11-14)

TELEPHONE NUMBER:____________________ E-MAIL I.D. _____________________ FAX # ________________________

BY: SIGNATURE (Manual): 
OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

NAME (Typed): 
OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

This addendum modifies the conditions of the above-referenced BID/RFP as follows:

TITLE:

The attached pages containing clarifications, additional information and requirements constitute an integral part of the
referenced bid.



ITB-14-029-AC: Food Service Paper Goods & Containers 

1- We are a small women owned business located in Broward County, where do we stand at 

this opportunity with Miami Dade for  this bid?  

Answer:  Local vendor preference only applies to businesses that are located within Miami-

Dade County.  See Section 1.14 Small/Micro Business Enterprise Program within the bid for 

MDCPS small business initiative information.     

2- Is the pre-bid conference mandatory, or could it be held by phone? 

Answer:   The pre-bid conference is not mandatory and it was not held by phone. 

3- Where may I find the last price for this previous bid in reference? 

Answer:  Please see prior bid pricing which has been included within this addendum.  

4- You mentioned the minimum order in your bid, but what would be the number of deliveries 

for this minimum? Is it quarterly or monthly? 

Answer:   The number and deliveries will vary per item.  Please also see Section 2.11 

Estimated Quantities.    

5- Do I need to be in vendor pool in order to participate for this bid?  

Answer:   You need to be a registered vendor with MDCPS to be an awarded vendor.  

6- How many samples do you request if my product is not the brand requested, please indicate 

if it is unit, cases, etc.? 

Answer:   Bids are being accepted for the items that match the descriptions, specification and 

brands listed.  If a sample is needed a request will be made by the Procurement Analyst.   

7- How many deliveries within a year? How many years will the contract be? 

Answer:   There is no set number of deliveries for this contract.  The contract will be awarded 

for two (2) years initial term with three (3) one year options to renew. 

8- Can you supply us with the award pricing and winning vendor(s) for Items No. 73 & 74, the 
gloves, as we are not finding this information in the previous bid? 
 
Answer:    Item 73: Current RFQ Pricing $13.95 per case of 10 boxes 
       Item 74: Current RFQ Pricing $13.85 per case of 10 boxes 
 
 



 
 
 
9. - On page 22: Delivery Times: it indicates that the successful bidders must be able to ship 
items directly to the Stores & Distribution Warehouse. Can you tell us how the gloves are 
delivered: are they delivered to stores and warehouse, or only the warehouse? Can you also 
supply us with the same delivery information on items no. 54 through 56. 
 
Answer:    Deliveries will be made to the address as specified on each purchase order, or as 
specified by the Department of Food and Nutrition.  At this time all items are delivered to the 
M-DCPS Stores and Distribution Warehouse.  
 
9. - Does a bidder have to submit a copy of current registration with the Florida Department of 
State, Division of Corporation with the bid, or can the bidder submit it, upon award of contract. 
 
Answer:    Please refer to page 26 of 42 of the bid.  
 
10- Can you please tell me how can I retrieve a copy of the current year tabulation? 

Answer:   Please see prior bid pricing which has been included within this addendum. 
 
 



Primary Alternate

Item# M-DCPS# Item Description
Est. Qty 

for 2 
Years

Unit Manuf- 
acturer Model #

Manuf Location 
(US manuf 
preferred)

Total Qty 
Per Case

Delivery 
Timeframe

$ Delivery 
to S&D WH

$ Direct 
Delivery to 

Each Location

Manuf- 
acturer Model # Manuf Location (US 

manuf preferred)
Total Qty 
Per Case

Delivery 
Timeframe

$ Delivery 
to S&D WH

$ Direct 
Delivery to 

Each Location
Tray, 1 compartment, Polystyrene, 
Insulated Base, Color black, 
Approximately 8-7/8” x 10-5/8” x 1-
1/4”, Case of 250 recommended.
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50010-3L 
or Equal
Tray, 3 compartment, Polystyrene, 
Insulated Base, Color black, 
Approximately 8-7/8” x 10-5/8” x 1-
1/4”, Case of 250 recommended. 
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50310-3L 
or Equal

Lid, clear fits Item #1 and #2, 
Approximately 9-3/8” x 7-3/8” x 1-1/4”, 
Case of 250 recommended.  

Approved Brand(s): Genpak 94500 
Clear lid or Equal.
Dish Tray, Polystyrene construction, 
square, overall length and width 
approximately 4”, not to exceed 4-
1/2”, Color white, Case of 1000 
recommended. 
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 1001 or 
Container, no compartment, 
Polystyrene foam, No compartment, 
Medium with Hinged lid.  To be used 
for hot or cold items, Approximately 9-
1/2” x 8-3/4”, Case of 200 
recommended.  
Approved Brand(s): Genpak SN240 or 

Tray, 5 compartment, Polystyrene with 
a minimum .140” gauge, Approximate 
weight 10.2 grams per tray, Color 
black, Clear of imprints, Approximately 
10” x 8” x 1”, Packed in cardboard 
cartons, Case of 500 recommended.  

Approved Brand(s): Pactiv 
YTHB0500NMLK or Equal.
Tray, 3 Compartment with Hinged Lid, 
Polystyrene Foam, Side Closed, 
Medium Size, Approximately 9" x 9.4" x 
3" , Case of 200 recommended.
Approved Brand(s): EC Pack 93200 or 
Breakfast Tray - 6” x 7.5” x .875”; 18-
point Clay Coated Board, printed 
one/two color, Imprint to read 
“Breakfast – Fuel for School” Case of 
500 recommended   
Approved Brand(s): Cedar Grove or 

*Item 5 will be rejected due to bids submitted not meeting specifications and alternate submittals with 
excessive pricing.  Item will be quoted out to preapproved vendors on this bid.

2000293 8,050 
Cases

Each

4

5*

1 -2 WEEKS  $     0.01530 Each

BID PROPOSAL FORM  (FORMAT B)

Bid # 034-NN03 Food Service Trays and Containers
ALL FLORIDA PAPER - M/WBE and Local Vendor

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

1 2000341 3,200 
Cases

Each

3 2000342 7,000 
Cases

COVINGTON, NJ

Each

5,500 
Cases

2000429

 NO BID 

 NO BID  NO BID 

PACTIV OTF101SO

2000307 800  
Cases

Each

2000114 1,200 
Cases

 NO BID  NO BID Each

 $            0.01530 

PACTIV YTD18801000
0 1 -2 WEEKS  $     0.05690  $            0.05690 

1000

150COVINGTON, NJ

 $     0.05733  $            0.05733 

PACTIV YTHB0500NM
LK 1 -2 WEEKS  $     0.03050  $            0.03050 

PACTIV

500

150YTD19903EC
ON

COVINGTON, NJ

COVINGTON, NJ

1 -2 WEEKS  $     0.05026  $            0.05026 8 NEW 10,000 
Cases

Each SQP 5008412 SCOTIA, NY

2

6 2000411 196,000 
Cases

Each

7

DADE PAPER & BAG CO. - Local Vendor

GENPAK 50010-3L 
DP#246024

HOPEHULL, AL; 
CHARLOTTE, NC; 

SEBRING, FL
250 7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.1192  NO BID 

GENPAK 50030-3L 
DP#246020

HOPEHULL, AL; 
CHARLOTTE, NC; 

SEBRING, FL
250 7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.1192  NO BID 

GENPAK 94500 
DP#246022

1 -2 WEEKS

HOPEHULL, AL; 
CHARLOTTE, NC; 

SEBRING, FL
250 7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.1677  NO BID 

PACTIV OTF101SO

COVINGTON, GA; 
TEMPLE, TX; 

CANANDAGUA, NY; 
FRANKFURT, IL; 

BAKERSFIELD, CA

1000 7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.0164  NO BID 

PACTIV YTD18801DP#2
34999

COVINGTON, GA; 
TEMPLE, TX; 

CANANDAGUA, NY; 
FRANKFURT, IL; 

BAKERSFIELD, CA

150 7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.0634  NO BID 

PACTIV YTB0500DP382
015

COVINGTON, GA; 
TEMPLE, TX; 

CANANDAGUA, NY; 
FRANKFURT, IL; 

BAKERSFIELD, CA

7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.0329  NO BID 

PACTIV YTD19903 DP-
234943

COVINGTON, GA; 
TEMPLE, TX; 

CANANDAGUA, NY; 
FRANKFURT, IL; 

BAKERSFIELD, CA

200 7 - 14 DAYS  $       0.0462  NO BID 

 NO BID  NO BID 

Section I: For Items 1 through 8 an award will be made per item as listed below.  The bid may be awarded to two (2) responsive and responsible vendors (Primary and Alternate), offering the lowest price and meeting all requirements.  The

 NO BID 
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Item# M-DCPS# Item Description
Est. Qty 

for 2 
Years

Unit

Tray, 1 compartment, Polystyrene, 
Insulated Base, Color black, 
Approximately 8-7/8” x 10-5/8” x 1-
1/4”, Case of 250 recommended.
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50010-3L 
or Equal
Tray, 3 compartment, Polystyrene, 
Insulated Base, Color black, 
Approximately 8-7/8” x 10-5/8” x 1-
1/4”, Case of 250 recommended. 
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50310-3L 
or Equal

Lid, clear fits Item #1 and #2, 
Approximately 9-3/8” x 7-3/8” x 1-1/4”, 
Case of 250 recommended.  

Approved Brand(s): Genpak 94500 
Clear lid or Equal.
Dish Tray, Polystyrene construction, 
square, overall length and width 
approximately 4”, not to exceed 4-
1/2”, Color white, Case of 1000 
recommended. 
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 1001 or 
Container, no compartment, 
Polystyrene foam, No compartment, 
Medium with Hinged lid.  To be used 
for hot or cold items, Approximately 9-
1/2” x 8-3/4”, Case of 200 
recommended.  
Approved Brand(s): Genpak SN240 or 

Tray, 5 compartment, Polystyrene with 
a minimum .140” gauge, Approximate 
weight 10.2 grams per tray, Color 
black, Clear of imprints, Approximately 
10” x 8” x 1”, Packed in cardboard 
cartons, Case of 500 recommended.  

Approved Brand(s): Pactiv 
YTHB0500NMLK or Equal.
Tray, 3 Compartment with Hinged Lid, 
Polystyrene Foam, Side Closed, 
Medium Size, Approximately 9" x 9.4" x 
3" , Case of 200 recommended.
Approved Brand(s): EC Pack 93200 or 
Breakfast Tray - 6” x 7.5” x .875”; 18-
point Clay Coated Board, printed 
one/two color, Imprint to read 
“Breakfast – Fuel for School” Case of 
500 recommended   
Approved Brand(s): Cedar Grove or 

2000293 8,050 
Cases

Each

4

5*

Each

BID PROPOSAL FORM  (FORMAT B)

Bid # 034-NN03 Food Service Trays and Containers

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

1 2000341 3,200 
Cases

Each

3 2000342 7,000 
Cases

Each

5,500 
Cases

2000429

2000307 800  
Cases

Each

2000114 1,200 
Cases

Each

8 NEW 10,000 
Cases

Each

2

6 2000411 196,000 
Cases

Each

7

Section I: For Items 1 through 8 an award will b

Manuf- 
acturer Model #

Manuf Location 
(US manuf 
preferred)

Total Qty 
Per Case

Delivery 
Timeframe

$ Delivery 
to S&D WH

$ Direct 
Delivery to 

Each Location

Manuf- 
acturer Model #

Manuf Location 
(US manuf 
preferred)

Total Qty 
Per Case

Delivery 
Timeframe

$ Delivery 
to S&D WH

$ Direct 
Delivery to 

Each Location

GENPAK 50310-3L 48 HOURS

GENPAK 94500 48 HOURS

GENPAK SN240 48 HOURS

PST 010395 DOMINICAN 
REPUBLIC 200 48 HOURS

EDWARD DON COMPANY - Local Vendor

GENPAK 50010-3L USA 250 2 - 3 WEEKS  NO BID 

GENPAK 50310-3L USA 250 2 - 3 WEEKS  NO BID 

GENPAK 94500 USA 250 2 - 3 WEEKS  NO BID 

GENPAK 1001 USA 4 WEEKS  NO BID 

GENPAK SN240 USA 2 - 3 WEEKS  NO BID 

 NO BID 

 $       0.0746 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID  NO BID 

 NO BID 

e primary awardee will be contacted for all orders.  If the primary awardee fails to perform under the terms and conditions of the contract, the Alternate awardee will then be contacte

DISTRICT HEALTHCARE & JANITORIAL SUPPLIES - M/WBE and Local Vendor  ***NON-
RESPONSIVE

GENPAK 50010-3L 48 HOURS

 NO BID 

 $              0.2320 

 $              0.2320 

 $              0.2800 

 NO BID 

 $              0.2168 

 NO BID 

 $              0.2000 

 NO BID 

 $       0.1280 

 $       0.1280 

 $       0.1770 

 NO BID 

 $       0.0868 

 NO BID 

 $       0.0700 

 $       0.0909 

 $       0.0909 

 $       0.1278 

 $       0.0193 
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Item# M-DCPS# Item Description
Est. Qty 

for 2 
Years

Unit

Tray, 1 compartment, Polystyrene, 
Insulated Base, Color black, 
Approximately 8-7/8” x 10-5/8” x 1-
1/4”, Case of 250 recommended.
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50010-3L 
or Equal
Tray, 3 compartment, Polystyrene, 
Insulated Base, Color black, 
Approximately 8-7/8” x 10-5/8” x 1-
1/4”, Case of 250 recommended. 
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50310-3L 
or Equal

Lid, clear fits Item #1 and #2, 
Approximately 9-3/8” x 7-3/8” x 1-1/4”, 
Case of 250 recommended.  

Approved Brand(s): Genpak 94500 
Clear lid or Equal.
Dish Tray, Polystyrene construction, 
square, overall length and width 
approximately 4”, not to exceed 4-
1/2”, Color white, Case of 1000 
recommended. 
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 1001 or 
Container, no compartment, 
Polystyrene foam, No compartment, 
Medium with Hinged lid.  To be used 
for hot or cold items, Approximately 9-
1/2” x 8-3/4”, Case of 200 
recommended.  
Approved Brand(s): Genpak SN240 or 

Tray, 5 compartment, Polystyrene with 
a minimum .140” gauge, Approximate 
weight 10.2 grams per tray, Color 
black, Clear of imprints, Approximately 
10” x 8” x 1”, Packed in cardboard 
cartons, Case of 500 recommended.  

Approved Brand(s): Pactiv 
YTHB0500NMLK or Equal.
Tray, 3 Compartment with Hinged Lid, 
Polystyrene Foam, Side Closed, 
Medium Size, Approximately 9" x 9.4" x 
3" , Case of 200 recommended.
Approved Brand(s): EC Pack 93200 or 
Breakfast Tray - 6” x 7.5” x .875”; 18-
point Clay Coated Board, printed 
one/two color, Imprint to read 
“Breakfast – Fuel for School” Case of 
500 recommended   
Approved Brand(s): Cedar Grove or 

2000293 8,050 
Cases

Each

4

5*

Each

BID PROPOSAL FORM  (FORMAT B)

Bid # 034-NN03 Food Service Trays and Containers

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

1 2000341 3,200 
Cases

Each

3 2000342 7,000 
Cases

Each

5,500 
Cases

2000429

2000307 800  
Cases

Each

2000114 1,200 
Cases

Each

8 NEW 10,000 
Cases

Each

2

6 2000411 196,000 
Cases

Each

7

Section I: For Items 1 through 8 an award will b

Manuf- 
acturer Model #

Manuf Location 
(US manuf 
preferred)

Total Qty 
Per Case

Delivery 
Timeframe

$ Delivery 
to S&D WH

$ Direct 
Delivery to 

Each Location

Manuf- 
acturer Model #

Manuf Location 
(US manuf 
preferred)

Total Qty 
Per Case

Delivery 
Timeframe

$ Delivery to 
S&D WH

$ Direct 
Delivery to 

Each Location

FAYCROFT INTERIOR & PURCHASING, INC. - M/WBE and Local Vendor

GENPAK 50010-32
HOPEHALL, AL; 

CHARLOTTE, NV; 
SEBRING, FL

250 7 - 14 DAYS  $        0.1300  NO BID 

ed.  Estimated Quantities noted below are for a 2 year period and are listed for bidder's guidance only.  Please refer to Special Conditions #15 for further details.

GENPAK 50310-32
HOPEHALL, AL; 

CHARLOTTE, NV; 
SEBRING, FL

250 7 - 14 DAYS  $        0.1300  NO BID 

GENPAK 94500
HOPEHALL, AL; 

CHARLOTTE, NV; 
SEBRING, FL

250 7 - 14 DAYS  $        0.1800  NO BID 

 $        0.0599  NO BID 

PACTIV 07F-Y01SD
COVINGTON, GA; 

TEMPLE, TX; 
BAKERSFIELD, CA

1000 7 - 14 DAYS  $        0.1928  NO BID 

PACTIV YTD1880 
DP10234999

COVINGTON, GA; 
TEMPLE, TX; 

BAKERSFIELD, CA
150 7 - 14 DAYS  $        0.0800  NO BID 

 NO BID  NO BID 

PEMICA, INC. - Local Vendor

GENPAK 50010-3L GLENS FALLS, NY 250  $        0.1780  $              0.1980 

GENPAK 50310-3L GLENS FALLS, NY 250  $        0.1720  $              0.1850 

GENPAK

GENPAK

23000

94500 GLENS FALLS, NY 250  $        0.2030  $              0.2210 

1001 GLENS FALLS, NY 1000  $        0.0392  $              0.0499 

 $        0.1750  $              0.2320 GLENS FALLS, NY 200

 NO BID  NO BID 

PACTIV YTHB-0500 LAKEFOREST, IL 500  $        0.0701  $              0.0707 

GENPAK 23300 GLENS FALLS, NY 200  $        0.1120  $              0.1230 

GENPAK

GENPAK

10500PN
HOPEHALL, AL; 

CHARLOTTE, NV; 
SEBRING, FL

500 7 - 14 DAYS  $        0.0399  NO BID 

PACTIV YTD1990OP 
234943

COVINGTON, GA; 
TEMPLE, TX; 

BAKERSFIELD, CA
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