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‘ Direct ali inquiries to the
COMPLETE USING -y Bu,;ﬁu 9fIPr;curement atnd
TYPEWRITER Miami-Dade County Public Schools aleria’s Management.
OR BUYER NAMED:
BALL;’:I)::I'T PEN School Board Administration Building Linda Le.asburg~Kramer, C.P.M.
’ 1450 Northeast Setond Avenue PHONE: (305) 995-2305
Miami, Florida 33132 TDD PHONE {305) 995-2400
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM
BID NO. 150-CC01 BID TITLE DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL 2:00 P.M. ON Tuly 1. 2003 IN ROOM 351,
SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 1450 NE 2ND AVENUE, MIAMI, FL. 33132, AT WHICH TIME THEY WILL BE
PUBLICLY OPENED. BIDS MAY NOT BE WITHDRAWN FOR 90 DAYS AFTER OPENING. {REFER TO INSTRUCTIONS TO

BIDDERS, para.lV.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BID BY THE SCHOOL BOARD OF
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL

CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BID DOCUMENTS, NO
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED.

l. A. BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. (SEE INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. |. A2)

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or person
submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. |
agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and | certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder,

B. Vendor certifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

1L INDEMNIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold harmless, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hereinafter defined) against any claim, action,
loss, damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation,
attorney's fees and court costs arising out of bodily injury to persons including death, or damage to tangible property
arising out of or incidental to the performance of this Contract including goods and services provided thereto) by or on
behalf of the Bidder, whether or not due to or caused in part by the negligence or other culpability of the indemnity,

excluding only the. sole negligence or culpability of the indemnity. The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The
School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its members, officers and employees.

. PERFORMANCE SECURITY. Refer to INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para |.A.1., and VI., and check (x) below:
WHEN PERFORMANCE SECURITY IS REQUIRED | WILL FURNISH A;

Performance Bond Check (Cashier's, Certified, or Equal)
PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT BELOW
LEGAL NAME OF VENDOR :
MAILING ADDRESS :
CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE :
TELEPHONE NUMBER : FAX #
BY: SIGNATURE (ORIGINAL) ; DATE
OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
NAME (TYPED) : TITLE
OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

FM-3191 Rev. (02-99)




INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

PREPARRIG OF BIDS

A BODER QUALFICANDN FORM quslifies the bidder and the bid and must
be completed and submited a5 page 1 dfthe bid,

1. PERFORMANGE SECURITY. The fom of petfommance securty the tidder
wil submit, when reguired to do o, must be fumished. Perfomance seeurity
shali not be submittecd with the bid.

2 BDDER CERTRCATION AND DENTFICATION. Bid must cotlaib an
ctiginal manual sighature from an authorized representative. An unsigned bid
il be considered non @ sponsive.

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BOOERS dsfire condtions of the bid,

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Ary inconsistency inthishid shall be resolwed
kygiving precedence in the follbwing order,

A. Specfialions
B. Special Condlilions
C. |mstructions To Bidders

2 FOR MMBE designated bids. The SPECIA. CONDITIONS-
Minorityfomen anned and controled Bisiness Paticipation Statement and
the MAWBE Cetification Application MUST be completed and SUBMITTED with
the hid if the bidder is not cedfied by MiamiDade Courty Pubic Schools.
Failule to submit the completed application with the bid will be considered nan
PRSP .

C. BID PROPOSAL FORH defines requirrent of tems to be puchased, and
must be completed and submitted as page 2 and subsequent pages, T any, o
the bid. The bidder should hdicate hisher name in the appropriate space on
each page.

1. TEM SPECFICATION. Speciyng a certain biand, make ormamdacturer &
to dencte the quaiity, type, and standand of the atide desired. Aicles offered
must be new merchandse only, of equal or supetior grade. On blark lines
provided, the bidter & equested to  insert the brand name, manufacturer's
number and other nformation necessary to sutficiently idertify atide offered.
Failure to do somay prevert consideration of the tem, Ako, eferto paragraph
1% Packagihg.

2 PROTEST OF SPECFICATIONS. Bilders and proposers maytle ketters o
protest which shalt serve as a notice of pratest, with the School Boand Qerk, and
the Bureau of Procurement and Materal: Manggemert, within 72 hours priorto
the date and hour spectied inthe Bidder Owalification Form for receipt of bids.
The ktters of protest  wil be revisvved by the Bureas of Prociuement and
hdtenals Managemert and wil offer the protesting bidder the opporunty fo
meet and dscuss the merts of the protest. ¥ the piotest is not resolved, the
hidder may seek an admhistative heating pursiant to § § 120.569 and 120.57,
Fa,, Stat., byfitng 3 formalvwiten pratest wihin 10 days SHerfilng the notice o
piotest. Pettiors for hearing on protests pusignt to § § 120.569 and 12057,
Aa., Stat pust be filed b accordance with Schoot Board Rule 6Gx13- 8C.1 1Rd,
Failue to fie a timely nofice of pratest or failire to file a timely formal written
protest shall constitute a waiver of the preceeings. This provision supersedes
and govems owver ahy conflicthy provision inthis document.

3. PRIGES. Prices ae requested in units of quantity specfied in the bid
specfications. In case of a dscrepancy in computing the total amount of bid,
WNIT PRIGE quated wilt govemn. Al prices bid shall incude delivery F.OB.
destination, freight prepaid fb dder pays amd bearsheight changes. Bidder ouns
goads in transit and files any chims) and shall ndude all catage, dravage,
packing, efc., debvered to and unbaded at the receiving station at the site
designated in BID PROPOSAL FORMS and there receved by the desighated
agent of the Boand.

4. TAXES. The Board does not pay Feceral Excise and Stete taxes on died
purchase s of tangikle persona propetty. The applicable tax exemption mimber

is shonn onthe purchase onter. This exemption does not apply to puchasesd

tangible petsonal property made by cortradtars who use the tangble personal
property n the peromance o corfradts for the mpioverment of Boand onned
real propetty as defined in Chapter 192 of the Flonda Statutes.

SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A BID FORMS AND ENVELOPES. Bids must be submitted on  forns
fumished by the Beard and i sealked envelopes. Envelopes must be clearly
matkeduith bid number, kid tile and bid opening.

iL

B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. Uthen fling out the bid proposal form,
bidders are required i tse a typevniter or complete bid praposaiin k.

1. Use of pencd & prohibied.
2. Donot erase o use correction fluid to comect an error.
3. All changes must ke crossed out and indided i ink.

Thoss kids for indvidud tems that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 shove
wil be considered hon-responsive fortha item(s).

C. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids shal be submitted by US. Mail,
QourienExpress Senice, or deposited h the BID BOX bcated in Room 351,
800 AM. to 430 PM, Monday though Friday, SCHOOL BOARD
ADMINISTRATION BULDING, 1450 NE. Secend Avenue, Miami, Florida
33132. Bids received after the date and hour specfied in the BIDDER
QUALIAGATION FORMW wil ot be considered.

0. PUBUC ENTITY CRMES. Secion X7.13%2¢) Flonda Sttue. &
perscn or affiliate whe has been placed on the convicted vendor kst foloming a
conviction for a public entty crime may not submit a bid on 2 cortract to provide
any goods or services to a public ertity, may not submit 2 bid on a cortract with
a public entity for the corstruction or repair of a pubic buildng or pubic vk,
mzy not submiit bids on kases of mal poperty to a public entity, may not be
anarded or perform work as a contracter, suppler, subcortractor, or consultart
uncer a contract with any publc entty, and may nottransad businass with any
pullic entty in excess d the thieshold amount peovided in Section 287 M7, for
CATEGORY TWO tfor a period of 36 morths from the date of heing placed on
the convided vendor list.

E. SUBMITTING A “NO BID™ If nat submitting a bid at this time, retum the
tom entfied "NOTHCE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS." Faiure to respond,
ether by submitting a kid or the "NOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS" fam
Tor three conseculive times may resut in your company behg emoved fromthe
School Board's bid list.

F. AVALABLITY OF BID MNFORMANON immeditely foloning the public
opening, bids wll be read, upen request, and then comiled in a tabular form, 3
oopy of whichwill be avalable for examation b Procurement fanagement and
Maetials Testing.

CANCELL 90N OF BIDS ORREQLEST FOR PROPOSALS

An inviation for bids or Request For Proposals, ar cther solicitations may be
canceled, inwhoke or in pat, asmay be specified in the sdictation, when it is in
the hest interest of the Board,  The reasons shall bemade a part of the master
bid fie.

A Priorto opening, a solicitaion may be canceled h whole or h pat, prior to
the date and hour specified in the Bldder Qualfication Fomm for receist of bids,
when the Associte Supedntendent, Bureau of Procurement and Matenak
Wianagement, determies in wting that such adion is inthe best hterest of the
Board for raasons including, but not fimited to:

1. The Board no longer squires the supplies, senvices, or construction;

2. The Board nolonger can reasonably expect to fundihe procuremert;

3. Arviewof avdidpraest fled by a bidder asmaybe detemmined bythe
adrministative Sff; and

4. Pmoposed amehdments to the solctaion would be of such magntude
that a new solicitaion is desrable.

B. When a solicitation is canceled priorto opening, notice of canceliation shall
he sent to dl businesses solicied, via facsimie ormail and hidk or proposals
returmet o the vendor inopened.

C. Thenotice of cancelition shali:

1. ldentFythe sdicitation;

2. Briefly explain the reazon tor canceliation; and

3. Where appropriate, explainthat an opportunty ndl be given to compete
on any re-solictation on any fuwe procurements of simikr swpplies,
senices, or constuction.
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. CHANGE OR VWTHDRAWAL OF BIDS

A PRIORTO BID OPENMG. Shoudthe bidder desie fo change orwithdraw
hisher bid he/she shall do 0 ih witing. This communication & to be received
by the Disgtrict Director, Divksion of Procurement Management and Matetiak
Testing, Room 364, School Boand Adminishation Bulding, priorto date and hour
of bid opening. The bikier's ratme, the bid humber, the kid fitle and the date the
bid is due must appearonthe emvelope.

B. AFTER BID OPENRG. Afer bick are opened, they may not he changed,
nor withdraian for 90 days after the determined opening dabs unless othennise
specified onthe ‘BIDDER QUALIACATION FORM .

€. FALURE TO ACCEPT BD AUARD). Biiders who, priorto the Bid Svand
by The School Board of Miami- Dade Courty, Flotida, hdicate that they aw
unableto accept the bid anard shall ether:

1. Payto the Boand, a5 liguidated damages an amount equalto 5% of the unit
price bid times the quartity, or $10, whichever amourt & lamer, or

2. Lose eligivilty to transact new bushess with the Board for a perod of 14
morthsfromthe date the Boatd acts onthe withdrawn bid,

ANARDS

A RESERYATION FOR REJECTION OR AUARD. The Board resenes the
right to reject any or all bids, to wabe iregularities or technicalities, and to
recjuest rebiis. The Board meserves the rght to aveard on an indhvickiad item
hasi, any combhation of items, tatal low bid or, F an atemate kid is accepted,
onsuch terms & are specfied for the akemate bid, whichever manner isinthe
best inferest of the Boand.

B. AVARD RECOMMENDAION BidderProposer informaion phone lines
hawe been established i Procurement Managemert. Biddersioposers may
call 9351375, each Frday, to be advised of the recommended bidders or
poposers and the time L is contemplated tha  the recommendation wil be
made. This iformation willbe provided by school system staff as awilable. In
no case wil iformaion as o a recommended bidderroposerbe avaible lder
then the Friday precedity the week when the anamr & scheduled to be made by
the Schodl Boand orthe Supesntendent.

Biiders and proposers mayfie ktters o pratests, viththe Schoot Board Clerk,
within 72 hours after the posting of the bid tabulation or receigt of notice of the
Board s decision or intenden decision, The letters of prolest will be reviewed by
tre Bureau of Procaement and Matenak Management and wil offer the
protestig bidder the apporunity to meet and distuss the merts o the protest.
If the bidder is not satisfied withthe response tothe protest, heshe mayinvoke
the provisions of § § 120.569 and 120 57, Fla Stat. Petiions for hearings on
protests pusuant to § § 120569 and 12057 , Fla. Stat, must be fied in
accordan ce with School Board Rule 6Gx13- 8C-1064. Prtestsfled lterthan
the date spectied herein shall coretitute a naher of proceed ngsunder Chapter
120 Pordda Stahites. This pmovision supersedes and goverrs over any
canficting provision inthis document.

G. OFFCIAL AWARD DAYE. Avanls become offickl when made wnless
athernize spedfied i the avard recormencition.

D PURCHASE DRDERS, Puichase orders maled to successiu hidders are
the dficial notfication to deliver maernls desaibed therein; and the time
aloned for defivery begns wihihe date of the purchase omder. Inthe event that
the successful hidderfaib to detiverthe matetials in accomiance with the tems
and conditins of the bid and purchase order, the bidder shallbe considered
in default of the contract and subject to the defaut provisions stated in
Imstuctions to Bidders, Section V. E.

E. DEFART. Inthe exent of defout, which may nclude, but is nat limited 1o
nonperfommance  andby poor peformance, the ansmees  shall payta the
Board a liguidatest damages an amourt equal 1o 10% of the wnit price of the
itemfs] awarded, times the guatttywhen o purchase orler has been issued,
10 percert of the puchase order when a puchase order has been issued or
$100, wrichever & gredter.  IWhere no performance bond or check has been
required, each anardes who faiks to paythe liguidated damageswithin 15 days
after t is nvoked shall bse elighity to tramsact new business with the Board
for a period of 14 months from date of temmiration of anard by the Boanl.

Bidders who are determined irelgible may reguest a hearing pursuant to
§120.569 Fla. Slat,, and School Board Rule 6Gx13- BG4,

The Board reservesthe right 1o wabve liquidated damagesAsss of eligibilty.

"

T R TTIIEE—EEEEEEETT R pjjw—.

F. The irtent of the bi documerts is to include oriyths witten requiementsfor
maenals, equipment, systems, stamdards and workmanship necassary for the
pioper e secution and completion of the work bythe Bidder. The bid documerts
shall not be constued to crede an enditiment to any other scope of work
extept as speched herein.

PERFORMANCE SECURITY (FOR SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS DMLY

A PURPOSE. A peformance bond or check may he required to guarattee
pefomance.

B. BONDMNG COMPANY. Peformence Bords shall be waitten through a
reputabie and resnonsble surety bond agency licensed o do business in the
State of Florida and with 3 surety company or comortion meeting both of the
folloming specificaticns:

1. Buacdk Greater than $500000

A mirimum rating inthe 2est revision of Best's insurance Repots of:

Cottract Amount Minimuan Rating by AM. Best
$ 500,000,011 $2,500000 None
$2,500,000.01 to $5,000,000 B +or NA-3
NoMinimum Qass
$5,000,000.01 to $10,000,000 A- Chss v
$10,005,00001 o more A-Chss ¥

Qurrent cedlicate of authorty & acceptable surety on Federal Bonds in
aczortiance with the ktest ediion of the Unted States Treasury Depariment
Ciroular 570 enttled "Comparies Holdng Certficates of Authority as Acceptable
Sureties on Federal Bonds and as Acceptable Rehsuting Comparies” shall be
accepted for an amount hot exceeding the undenaiting limitation thereon.

2. funnds of P00 00N or | exs

Bords shall be vwiten with a surety company o comporation meeting the
quafications as set forth i Parayraph W B. shove or the qualifications set furth
in section 287.0335, Fotida Statubes.

G AAOUMT. When required as defined therein, the Timm or indiidials) to
whom an award has been made shal exeaute and defverto The School Board
of Miami Dade Courdy, Alorida, @ Pedomnance Bond, Cashiers/Certified
Check, orequal.

1, Mwards less than 200000 shall be exermpt from performance security.

2. Peformance securty shall not be required unie ss othenvise defined inthe bid
specifications. If Pefomnance security is required, it shall equal 100% o the
avkd amourt,

D . RELEASE OF PERFORMANCE SECURITY, Retum to the Anardes of
hisher cazh security, or notficationto the Snardse and the bonding companyto
cancel the peformance bond, will be made when al goodsAsnices have been
accepted ard invoices have been approved for paymert.

SAMPLES.
Wiken bigt samples are wequired, the buyer vill natify hidderto submit samples of
the items bid ih accordance wih the fdlaning procedares.

A Al samples must be enfitied with the bidders name, bid number, item
numker, and product name and number.  Uhere non-complignce with this
recquirement is noted, said iterm may be corsitered 35 heing unidentifiable and
may ndt be eligible for consideration in the ansrd recorvendation.

B. 1) samples ate to be celvered within 7 calendar days after receit o
nofification from  buyer, unless sthernize Saed in the Special Condlions of the
bid. 17 the bidder does rot submit samples bythe date and ime indcated bythe
huyer, the bid subtmitted for that tem may not be considered for anard.

C. Bidder must cbtan, from Materials Testing aid Evaluation, a signed receipt
acknowdedoing delivery o sanples. Bidder shall indude a self addressed,
samped envelope for retum of sample eceipt when submitting samples by mal
or delivery service.  The bidder il receive the original copy of the receipt and
the duplicate copy will remah with the Miami-Dade Courty Public Schook
receiviy department as the file copy. Bidder shal be sokely responsble for
delivery of samples and for retahing sample delfvery receipts, which must be
presented in any dispute iegarding receipt of bid samples.
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D Samples should be delivered to the foloming addess:

WlAM D ADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION
7040 West Flagler Street
Miami, Florda 33144
Telephone Number: (305] $95-3290

MiamiDade Courty Public Schools wil not be responsible for samples sertto a
loc@ion ctherthan the location mentioned i the Bid.

E. PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Boar! will buy no samples and wil
assume no cott incidental thereto.

F. RETURN OF SA4PLES. Samples na dz shioved in testing may be daimed
by unsuccassiul bidders 14 days aterbid anand date and by successful bidders
14 days after final payment; tut the Board wil assune mo responshilty for
samples not clamed within the time specified, and it wik pay for no samples
damaged in testing.

G.EVALUATION PND TEST RESULTS. (nterested Lidders should contect the
buyer, priorto the recommendation for anard, to detemie whatherthe tem(s)
submited complies with the specfications requirements. i the temis) does not
comply, the buyer wil advise the bidder to cortadt Materls Testing and
Evauation for further details.

SUBSTITUTIONS. Should the bidder find It necessary to use a materkl,
exipmmert, product or system other than spectied, the: bidder shell secue fiom
the Boaw!, through the Bureau of Procurement and Materids Managemert,
writen appioval for the use o the atemate mateak, equioment, product o
systemn. The Board is nat okiiyated 0 approve requests for substhuions and
hazthe dscretion to require the biclerto provide the matenals as specified in
the bid docurments. In no case shal the bidder be entitied to ackiLional time
andlor money aising out o the Boards faive o pprove requests for
substiutions.

PACKAG NG

A TYPE. It packaging is different from that specified, the bidder must note
the manrer and ameunts in which packaging & to be made; othemise the
successiul hidder shall fumish packaging as specfied. Al packaying,
wwapping and bunding shall be adequate to hsue tha materaks will be
received b undemaged condiion. The Board assumes mo responsibility for
damages of any kind incuned intranst.

B. GCONTANER DENTFICATION The folowng identfication shall be
phirted, stenciled or legbly weitten in a conspicuous location on each shivping
container

1. 81D NUMEE R AND/OR PURCH ASE ORDER NUMBER
2. VENDORS NAME ANDOR. T REDEMARK

3. NIME(S] OF | TRMI(S) CONTAINED

4. ITEM NJMBER(S) WI TH QUANT TY(ES)

PURCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCES.

it the consert and agreemert of the successtd bicder(s, purchases may
be made wnder this bid by Metropditan Dade Courty, Florida, and other
govemmental agencies or political subdinisions within the State d Florda.
Such purchases shall be governed by the seme terms ard condlions stated
hewin. This agreement h no ney restics or irterferes with the right of any
Siate of Flarida Agency or poltical subdivision fo rebid any or all of these
ftems.

RECYCLMNG REQUIREMENTS.

MiamiDade Courty Public Schooks supports recyding and recommends the
use of recytled products where possibie. Vendors are requested to submi a
{dter, dony wih their bid, indicatihg whether each tem bid andbor its
packaging contain pre-consumer or post-consumer neste, and if the produd
andlor padkaging may be recyded.

ENUROMMENTAL PRODUCTS.

MiamiDade Courty Public Schods encourages the use of envionmentathy
safe produds.

X

DELNMERY D BLLIG

A DEUVERY. Saumlays, Sundays, and hoiidays excepted, deliveries shall
be made & fdows: Schools and Depatmerts - 8:00 AM. to 3:00 PM.
Merchandise shall be unloaded at the e ceiving Sation of the designated
delivery poit and 1eceived there by 3 designated agent of the Boand. A
delivery ticket, or one copy of the imvoice, preparad as ndicated below, shali
accomparry each delivery,

B. RECEMING NSPECTION AND TESTING. Delivered ems which do nat
fulfil a1l requirements will be rejected. Rejected tems shail be removed amd
replaced promplly by the wvendor at no cost to the purchaser.

C. IMNOICES. Each nvoke shall be issued by the successtul bidder and
shall he submitted in DUPLICATE tothe Accourts Payahle Section, P.O. Box
01-2570, Miami, Porida 33101, To be considered for payment each hvolce
must show the falowing information mhich appears on the Purchase Order:

1. Puchase Omer Number

3. Cuartities ard Units
5. Totd Price of di items onthe imoice

2. ltem Descriptions
4. Price Extersions

0. PAYMENT. Unless othewise specfied by MamiDade County Public
Schods, payment vill be made only after delivery, autharized inspection, and
acceptance. Payment will be made only to the successul bicder uniess
otheraie requested in wrting by the successful bidder and accapted by
Miani Dade Courty Public Schools Admiristration. When bidders are
directed to send imoices to a school, the school will make dired payment to
the hidder.

N0 GRATUITY POLICY.

His the poicy ofthe Bureau of Procuremert and Materals Managemert not
1o accept gifts, grafuties, or favors of any Kind, or of any valie whatsoeser,
o vendors, members of their staffs, orfamiies.

GOMPLIANCE WITH FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A Al cortrads invdyving Federd funds wil confain cettain provisions maguired
hy appicable sections of Title 34, Section 80.360) and Section 85.510 Code of
Federal Reguiations and are incuded by reference herein. The vendor
certifies by signing the kid that the vendor and hisher principals are not
presently debaed, suspended, proposed for debarmert, daclamd inelighle or
voluntarily exduded from paticipation i Federally funded transactions and
may, h certain instances, be required to provide 2 sepaate writen certfication
tothk effedt,

Durng the term o any cortract with the Board, in the event of debament,
suspension, proposed debament, dedared inelighle or volntarly exduded
from paticpaton in Fedsraly funded transactions, the wvendor shall
immedatay notify the Associate Superitendent, Bueau of Procurement and
Materials Management, in vutting.

Vendors will also be e quired to provide accessto ecomds which are diectly
pethent tothe confract and retab 2l required reconds for three years afterthe
grantee [The Boar!], orsubgrartee makes fhal payment.

B. Foral conbracts hwokdng Federal funds in excess of $10,000, the Board
reserves the right to termhate the cortract for cause, as well as for
convenierce byissung a certfied ntice tothe vendor,

XUL ENSCRIMBLATION

An entty or affiiste nho has been plced oh the discriminatory vendor {st may
not submit a bid on a contract to provide goods or Senicesto a public entty,
may nat submit 3 bid on a contract with 2 public entty forthe constuction or
repair of a public building or public work, may not submit bids on leases of real
propetty to a public entty, may not anard or pedom work 3 a cortractor,
supplier, subcortractor, of consulant unter cortract with any publc entity, and
may rot ransact busiress with any publc entity.

Revised Febnory 200




vL

.

vaL

ADDITIONAL INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS FOR FOOD BIDS

PREPARRG OF BIDS

A BIDDERS RESPONSIBILITY. Each bidder shal carefully exadmrine the
Irstucions to Bickers, specifications, Special Comditions Isted andthe nurber
of schools to be served, 1t shall be the responsibility of the bidder to be fuly
informed a3 te the number and widespread locations of school. This wil be of
vial importance to assure the required schedule deliveres anive o ime.

AUARDS

A BASIS FOR AWARDS. The awards of all items oh this bid will made on the
basis of low bid meeting spedfications, when the portion cost is within the
acceptable cost range as detenmined bythe Depatment of Food and Nutrition.

Saard of Hems using USDR DF Commodiy are made condibonal to the
successiul wendor submitting a curvent copy of either the cormmodity processhg
cotract approved by the State of FlbrdaHRS or Mationat Cormodity
Processing, or a curent copy of the sighed aymement of their proposed
contract that has been submitted and is pending apsroval.

B ANARD OF FOREAGN PRODUGCTS. Htenws andbr products gown,
produced and processed inthe United States or s tenilories wilt be consideted
for avend pumoses. Metal cans must be wekied to insure no lead is uilized.
Cans must be soldered. Foreign producs wil rot be considered if 2 domestic
supply is avallable. If product is not avdlakle as prodiced ik the US.A, all
foreign products must be submited as an altemate and country of origin must
he specfied. Al wholesomeness as vel # grades and origins nust be
nated oh gade cerdificates.

Ali products of foreign origh accegted on the kid nust have a pesticide anahsis
from a certfied US. lab o Commodiy Scientific Support Division [CS8D). If
any pesticide residue is in excess of USDA or FDA recommendation, the
procuct wil not be corsidered acceptable. The pesticide andysis must
accorrpary the grade osrtificate and rust cover alt stipments.

NEW FOOD TEMSIBRANDS. Suppliers wishing to have newfood items or
new brands of existing food fems approved for inclusion on our next bid nust
contact the helow named for informetion conceming the submittal of sanples:
Depariment of Food ard Nurition ¢ Planning and Production Coorinator,
704 lest Flager Sreet, hiam, P 33144, Telephcne: (305 995-3230.

USAGE REPORTS. The successful vendois) shall submit a morthly usage
repat iisting the total delivery quantiies for each item defivered to each school
location and a surrmary of manthiytotals. This usage report must be subnitted
by the terth day of the following mortti, This report shall be directed fo: The
Department of Food ard Ndrition ¢ Planring and Production Coordinator,
704 West Flager Street, Miami, FL 33144,

INSURMICE REQUIREMENTS. Successful sendor(s) are required to have
coverage as specified i the indernity and insurance form.  The successhul
venderfs) rust submi completed certficates o insurence fors within 15 days
fiom neification of avard.

USDA CERTIAC ATION DOCUMENT. Each wendor is required to complate
and subnit with the bid the U.S. Depattrent o Agricutture Certification fom AD-
1043 contzined herein. Failire to o so mey resut in the vendor kid rot behy
cehsideres for anard.  Avsrds exceedng $25,000 will not be made to wndos
nho have not subrritted this fom for each speciic bid.

RUTRIENT DAT A SUBMISSION FORM. Successtul vendors are requested to
complete and subrmit a nutrient data submission form to assistin the wethering
of rutrient informetion.  Copies of nutrient dota submission forms are included
for venedor informstion.

DELWERY AND BILLING

A DELVERY. Satulays, Surdays, and holidays excepted, delveries shal be
made as follows: Schods and Depariments - 8:00 AM. to 300 PM.
Merchandise shadl be unloaded at the receiving siatioh of the designated
delfvery point antt receivad there by a designated agent of the Boand. A delivery
ticket, or one copy of the inwice, prepared as indicated below, shal accompany
each delivery.

B. DEUYERED PRODUCTS. All produds deltvered shall be identical to the
sampies submitted for evauation, and as anarded to successfl wendors.

G UNAUTHORIZED DEUIVERES. The successhil wendors) will net be
authorized to sell andior delver any item nd Isted in this big. Unauthotized
deliveries may resulf in non-payment of inwices.

D. SUBGONTRACTMNG DELMERY. The successiul \endon(s) may not be
penritted fo subcortract for the delvery of any item listed in the anenis(s)
unless stipulated in vuithg at the time of bid submission, at no additional cost
to the purchaser. In such instences, peformence msponsbilty rests
completely uith the vendor(s) fawentees).

THE BOARD My RE)ICT ANV BID FOR FAILURE By THE SDDER 1D COMPLY UIITH ANy

REQUIREMENT STUTED AJOVE, INTHE B ID PROROSAL FORM OR INATTIC HUBNTS THERETD
LJHIC HB ECOMES RARTOF THEB DL

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAM D ADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

SUPERINTENDENT OF 8CHOO0LS

Revised Febnary 20M
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CONSIDERED
M1-1/00

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE '

In consideration of this Contract, if awarded, the Vendor agrees without reservation to the indemnification
and insurance clauses contained herein. These clauses are attached to and form a part of Bid# 150-GC01

|

|

INDEMNIFICATI |
|

|

The Vendor shall hold harmless, indemnify and defend the indemnitees (as hereinafter defined) against

any claim, action, loss, damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including,

but not by way of limitation, attorneys' faes and court costs arising out of bodily injury to persons including

death, or damage to tangible property arising out of or incidental to the performance of this Contract '
(including goods and services provided thereto) by or on behalf of the Vendor, whether or not due to or

caused in part by the negligence or ather cuipablity of the indemnitee, excluding only the sole negligence

or culpability of the indemnitee. The following shall be deemed to be indemnitses: The School Board of s
Miami-Dade County, Florida and its members, officers and employees. i

INSURANCE

Prior to being recommended for award, ihe Vendor has five business days after notification to submit proof

of Insurance as required herein. Failure to submit a fully completed, ariginal certificate of insurance signad

by an authorized representative of the insurer providing such insurance coverages may cause the Vendor '
10 be considered non-responsive and not eligible for award of the Contract. The insurance coverages and

limits shall meet, at a minimum, the following requirements:

Commercial General Liability Insurance inan amount not less than $500,000 combined
single limit per oceurrence for bodily injury and property damage.

Automobile Liability Insurance covering all owned, non-owned and hired vehicles used
in connection with the operations of the Vendor, In an amount not less than $1,000,000 )
combined single limit per occurrence for bodily injuty and property damage.

Workers' Compensation Insurance for all employees of the Vendor as required by
Florida Statutes.

“ The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its members, officers and employees”
shall be an additional insured on all liability coverages except Workers' Compensation
Insurance.

The insurance coverage required shall include those classifications, as listed in standard liability
insurance manuals, which most nearly reflect the operations of the Vendor.

All insurance palicies shall be issued by companies with either of the following qualifications: |
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()  The company must be (1) authorized by subsisting certificates of authority by the Department of
Insurance of the Stats of Florida or (2) an eligible surplus lines insurer under Florida Statutes. In
addition, the insurer must have a Best's Rating of "B+" or better and a Financial Size Category of
"IV" or better according to the latest edition of Best's Key Rating Guide, published by A.M. Best
Company.

or

(b)  with respect only to the Workers' Compensation insurance, the company must be (1) authorized
as a group self-Insurer pursuant to Florida Statutes or (2) authorized as a commercial self-
insurance fund pursuant to Florida Statuies.

Neither approval nor failure to disapprove the insurancs furnished by the Vendor to the School Board shall
relieve the Vendor of the Vendor's full responsibility to provide insurance as required by this Contract.

The Vendor shall be responsible for assuring that the insurance remains in force for the duration of the
contractual period; including any and all option years that may be granted to the Vendor. The certificate
of insurance shall contain the provision that the School Board be given no less than thirty (30) days writtan
notice of cancellation. If the insurance is scheduled to expire during the contractual period, the Vendor
shall be responsible for submitting new or renewed certificates of insurance fo the School Board at a
minimum of fifteen (15) calendar days in advance of such expiration.

Unless otherwise notified, the certificate of insurance shall be delivered to:

Miami-Dade County Pubiic Schools
Office of Risk and Benefits Management
1800 Biscayne Boulevard, Suite 127
Miami, Florida 33132

The name and address of Miami-Dade County Public Schools, as shown directly above, must be the
Certificate Holder on the certificate of insurance.

The Vendor may be in default of this Contract for failure to maintain the insurance as required by this
Contract. Any questions regarding these requirements should be directed to Ms. La-Chane Clark at 305-
985-7133.

3,73




Vendor Information Sheet

1A _ - _ ___ 2. Telephone/Fax/Contact Person
Federal Employer Identification Number ( )
Telephone number
Or_ _ _-_ _=-____
Owner's Social Security Number ( )
18 Fax number

Name of Firm, Individual(s), Partners or Corporation

Contact Parson

Street Address

City State Zip Code E-mail address
3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with & corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship,or joint venture, the full
legal name and business address shall be provided for each officer, director, and stockholder or owner wha holds,
directly or indirectly five percent (5%) or more of the stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with
a trust, the full legal name and address shall be provided for each trustee and each beneficiary. Post Office

addresses are not acceptable.

e
Race-
Name Title Address Gender |ethnicity  |Stock Ownership

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided on the "Vendor's
Application”. All vendors must have a current vendor's application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided
information and/or be familiar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: (a) Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free
Workplace, (¢} Family Leave Policy, (d) Code of Business Ethics, (e) Conflict of Interest, {f) Perception, (9)
Gratuities, and (h) Business Meals. Failure to provide M-DCPS a current vendor application may cause the vendor

not to be awarded any new business with M-DCPS. Vendor applications can be downloaded at: deps.dade.k12.fl.us
{click District Offices - click Procurement Management).




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

150-CCO1 Linda Leasburg-Kramer SC1
TITLE

Delivery of Testing Materials

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract, at firm unit prices, for the purchase of estimated
requirements, for the items listed, for Stores and Mail Distribution (S&D) and the Test Distribution Center (TDC). The
term of the bid shali be for eighteen (18) months from date of award, and may, by mutual agreement between The
School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and the awardee, upon final School Board approval, be renewable for two
(2) additional one (1) year periods and, if needed, ninety (90) days beyond the expiration date of the current contract
period. The Board, through Procurement Management Services, may, if considering to renew, request a letter of intent
to renew from the awardee, prior to the end of the current contract period. The awardee will be notified when the
recommendation has been acted upon by the Board. All prices shall be firm for the term of the contract. The
successful vendor agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

PRE-BID CONFERENCE: A Pre-Bid Conference will be held June 16, 2003 in Conference Room 105, OIT, 13135 S.W.
26 Street, Miami, FL at 9:30 AM. Pre-Bid Conference attendance by the bidder or his qualified representative is highly
recommended.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES: The estimated quantities provided in the bid proposal are for bidder's guidance only. No
guarantee is expressed or implied, as to quantities that will be used during the contract period. The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida is not obligated to place an order for any given amount, subsequent to the award of this
bid. Estimates are based upon Miami-Dade County Public Schools (MDCPS) actual needs and usage during a previous
twelve {12) month period, and include an additional ten percent to cover unanticipated increases in requirements.

PRICES: A firm price for each item is required. Adjustments to bid prices will only be allowed for drastic (greater than
50%) changes in fuel cost. Supporting documentation justifying a price adjustment must be submitted in writing for
approval to Procurement Management Serivces.

DELIVERIES: Pickup and delivery will include the TDC and testing locations (i.e. schools or region offices), and shall
be completed in accordance with the schedule attached to or included on the purchase order, which will be coordinated
through S&D. The successful vendor may be required to deliver or pick-up testing materials with less than 48 hours
notice. All pickup and delivery locations will be in Miami-Dade County.

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS: The successful vendor is required to have insurance coverage, as specified in the
indemnity and insurance form(s), attached hereto and made a part of this bid. The successful vendor must submit
completed certificate of insurance form(s), prior to being recommended for award. Failure to submit this form(s), as
noted, will result in the vendor not being recommended for the bid award.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

150-CCO1 Linda Leashurg-Kramer SC2
TITLE

Delivery of Testing Materials

10.

1.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

INSPECTION OF FACILITIES: Procurement Management Services may require the bidder to make their facilities
available for inspections, or may require additional information conceming the bidder's ability to perform this contract.
Failure to supply any such additional information or to make their facilities available for inspection within five (5) days
from request will result in the bidder not being considered for award.

VEHICLE USAGE: The successful vendor must provide vehicles capable of delivering bulk quantifies using appropriate
delivery vans and/or trucks.

OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County’s Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 8A, Article X of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a focation outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their iocal Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested to be
submitted with the Bid Proposal. If the Bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not
required while the license is valid and in effect, It is the Bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license
after expiration or termination of the current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to
be considered for award.

VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: All bidders are encouraged to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct business under this contract, MDCPS  requires that the successful vendor(s) have a current vendor
application on file, The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may
cause the vendor(s) not to be awarded any new business. Vendor applications may be downloaded at
http://procurement.dadeschools.net

ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS: When filling out the Bid Proposal Form, bidders are required to use a typewriter or
complete bid proposal in ink.

1, Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an error.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that itemy(s).




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #150-CC01
Delivery of Testing Materials

BID PROFOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid #150-CC01

[Title: Delivery of Testing Materiais

Buyer: L. Leasburg-Kramer

PLEASE COMPLETE

ALL

"OF

SHADED AREAS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT

PRICE PER UNIT

@ purposes o S , one aay shall equal an
average of 8 hours and 75 miles within Miami-Dade
County. (Staffed with a minimum of one driver). Bidders
should closely review attached specifications with special
attention to 1.01, H, Security of Materials.

Daily Services:

1 [|Pick up and delivery of testing materials as required by
MDCPS Assessment Department as per the attached
specifications:

1A (IDeliveries made utilizing a van, doily and/or handcart and

driver.

30

Days

Deliveries made utilizing a vehicte-step van, dolly and/or
handcart and driver.

-

562

Days

1C |iDeliveries made utilizing a 20' delivery truck or larger, dofly

and/or handcart and driver.

Items 2 and 3 will be awarded to the successful vendor fo

552

Days

Hourly Services:

2 lIPrice per hour for same services as item #1. (To be used
when a full day is not required). :
2A BDeliveries made utilizing a van, dolly and/or handcart and 45 Hours |-
driver.
2B (IDeliveries made utilizing a vehicle-step van, dolly and/or 25 Hours f"? i SR 1
handcart and driver. [
2C (Deliveries made utilizing a 20" delivery truck or larger, dolly 25 Hours [
and/or handcart and driver. S
L L
3 |Price per mile in conjunction with item #2 only. (To be used :
when a full day is not required).
3A |IDeliveries made utilizing a van, dolly and/or handcart and 200 Miles
driver.
3B lDeliveries made utilizing a vehicie-step van, dolly and/or 400 Miles
handcart and driver.
3C Deliveries made utilizing a 20' delivery truck or larger, dolly 400 Mites
and/or handcart and driver,
Page 1
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PART 1

1.

1.01

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS

PURPOSE

PURPOSE:

A.

The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract for the delivery of
testing materials as required by Miami-Dade County Public Schools
(MDCPS). Vendors should be capable of loading, delivery,
unloading of test materials and providing inside delivery to sites as
specified.

GENERAL

A.

Scope |

Vendor shall furnish all labor, supervision, equipment,
transportation and materials necessary to pick up and deliver
testing materials to muitiple sites as scheduled by the Test
Distribution Center (TDC). The vendor should make every attempt
to thoroughly examine and be familiar with all the specifications
herein. Failure to address the logistics of completing the
specifications of this bid will not entitle the vendor to additional
compensation.

Work Day

The normal hours for MDCPS are between 7:30 AM and 4:00 PM,
Monday through Friday. Access to facilities will be available as
follows:

TDC 7:30 AM to 4:00 PM

Elementary Facilities 8:00 AM to 3:00 PM

Middle School Facilities  9:00 AM to 4:00 PM

Senior High Facilities 7:30 AM to 2:00 PM

Notification of Commencement

MDCPS will make every attempt to provide a minimum of 48 hours
notice for delivery of testing materials. TDC will notify the vendor
via phone, facsimile or email when materials are ready for pick up.
On an emergency basis, the successful vendor may be required to
pick up and deliver test materials with less than 48 hours notice. No
additional charge will be allowed for emergency deliveries.
Awarded vendor will be provided a list of facility names, addresses,
contact names and phone numbers.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS

Vehicle Requirement

Vendor must have the ability to provide sufficient vehicles with
drivers and appropriate equipment on any single day requested.
Vehicle requirements will be determined upon receipt of goods from
the State of Florida, the State of Fiorida’s testing vendor(s) and/or
other sources of testing materials. Vehicle types will be those
needed to accommodate deliveries for that day and will be
reviewed by TDC or S&D with the successful vendor.

School Locations

The vendor must be familiar with Miami-Dade County road system
and geography. Schools are located throughout the county and the
bid requires prompt delivery to all locations of highly time sensitive
materials.

Proof of Delivery

Drivers must obtain district or school authorized signatures and
employee numbers upon each pick up and delivery. Each
authorized signature, name and employee number must be
readable and clearly written on the vendors receiving ticket. A
sample ticket is attached as a vendors guide.

Delivery of Materials

Pick up and delivery sites will include the TDC and testing locations
(i.e. schools or region offices). Current listing of facility addresses is
available at http://www.dadeschools.net/schools/index.htm.

The TDC is located at 13135 S.W. 26th Street Miami,

Florida 33175.

Vendor will be required to load runs without assistance from District
personnel. Vendor's personnel should be capable of lifting 50
pounds. Hand trucks and other equipment needed to complete
tasks must be provided by the vendor. Deliveries to sites shall be
defined as inside deliveries. Vendor’s personnel shall be able to
complete an inside delivery without assistance from District
personnel.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS

Awarded vendor will be required to notify schools by phone of the
next days run to insure school staff are available and prepared to
accept deliveries or pick ups.

Security of Materials

Test materials including all test response sheets, test booklets and
other materials containing secure test questions shall be kept
secure and accounted for, as per District procedures and State
Statute 1008.24 Test Security. Vendors will be required to review
District procedures and applicable Florida State Statutes with all
personnel involved in the distribution of testing materials under this
contract. Records of such reviews should be maintained through
attendance logs and/or releases signed by employees
acknowledging receipt of information.

AT NO TIME SHALL TESTING MATERIALS BE LEFT
UNATTENDED OR IN UNLOCKED VEHICLES.

AT NO TIME DURING DISTRIBUTION SHALL TEST MATERIALS
BE MIXED WITH ANY OTHER PRODUCT FROM ANY OTHER
NON-MDCPS SOURCE.

S&D or TDC, as established by guidelines after award of bid, must
be notified via phone of any materials that have not been delivered
by the end of the workday. Arrangements for delivery back to TDC
or other appropriate facility, to be determined by S&D personnel,
will be made. A complete set of guidelines will be provided to the
awarded vendor for handling/securing materials.

1.02 VENDOR QUALIFICATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS

A

The vendor is required, and shall have the capability to
simultaneously perform all work herein at multiple locations
throughout Miami-Dade County during the normal workday as
indicated in 1.01B.




1.03

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS

Vendor shall assure that no use of any controlled substance
including alcohol shall occur on MDCPS premises as outlined in
Board rule 6GX13-4-1.05. A fine of $500.00 may be assessed for
the first time offense and termination of the contract for the second
time offense.

All personnel employed by the vendor, including any subcontractor
and subcontractor’s employees when applicable, shall display at all
times an identification badge which shall include the employees’
name, the employer’s name and either a physical description or a
photograph of the employee. Employees without proper
identification shall not be permitted to work on MDCPS property.

The vendor's employees, subcontractors and its employees, and
any other personnel engaged in any activities encompassed by this
term bid are strictly forbidden from participating in any manner and
form of interaction with students of MDCPS. Violation of this
provision shall resuit in removal of the individual(s) involved from
the school site, the project, and further, the vendor shall be
prohibited from employing the individual in any future work with
MDCPS performed under this term bid.

REQUIRED BID DOCUMENTATION

With the bid, the vendor is requested to submit the following
documents. ltems described in A. through D. are required prior to
recommendation of award.

Vendor is to submit three (3) letters of reference of similar work
performed within the past two years. References must include
name, address, contact person, phone and fax number and length
of contract, in order to verify satisfactory performance.

Copy of Occupational License.

Insurance: Additionally, the successful vendor is required to have
insurance coverage as noted in the Special Conditions

Prior to award, the recommended vendor will be required to provide
verification that all drivers have current and valid Florida Drivers
Licenses and insurance.




1.04

1.05

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS

BILLING
All invoices shall be forwarded as follows:
1. The original invoice shall be sent to:

Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Stores and Mail Distribution

Attn: Administrative Assistant

7001 S.W. 4" Street

Miami, FL 33034

2. The duplicate shall be sent to:

School Board of Miami-Dade County
School Board Administration Building
Accounts Payable, Room 602

1450 N.E. 2™ Avenue

Miami, FL 33132

Invoice must include;

Run number

Number of Cartons/Envelopes delivered

Signed Run Tickets, including employee’s name, number
and signature.

Invoices received without this information will be returned to the
vendor for resubmission

FUEL ADJUSTMENT

Adjustments to bid prices will only be allowed for drastic (greater
than 50%) changes in fuel cost. Supporting documentation
justifying a price adjustment must be submitted in writing for
approval to Procurement Management. Documentation should
include copies of fuel receipts from the last 6 months supporting
this request.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS

1.06 MDCPS RESERVES THE RIGHT:

1.07

A. To terminate this contract or any portion(s) thereof, upon
thirty (30) days written notice to the vendor due to
nonperformance and/or default of any part of this contract.

B. In the event of the vendor’s failure or neglect to perform
properly and diligently in an acceptable manner and in
compliance with this contract, MDCPS shall notify the vendor
in writing, listing the specific deliveries to be performed and a
specified time frame for completion. If the deliveries are not
performed within the time specified in an acceptable manner,
MDCPS may, after written notice to the vendor of the default,
accomplish the required deliveries by any method MDCPS
deems necessary. The cost thereof will be deducted from
the contract price and may become due from the vendor to
MDCPS; and/or, at MDCPS option, MDCPS may declare the
entire contract terminated.

C. To cancel, without cause, any work, or any portion of the
work awarded under this contract, or to cancel this contract

in its entirety, upon thirty (30) days written notice to the
vendor.

NON-EXCLUSIVITY

MDCPS reserves the right to perform, or cause to be performed,
the work and services herein described in any manner it sees fit,
including, but not limited to, performing the work with its own
employees.




DELIVERIES MADE FOR TESTING
JUNE 2002 - JUNE 2003

Delivery | days | stops | boxes or Activity
dates used envelopes
6/25 — 6/26 2 55 80 boxes Deliver HSCT & FCAT test
9/16 - 9/19 4 120 | 720 boxes Deliver September SRI test & FCAT calculators
52 envelopes
9/23 -9/24 2 35 131 boxes Deliver HSCT & FCAT manuals
9/23 - 10/11 15 344 | 2,894 boxes Deliver FCAT practice test
10/2 — 10/3 2 55 301 boxes Deliver HSCT & FCAT Math test
10/9 — 10/10 2 55 347 boxes Deliver HSCT & FCAT Reading test
10/14 —-10/18 5 344 1,172 boxes Deliver FCAT CD’s, Parent Brochures & Visually Impaired
practice test
10/21 - 10/22 2 75 317 boxes Deliver Explore test
11/6 - 11/8 3 75 300 boxes Pick-up Explore test
1/7-1/8 2 43 57 boxes Deliver HSCT test
1/8-1/9 2 49 102 boxes Deliver FCAT Writing Assessment Field Test
1721 - 1729 7 344 2,853 boxes Deliver Writing A. FCAT manuals, Keys. Assessment Result
372 envelopes | Books, Round 2 reports, Parent Letters & Writing A. reports
1/29-2/3 4 344 708 boxes Deliver FCAT Writing Assessment test
1/29 - 2/28 23 344 10,570 boxes Deliver FCAT test
2/14 1 5 350 boxes Pick-up FCAT Writing Assessment from Access Centers
2/18~2/21 4 226 | 327 boxes Deliver Stanford-9 test
224 envelopes
2119 - 2/25 5 344 2,961 boxes Deliver FCAT R/M/S manuals, Visually Impaired test,
468 envelopes | Accounting for All, pregrid labels & K — 12 brochures
3/3--3/4 2 34 35 boxes Deliver HSCT test
319 328 8 328 | 7,567 boxes Pick-up dead FCAT test
3125 1 5 250 boxes Pick-up Stanford-9 test from Access Centers
4/17 — 4/23 5 344 1,469 boxes Deliver SRI test
86 envelopes
5/6 —5/7 2 344 571 boxes Deliver Writing Assessment & grades 3 & 12 FCAT results
28 envelopes
5/12-5/16 5 301 1,480 boxes Pick-up dead SRI test & FCAT calculators
5/27-6/3 6 344 2,464 boxes Deliver FCAT results & Florida Writes!
6/24 — 6/25 2 55 535 boxes Deliver HSCT/FCAT test & calculators

e 116 days to deliver testing material
¢ 4,632 school locations/stops to deliver test material
38,561 boxes and 1,230 envelopes of delivered test material
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FROM: AFFIX

POSTAGE
HERE

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BUREAU OF PROCUREMENT AND MATERIALS MANAGEMENT

| ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX

| 1450 N.E. 2"° AVENUE

| MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

| BID NO.: 150-CC01

BID TITLE: DELIVERY OF TESTING MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE:




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Bureau of Procurement and Materials Management

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID

If not submitting a bid at this time, for nformational purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the information requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail, NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Our company does not handle this type of product/service.
We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an aiternate equal product.

Our company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
OTHER, (Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

Signature
Title
Company

NOTE:

Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may result in
~ your company being removed from the School Board’s bid list. To qualify as a
respondent to the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID.




