Py THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

i - SCHOCL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING
! 1450 Northeast Second Avenue
e ——— Miami, FL 33132
e Direct all inquiries to Procurement Management
Sarvices:
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM BUYER NAME:
BID NO. 135-EE06 G. Jackson

E-MAIL ADDRESS: giackson@dadeschoois.net
PHONE: (305) 995-2345
Fax NUMBER 305-523-2214

TOD PHONE {305) 995-2400

Bids will be accepted untit 2:00 PM on ___February 28, 2006 in room 351, School Board Administration building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue, Miami, FL., 33132, at which time they will be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for __ 120 days after opening.
{Refer to Instructions to Bidders, para. IV.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BIiD BY THE SCHOOL BOARD OF
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL
CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BID DOCUMENTS, NO
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED.

L A BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corperation, firm, or
person submitling a bid for the same materials, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collusion
or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and 1 certify hat i am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder,

8ID TITLE Pest Control Supplies

B. Vendor certifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.
I INDEMNIFICATICN

The Bidder shall hold harmiess, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hersinafter defined) against any claim, action, loss,
damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation, attomey's fees and
court costs arising out of bodily injury to persons, including death, or damageé to tangible property arising out of or incidentat to
the performance of this Cantract (including goods and services provided thereta) by or on behalf of the Bidder, whether or not
due 1o or caused in part by the negligence or other culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sole nagligence or culpability
of the indemnity. The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its
members, officars and employees.
.  PERFORMANCE SECURITY, is required onthisbid.  YES ___} NO

Refer to INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. VI, and V.
IF PERFORMANCE SECURITY IS REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Performance Bond L-.j Check (Cashier's, Cerlified, or equal) D

An original, manual signature is required on the Bidder Qualification Form.
(Bidder is requested to use blue ink)
{Do not use pencil}

Legal Name of Vendor
Mailing Address
City State
Telephone No. E-mail address

By: Signature (Original)

Of Authorized Representative
Name (Yyped or Printed)

Of Authorized Representative

FM-3191 Rev. (01-04)




INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

NGQTICE OF ESTABLUSHMENT OF A CONE OF SILENCE

The School Board of Mismi-Dads County Public schools enacts a Gonte
from issuance of a solicitation to written recommendation of
awad, All provisions of School Board Rule 6Gx13-8C-1, 212 apply.

1 PREPARATION OF BIOS

A BIDDER GUALIFICATION FORM qualifies the biddar and the
bid and must ba compleled and submitted as page 1 of the bid,

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY. The foam o performance
secuyrity the bidder will submit, when required to do 30, fmust ba
furnished, Perfamance security shall not be submittad with the bid,

2, BIODER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. Bid must
contain an onrginal manual signatwe from an  authorized
reprosontatve. An unsigned bid will be considerad non-responsive.

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines conditicns of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any inconsistency in this bid shall
be roscived by giving precedence in the follawing order:

A. Specifications
B. Special Conditions
C. Instuctions To Bidders

2. FOR M/WBE designatsd bids. The SPECIAL CONDITIONS-
Minority/Women ownod and controlled Businass Partcipation
Statemant and the MWBE Certffication Applicaion MUST be
complelad and SUBMITTED with the bid if the bidder ks net certfied
by Miasmi-Dade County Public Schools. Fallure (0 submit the
campleled spplicaton with the bid wil be considwed non-
respontive,

€. BID PROPOSAL FORM. Defines requirement o ilemns to be
purchasad, anc must be completed and submitted as page 2 and
subsequent pages, if any, of the bid. The bidder should indicale
hiz/her name in the approprisie space on each page.

1. ITEM SPECIFICATION, Specifying 8 cerlain brand, make or
manufecturer is to dencte the quality, lype, and slanderd of the
article desired. Articles offsred must be new merchandize only, of
aqual or superior grade. On blank fines proavided, the bidder is
cauestad o insert the brand nams, manufacirers number and
other informalion necesasary lo sufficienty identfy aticle offered.
Failure to do 30 may prevent conzideration of the item. Also, reler
to paragtaph X, Packaging.

Z. PRICES. Prices are requestod in units of quantily specified In
the bid specificalions. In case of & discrepancy in computing the
talal smount of bid, UNIT PRICE quolted will govern. All prces bid
shall Include delivery F.Q.B. destination, freight prepaid {bidder
pays and beacs freight charges, Bidder owns goods in Pansit and
f3ms any claims} and shall include wil cartage, drayage, packing,
olc., deliverad to and unicadad at the receiving station st the site
designated in B!ID PROPOSAL FORMS and there received by the
designatod agent of the Bowrd.

A TAXES. The Board doss not pay Fedeai Excise and State
taxss on direct purchases of tangible parsonal property. The
mpplicable tax exampion number is shown on the purchass order,
This sxemplion doas not apply to purchases of tangible personal
propety mads by conTacters who use the tangible personal
property in the performance of contracts for the improvemant of
Boad-ownad real property as defined in Chapter 192 of the Florida
Stetutes,

1. SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A. BID FORMS AND ENVELOPES. Sids must be submitted on
forms furnishod by the Doard and in sesied snvelopes.

Envelopes musi be clearly marked with bid number, bid e and bid
apening.

nt

B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When filing out the bid
proposal form, biddars are requicsd to complete bid proposal in Ink,

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not ermse ar use corecton fluid to comect s wror,
3. A%t changes must be crossed out and intialed in ink,

Those bids for individual items thatl do not comply with itema 1, 2
and 3 abova will ba considerad nonesponsive for that item(s),

¢. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids shall be submittad by U S,
Ma, Courne/Express Sarvice, o deposited in the BID BOX
located in Room 351, 8:00 AM. to 430 P.M., Monday through
Friday, SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 1450
N.E. Second Avenus, Miami, Florida 33132, Bids roceived after
the date and hour specified in the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM
will not ba considerad.

D. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Section 287.133(2)(e) Florida
Statute. A person or alfiiate who has bean placed on the convicted
vendor Ust following a conviction for a public enlity crime may not
submit & bid an a conract la provide any goods or services {0 &
public andty, may not submil & bid on a contract with & public eniity
for the consiruction or repair of a public building or public work, may
not submit Dids on leases of real property to a public enlity, may not
be awarded or peform wok as 8 coobracion supplie,
subcontracior, or conaultant under a contrat with any public entity,
and may not Tansact businsas with any public enlity in excess of
the threshold amount provided in Section 287.017, for CATEGORY
TWO for a period of 36 months from the date of being placed on the
convicted vendor Ssl.

E. SUBMITTING A “NO BID.” If not submitting a bid at this time,
return the form entited “NOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS.”
Failure to respond, sithee by submitting a bid or the “NOTICE TO
PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS® frm for thrse conseculiva times, may
result in the company being removed from the Schonl Poad's bid
st

F. AVAILABILITY OF BLD INFORMATION, immediately followirg
the public oponing, bids will be read, upon request, and then
compiled in a tabular form, & copy of which will be available for
sxamination in. Procurament Management Services.

CANCELLATION OF BIDS OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

An invitation for bids may ba canceled, in whole o in part, as may
be spacified in the solicitation, when it is in the best lnterest of the
Board. Tha teasons shall be made a part of the master bid e,

A, Prior to opening, a solicitalion may be canceled In whols of In
part, prior lo the dale and hour specified in the Bidder Qualific slion
Farm for receipt of bids, when the Assistant Superintendent,
Procwrement Management Services, determines in writing, that
such action is In the beslintereal o the Board for reasons including,
but not Emited to:

1. The Board no longer requires the supplies, services, o
construction;

2. The Boad no longer can reasonably expect to fund the
proculsment;

3, A review of a valid protest filed by a biddar as may be
determined by the adminisirative stall, or

4. Proposed amendments to the solicitation would be of auch
magnityde that & new solcilation is dosirable.

B. Whan » solicitatlon iz canceled prior lo opening, notice of
canceifation shall be senl (o all businesses soliciied, via facsimile o
mail, and bids or proposals relurned to the vendor uncpened.

The notice of cancellation shall;

1. Identify the solicitation;

2. Briolly axplsin the rezson for cancsllation; and

3. Whare sppropriste, wxplain that an appoctunity wild be given 1o
compete on any futurs re-solicitation for procurements of simitar
supplies, services, of construction.




IV, CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL OF BIOS

A PRIOR TO BID OPENING. Should the bidder desire to
change of withdraw hisher bid, ha/she shal do 50 In witing, This
comsvwnication b 1 be racelved by the Distict Director, of
Procurefmant  Managemant, Room 352, School Board
Adminlstration Bulding, prior to date snd hour of bid cpaning. The
biddars nama, the bid number, the bid title avd the date the bid b
dus st sppsar on the wwelcpe,

B. AFTER BID OPENING. After bids are opaned, they may not be
changed, nor withdrawn, for 90 daye after the delermined opening

date, unless otherwiss specified on the "BIDDER QUALIFICATION
FORM."

C. FAILURE TO ACCEPT BiD AWARD. Bidders who, prior to e
€d Award by The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Flodda,
indicats that they are unable 1o accepl e bid award shatl sither:

1. Pay to the Board, as liquidated damages, an amount equal
o 5% of the unit price bld, tinws the quaniity. or $10, whichever
amnount & langer, or

2. Lose aligibility to ransact new businass with the Board ko a
period of 14 months from the date the Bowd acts on the
withdrawn bid.

PROTESTS TO CONTRALT SOUCITATION OR AWARD

A, The Board shall provide notice of a decision or intended
decision contceming a solicilation, conlract sward, of sxceplional
purchase by elactronic posting which can be sccwsed at the
disirict’s wabsite www dadaschoota nat.

B. Any person who is sdveraely affected by he agency decision or
intended deciszion shall file with the agency & notice of protast in
writing within 72 hours alter the poating of the nolice of decision or
intended decision. Wil respect to 8 protest of the e,
oimditions, snd ipacifcations conlained in a solicitalion, including
any provisions governing the methods of ranking bids, propasals, or
replias, awarding contracts, reserving rights of furthw negotiation,
or modifying or amending any contract, the notice of protest shall
be fled in writing within 72 hours aflar the pasting of the salicitation,
Tha forrrml written protest shell be fied within 10 deys after the dale
the notice of protest is fied. Fallure to fis » notice of prolestor a
formal  writen protasi zhall consttute s waiver of these
procesdings. Tha formal written protast shall staie with particularity
the fects and law upon which the prolast s based. Saturdays,
Sundays. and siate holdays shall be exzluded in the computation
of the 72-hour Nrm pariods sstablishad harein,

"€, Al notce of protests wil be reviewed by Procurement

Management Sorvices, who wil offer the protesting bidder the
epporiunily (o mesl and discuss the merits of the protest. Il the
protast is not reacived, the bidde:r may seek an administrative
hasdng pursuant (0 §120.57 Fla. Stat, by Ming & formal written
protest within 40 days sher fling the notice o protast, Patitions for
haaring pursuant ©o §120.57 Fle. Stat, musibe fled in accordance
with School Board Rule 80x13- §C-1 064

AWARD3

A RESERVATION FOR REJECTION OR AWARD, The Board
reserves the right 10 reject sny or i bide, 10 wahve rreguisdties or
technicalities, and 10 request bids. The Board reserves the right
o avward on an Individual Rem baxis, any combination of Kems, tolsl
fow bid or, if an altenate bid is acceptad, on such tenTe as mre
speciiad for the sitarnata bid, whichever manner [s In the bast
interaxt of the Bowrd.

8. NOTIFICATION OF INTENDED ACTION wil be pastad on the

Ditrict's wabsits 7-10 days prior 10 2 regularly schaduled Board
mesting

€. OFFICIAL AWARD DATE. Awwrds bacome official upon the
Board's formal approval of the award,
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D. PURCHASE QRDERS. Purchmse orders mailed 1o succasshy
tidders are tis official nolification 1o deliver mateias described
terain; snd the fime sllowed lor defivery begine with tha date of
e puchase order. In the sveni that the successhul bidder fails so
deliver the matedals in sccordance with the s and conditiona of
e bid and purchasa order, the bidgder shall be considerad to be in
delault of the contract and subject ® the defaul provisions staled in
Instructions to Bidders, Section V1, E.

E DEFAULT. A vendor who fallx (o perform acconsing o the
tarms of the contact [bid) shall be considered in defsult In the
avent of defaull, which mary Inciude, but s not miled to poar
periormance and/of norrperfarmance, & vendor shall sither (1) pay
fquidated damagas of 10 percent of e unit price of the item{s)
awmded timas the quantity whan no purchase omder has baan
Bsuwd, 10 percant of the purchase order whan a puicthase o
hag bean issusd or 3100, whichever i greater or {2) lose algibility
1o b t new busi with the Board for & period of 14 months
from data of termination of sward by the Board, Bidders that are
determined ineligible may requesl 8 hearing pursuant 1o Chapter
120 of the Florids Statutes, and School Board Rule 6Gx13- G-
1064,

F. The intant of the bid decuments is 1o (nclude only the written
requirements for materials, equipment sysisve, standards and
workmanship necessary for the proper axecution and completion of
the work by the Bidder. The bid documants shall not be construed
1o create an enlilement o any olher scops of work axcept =
spacifiad herein.

YIL PERFORMANCE SECURITY (FOR SUCCESSFUNL. BIDDERS

ONLY)

A, PURPOSE. A performance bond or check may be required o
puarsnies performance.

B, BONDING COMPANY. Perfomancs Bonds shall be wrillen
through a reputable and responsible surety bond agency kcensed
to do business in the Stats of Florkia snd wilh 3 surely company or
carparation meeting beth of the following specifications:

1. Awnrdy Graster thap $300,000
A minitram rating In the lalast revision of Beals lraurance Reports
of:

¢ . Mii Rating by AM. B
$ 500,000.01 10 % 2,500,000 None
$2,500,000.01 to § 5.000.000 B +orNA2

No Minimum Cliks
$ 5,000,000.01 to $10,000,000 A-Clms IV
§10,000,000.01 or more A Class V

Curant certificate of suthority as accepiable surely on Federal
Bonds in accordance with the latest edition of he Uniled Stales
Traasury Depentment Cimcular 570 entitled *Companies Holding
Cartificstes of Authority &» Acceptable Surstims on Federst Bonds
and sz Acceplable Reinswring Companies” shall be accepted for an
amount not exceading the underwriting limitation thereon.

2 Awgrdy of 3300000 o1 Lasg

Bonds shall be written with a surety company of corporation
mesing the qusiifications as set forth in Paragtaph YIL.B. above or
ha quatfications set forth in section 2870935, Flarida Slatutas.

C. AMOUNT. When required a3 dafined herein, the bm or
individual(s} 1o whom an swaid has been made shall axecyls and
deliver (o The School Bosrd of Mlami- Dade County, Fionda, a
Pedormance Bond, Cashier's/Cectifled Check, or equal.

1. Awards s than $200.000 shall be w1 from part
sacurity,

2. Perforrmance security shall not be required, unioss ommi:_l
delined in the bid apecifications. Il pedormance sscufly @
required, & shal equal 100% of the award smount.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMANCE SECURITY. Retwn to hae
Awardes of hisher cath security, of notification to the Awardes and
the bonding company to canc ol the pecformance bond, will be made
when sl goods/services have basn accepiad and Invoices have
been approved for payment.

Revised Sept 2005




VIIL. SAMPLES

Wheet bid samples ars required, the buyer will notily bidder Lo
submil sarples of the jlemme bid in accordance with he following
procedures:

A All saples must be idantified with the bidders name, bid
nuimber, item number, and product name and numbar. Wiere nop-
compliance with this requicement is noted, seid item may be
considered as baing unidentfiable and fmay not be sigibie for
congderation in the sward recommendation.

B. Al samples afe 10 be delivered within 7 calendar days alter
receipt of nolificaion from buyer, uniess ctherwise statad in the
Special Condiions of the bid. if Ive bidder does nOl Jubmil
samplas by the dete snd ime indicated by e buysr, the bd
submitied for that item may not be considered for award,

€. Bidder must obtain, from Matediais Testng and Evaluation, a
signad receipt acknowledging defivery of samples. Bidder shall
include 8 seif-addtessad, stamped snvelops for retum of semple
reaceigt when submitting samplas by mail or delivery sarvice. The
biddar Wil raceive the oiginal copy of the receipt and the duplicate
copy will temain with the Miami-Dade County Public Schools
receiving department sx the fe copy. Bidder shall be solely
resporgible for delivery of sarples and for retsining zample
delivery receipts, which must be presented in any dizputs regarding
receipt of bid samples.

0. Samples shouid be delivered 1o the following address.

MLAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATICN
7040 West Flagiw Strest
Mismi, Florids 33144
Telsphone Numbar: 788-275-0780

Mismi-Oade County Pubic Schocis w'i nol ve responsible for
samples senl lo a location ather than the location mantioned in he
bid.

£ PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Soard wil buy no semples
and will as no cast incidentsl thereio.

F. RETURN OF SANMPLES. Sampias not dustroyed in Wesiing may
be claimed by I bidders 14 days after bid award date
and by successhl bidders 14 days afler final payment but the
Bosrd will asaume no rasponsibibity for samples nol chaimed within
the tme specified, snd it will pay for no samples dameged in
tasling.

Q. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS. If a sample submitted for

tealing doas not comply, The buyer will advise the bidder 1 contact
Matecials Tasting and Evaluation for urther detads,

SUBSTITUTIONS

Should e bidder find it necessary 1o use & matesial, squipment,
product of systam other than speciied, the bidder shall secire from
the Board, ¥wough Procuremnant Management Secvices, written
approval for the use of the altesnats melerials, squipirent, priduct
of sysiern, The Board & nol oblgsied © approve requasts for
subsintions and has the discretion o sequire the bidder to provide
the materisle ax apecified in the bid dosumants. in no case shal
the bidder be enited (o additions! tme and/or monsy wising out of
the Board's (alure 10 approve requests for subsituions.

PACKAGING

A. TYPE, i packaging # diffesent from that apacified, the bidder
mat note the manner and smounts i which paciaging is 1 be
made: otherwise the successiul bidder shall fumish packaging s»
spacified. Al packaging, wrapping and bundiing shall be adequate
1o Insure hat matedals will be recalvad n undamaged conditon.
The Board sssurmas no rsponsbiity for damages of any kind
Incured in wamit
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B CONTAINER ICENTIFICATION, The following idenghication
shall be prinied, stancled or legibly wrillen in a2 conspicuous
jocation on sach shipping container:

1. BID NUMBER AND/OR PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
2. VENDOR'S NAME AND/OR TRADEMARK

3. NAME(S) OF ITEM(S) CONTAINED

4. ITEM NUMBER(S) WITH QUANTITY(IES)

PURCHASES HY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

With the consent and agresment of the successiul bidder(s),
purchases may be mede under this bid by Miami Dade County,
Florida, snd othet governmental agencles o poitical subdivisions
within the Slate of Florda. Such purchases shal be governed by
the same terrre and conditons stated hersin, Thiz sgreament in no
way mesticis or Intarfeces with the rght of any State of Flaide
Agency or paktical subdivision 1o rebid any or all of thase tems.

XII. RECYCLING REQUIREMENTS

Miami-Dade County Putilic Schoolz suppoits recycling and
recormyrands the use of recycied products whers pasaible,
Vandors are requesiad to submit a leCor, along with thelr bid,
indicating whathe each 2em bid snd/or its packaging contains pre-
consumar or pash-consumme wasts, and if e product andior
packaging may be fecycled.

XIL ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCTS

Miami-Oade County Public Schools encourages the use of
snvironimentally safe products.

X1¥v. DEUVERY AND BILLING

A. DELIVERY. Saturdays. Sundays, and holdays excepled,
deliverias shall be made m follows: Schools and Departments -
8:00 AM. 10 3:00 P.M. Mechandizse shall be unicaces Jt e
receiving station of the desipgnated delivery point snd recelved
there by & designaled agent of the Board. A delivery tcket, or one
copy of the invoice, prepared as indicaled below, shall sccompany
sach delivery.

B. RECENING INSFECTION AND TESTING. Dalversd ilems
which do nat Fulfil al requirements wik be rejectsd. Rejacted
ltefma shali be removad and replaced promptly by the vendor, at
no cost {o the purchasef.

. INVOICES. Each Invoice shall be issusd by he swzeald
bidder and shal be submitted in DUPLICATE to the Accounts
Payable Seclion, P.O. Box 01-2570, Miami, Florida 33101. Tobe
considersd for paymanl each invoice must show the falicwing
Information, which appears on the Purchase Order,

1. Purchase Order Number

2. Nem Descriptions

3. Quanlite and Unils

4. Price Extensions

5. Total price of all Nems oninvoice

D. PAYMENT. Unlsas otherwise speciied by Miami-Dade County
Public Schools, payment wil be made cnly after delivery,
authorized inspection, and acceptance. Payment wil be made
only 1o the successful bidder. unless otherwise requesied, n
wriling. by the successful bidder and accepted by Miami-Dade
County Public Schools Administration, When bidders are dirncied
1o send invoices 10 & school, the school will maks direciad
paymenl to the bidder.

XV. NQOORATUITY POLICY
s the pokcy of Procurement Managemant Services ol 1o sccepl

gifts, gratulties, of favors of any kind, of of any value whatsosval,
fram vendars, membaers of their staffs, or families.

Revised Swpt 2005




XYL COMPLIANCE WITH STATE/FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A. Al contact invoiving Tederal funds will conlain certain
provisions required by applicable zections of Tite 34, Section
20.34{1) and Sacticn 85510 Code of Foderal Regulations and are
included by reference hacsin. The vendor certfies by signing the
bid hat tha vendor and his/her principais are not presantly
debarad, suspanded poaed (or debarmenl, declarad inaligible
or woluntarily nwludui from padicipation in {ederaly fundad
Fansactions and may, In catain instances, be required {0 provids
8 saparats wiittan cwtfication to this effect.

During the term of any con¥act with the Board, in the svent of
debarment, suspension, propesasd debarment, declared ineligitie
or voluntarily sccluded from participation in federaly funded
ransactions, the vendor shall immediaisly notify the Assizlani
Suparintandent. Procuremeni Managament Services, in willng.
Vendors will also be requirsd to provids access 1o racords, which
ara direcly partinent 1o the contract and retain s required records
for thraw yuara aftar the Board makes final paymant.

B. For afl congacts involving Federal funds in axcass of $10,000,
the Board reserves tha right 1o terminate the contract for cause. as
well s for convenianca, by Bsuing a certiied notice to the vendor.

XVIL COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

Bidders shall comply with all federal, state of Florfids and jocal

Laws appicable to it and the performance of ity cbligations under
this bid.

XVIIL. BACKGROUHND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS

in mcordance with he requirerrmnts of secons 101232,
1012.465, and 435.04, Flonda Stalutes [2004) & wall as with the
raquirements of HB 1877, The Jmsice Lumsiond Act {2008),
aflective September 1, 2005, Sidder agrees 1o ceriify under oath
and penalty of parjury by completing the aftached Swom
Statameni Pursuart to Sectnos 1012,32, 1012465, and 435,04,
Florda Statutes (2064) and HE 1877, Thw Jeasica Lunsford Act
(2005), which is incorporated fully herein by reference, that
Bidder and ali of its employess who provide or may provide
servicas under this Agresmant have completed all background

scraaning requirements ax outiined in the asbove-refersnced
atatutes.

Addtionally, Bidder agress that sach of its employses,
represantatives, agents, subcontrectors o suppiiers wha
are permited sccess on school grounds when glydents are

or who have
sccess o or conirol of school funds

screening requirements ax described In sections 101203
and 41504 Forida Statutes and further upon obfalning
lovel 2 clearsnce, must obtaln & required Board issusd
photo Kentification badge which shall be worn by the
Individuat st ali Umes whils on Board property when
shudenis are present

Bldder agraes to bear any and aif costs amociated with
acquirtng the required background screening - Including
any costs sssociated with fngerpriniing and oblaining the
required phato idenificalion badge. SBidder sgress to
reguire ail e alfected empicyees 10 sign & siatement, ax &
condition of smpioyment with RBidder In relalion lo

rormancs under this Agre t (idf), agreeing that the
omp!om wili ablde by the haretofore described background
soreening requirements, and alsc aQresing that Uw
empicyes will notify the Biddermployer of any arresi(s) or
conviction(s) of any offeise anymerated Inn w. 435,04, Florids
Statutan within 48 houwrs of Ity pcourrence,

Didder agreas to provide the Board with a list of all of I
amploysas who have compleled background screening as
requiret by the sboversiersnced statutes and who mest the
sRLrY requraments contained therein, Bidder agrees that &
has an ongolng duty o mailntain and update these [ty &8 New
emptoyess are hired and in the event that any previaoly
acreanad smployes [ails to meet the statutory standards, Bidder
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futher sgress to notfy the Boand immediately upon becoming
sware that one of s smploysas who was previously cetified as
comrpleting the background check and mesting the shabifory
standards is subssgquently wTested or convicted o any
diaqualifying olfenss. Fallure by Bidder lo notify the Board of
such armast or conviction within 48 hours of deing put on
notice and within § businsss days of the occrrence of &
qualifying wreal or conviction, shall consivte grounds for
Immediete termination of this Agresemeni{bid) by the Board,

Failure by Sidder to perform any of the dutes dascribed in this
saction shall constitute & material breach of the Agresment [bid}
and default enlifing the Board 1o vtilze the provisions of saction
V1. E of this bid =s well as sniifing the Board 1o tenminale the
Agreemantibid) imwrediataty with no further responsiblity for the
Board tv maks payment or perform any other dulies under this
Agreemant (bid).

XIX COMPLIANCE WITH SCHOOL CODE

Bidder agress to comply with all sections of the Florida K-20
Education Code, Title XLVUI, Florida Sutules as & presently
wists, and furthar a8 R may be amended from time 1 tima,
Further Bidder agrees that fallure to comply with the Florida K-20
Education Code shali constituts a malafial treach of this
Agresment (bid} and may resull in the termination of this
Agresmant (bid) by the Boand,

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMIDADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

8U ENT OF QOLS

Revised Sapl 2005




FROM: AFFIX

POSTAGE
HERE

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BUREAU OF PROCUREMENT AND MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2%0 AVENUE
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO.: 135-EE06

BID TITLE: Pest Control Supplies

BID OPENING DATE: February 28, 2006




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Bureau of Procurement and Materials Management

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID
it not submitting a bid at this time, for informational purpose only, detach this shest from the
bid documents, complete the infermation requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON{S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Our company does not handle this type of product/service.
Wa cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.

Qur company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
OTHER, {Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

Signature
Title

Company

NOTE: Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may resuitin

your company being removed from the Schoo) Board’'s bid list. Te qualify as a
respondent to the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID.



Vendor Information Sheet

1A. 2. Telephone/Fax/Contact Person
Federal Employer Identification Number
Or Telephone number
Cwners Social Security Number
1B. Fax number
Name of Firm, Individual(s). Partners or Corporalion
Contact Person
Street Address
City State Zip Code E-mail address

3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship.or joint venture, the full legal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director, or owner who holds, directly or indirectly the majority of the
stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with a trust, the full legal name and address shall be provided for

each trustee and each beneficiary. Post Office addresses are not acceptable.

Race-
Name Tilte Address Gender  |ethnicity Stock Ownership

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided on the "Vendor's
Application”. All vendors must have a current vendar's application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be
familiar with M-DCPS’ policy regarding the following: (a) Employment Disclosure, (b} Drug Free Workplace, (¢} Family Leave
Policy, (d) Code of Business Ethics, (e) Conflict of Interest, {f) Perception, (g) Gratuities, and (h) Business Meals. Eailuce to
provide M-DCPS a current vendor application may cause the vendor not to be awarded any new business with M-DCPS.

Vendor applications can be downloaded at: http:/procurement. dadeschools.net




Miami-Dade County Public Schools
SWORN STATEMENT - NEW CONTRACTS

ATTACHMENT _ A
SWORN STATEMENT PURSUANT TO SECTION 1012.465,
FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY
HB 1877, THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT

THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED AND SWORN TO IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY
PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICIAL AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

1.

Initials

This swom statement is submitted to The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fl

{Hereinafter “Board” or “School Board™) by

(Print individual’s name and title)

for
(Print Name of entity submitting sworn statement)

whose business address is

and its Federal Employer Identification Number (FEIN) s
. If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security

Number (SSN) of the individual signing this sworn statement and so indicate.

I, , am duly authorized to make this
(Print individual’s name and title)

sworn statement on behalfof

(Print Name of entity submitting sworn statement)

I understand that during the 2005 Legislative Session, House Bill 1877, The Jessica Lunsford
Act (hereinafter “The Act” or “Act”) was passed and approved by Governor Bush on May 2,
2005, with an effective date of September 1, 2005.

Pagel of 3
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10.

Initials

I understand that the Act amends the background screening requirements of section
1012.465, Florida Statutes (2004) for all non-instructional school district employees or
‘“contractual personnel” by requiring all non-instructional school district employees or
contractual personnel who are permitted access on school grounds when students are present
to undergo and pass “level 2 background screening,” and further I understand the Act defines
“contractual personnel” to include any vendor, individual, or entity under contract with the
Board.

T understand that pursuant to section [012.465, Florida Statutes as amended by the Act, non-
instructional school district employees or contractual personnel who are permitted access on
school grounds when students are present, who have direct contact with students or who

have access to or control of school funds must meet level 2 screening reguirements as
described in sections 1012.32 and 435.04, Florida Statutes.

I understand that as a (eg. a private bus
Type of entity

service contractor) all contractual personnel, as defined in section 1012.465, Florida

Statutes, must meet level 2 screening requirements as outlined in sections 1012.32

and 435.04, Florida Statutes in order to do business with The School Board of

Miami-Dade County, Florida.

I understand that “level 2 screening requirements,” as defined in sections 1012.32 and
435.04, Florida Statutes means that fingerprints of all contractual personnel must be obtained
and submitted to the Florida Department of Law Enforcement for state processing and to the
Federal Bureau of Investigation for federal processing.

I understand that the School Board will implement local procedures to comply with level 2
screening requirements, as defined in sections 1012.32 and 435.04. I understand that my
company must comply with these local procedures as they are developed.

I understand that any costs and fees associated with the required background screening will
be borne by my company.

[ understand that any personnel of the contractor found through fingerprint processing and
subsequent level 2 background screening to have been found guilty of, regardless of
adjudication, or entered a plea of nolo contendere or guilty io any offense outlined in Section
435.04, Florida Statutes (or any similar statute of another jurisdiction), shall not be permitted
to come onto school grounds or any leased premises where school-sponsored activities are
taking place when students are present, shall not be permitted direct contact with students,
and shall not be permitted to have access to school district funds.
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11.  Tunderstand that the failure of any of the company’s or iny affected personnel to meet level
2 screening standards as required by section 1012.465, Florida Statutes, may disqualify my
company from doing business with The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida.

12.  Ihereby certify that the foregoing statement is true and correct in relation to the company for
which I am submitting this sworn statement. I further certify that this statement is being
given knowingly and voluntarily by me on behalf of my company.

The company submitting this sworn statement agrees to be bound by the provisions of SECTIONS
1012.32, 1012.465, AND 435.04 OF THE FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY HB 1877,
THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT 2005.

ICERTIFY THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-
DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA ON BEHALF OF THE COMPANY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH
ONE (1) ABOVE BINDS THE COMPANY TO FULLY COMPLY WITH THE BACKGROUND
SCREENING REQUIREMENTS OF SECTIONS 1012.32, 1012.465, AND 435.04, FLORIDA
STATUTES.

(Signature)

Swom to and subscribed before me this day or , 20

Personally known

OR Produced Identification

Notary Public -State of

(Type of ldentification)
My commission expires

(Printed typed or stamped commissioned
name of notary public)
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TQ: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

135-EE06 G. Jackson SC1
TILE

Pest Control Supplies

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract at firm unit prices, for the purchase of estimated
requirements for the items listed. The term of the bid shall be for one year from the date of award, and may, by mutual
agreement between The School Board of Dade County, Florida and the awardee, upon final School Board approval, be
renewable for two (2) additional one (1} year period(s) and, if needed, 90 days beyond the expiration date of the current
contract period. The Board, through Procurement and Materials Management, may if considering to renew, request a
letter of intent 1o renew from the awardee, prior to the end of the cument contract period. The awardee will be notified
when the recommendation has been acted upon by the Board. All prices shall be firm for the term of the contract. The
Successful vendor{s) agrees fo this condition by signing its bid.

SPECIFICATIONS: If anitemis to be considered as an equal to the specified item, complete technical specifications,
together with illustrative materials providing brand name and model number of the item, are requested to accompany
bid. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the item not to be considered for award.

BRAND NAME OR EQUAL: The use of a manufacturer's brand name, trade name, or model is for reference purposes
only and should not be interpreted as a statement of preference. Bids will be accepted on these and comparable
products, provided the quality of the proposed products meet or exceed the quality of the products listed.

AWARD: In the bestinterest of the Board, the bid will be awarded to the best responsive, responsible bidder offering
the lowest price.

DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made as soon as possible, but not later than 30 days after receipt of the purchase
order.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES: The estimated quantities provided in the bid proposal are for bidder's guidance only. No
guarantee is expressed or implied, as to quantities that will be used during the contract period. The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida is not obligated to place an order for any given amount, subsegquent to the award of this
bid. Estimates are based upon M-DCP'S actual needs and usage during a previous contractual period, and include an
additional ten percent to cover unanticipated increases in requirements.

PRODUCT & SAFETY LABELS: The School Board will not accept any potentially hazardous product without the
product having safety instructions. The instructions for safe usage shall be printed {preferably in red ink) on the product
label or printed instructions shall be inciuded with each container. These instructions must be in both English and
Spanish. In addition, these instructions shall advise of precautions to be taken, i.e.: eye protection, hand protection,
antidotes, efc.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPCSAL FORM [FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

135-EEQ6 G. Jackson SC2
TITLE

Pest Control Supplies

8.

10.

1.

12.

13.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CON'T.

MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET: Bidders are requested to submit material safety data sheet(s) with bid. ltems will
not be recommended for award until the Bureau of Procurement and Materials Management has received these sheets,

WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be for
one year or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater. The successful vendor will be responsible for repairing
each unit during the warranty period, at no cost to the Board. Vendor agrees to repair and retum equipment within
five (5) days from receipt of request or provide a temporary replacement.

UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unauthorized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination. Vendors shall be considered in default of the contract and shall lose eligibility to transact new business
with the Board for a period of fourteen (14) months from the date of termination by the Board.

ERASURES AND STRIKEQUTS: When filling out the bid proposal form, bidders are requested to use typewriter or
black ball point pen. '

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.

2. Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an error.

3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item(s).

VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: All bidders are requested to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor{s} have a current vendor application on
file. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
vendor(s) not be awarded any new business. Vendor applications can be downloaded at

http.//procurement.dadeschools.net

OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County's Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 8A, Article X of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a location outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested to be
submitted with the Bid Proposal. [f the Bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required
while the license is valid and in effect. 1t is the Bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after
expiration or termination of the current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not o be
considered for award.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI.DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE
135-EEQ6 G. Jackson SC3
TITLE
Pest Control Supplies
SPECIAL CONDITIONS CON'T.

14, CONE OF SILENCE: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this solicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or information
regarding this bid must be requested in writing by FAX or E-mail to;
Mr. Greg Jackson, Buyer
Procurement Management
Fax #305-523-2214
E-mail: gjackson@dadeschools.net
A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously to:
lleana Martinez, School Board Clerk
Miami-Dade County Public Schools
1450 N.E. 2 Avenue, Room 2688
Miami, Florida 33132
Fax #305-995-1448
E-mail: martinez@dadeschools net

185,

BID ADDENDUMS: All bidders should monitor continuously, the M-DCPS, Procurement website, for any addendums
that may be posted prior to the opening of this solicitation. The procurement website, which list all bids, addendums,
and awarded information, is as foliows: hitp:/iprocurement dadeschoals.net, {click) bid solicitation.




The School Beard of Miami-Dade County. Florida
Bid #135-EE08
Pest Control Supplies

argicte names oF thebidder

Bid #135-EEQ6

[Title: Pest Control Supplies

[Buyer: G. Jackson

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS

[NAME-OF BIDDER:

ITEM

DCPS #

DESCRIPTICN OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

LUNIT

PRICE PER
UNIT

MANUFACTURER & MODEL
NUMBER

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR

551-
00G7

Bait, ant control, containerized, (regular). 96 child
resistant bait trays per case. Clorox Max Force FC
#28376 or equal. (45800-820) Minimum ocder: 100
cases

300

Case

551-
o015

Bait, roach conirol, containerized, (small), 288 child
resistant bait trays per case. Clorox Max Force FC
#28373 or equal. (48000-541) Minimum order: 50
cases

250

Case|

551-

Glueboards, mouse and insect pre-baited trap,
prescented, packed 72 per case. Victor Hold Fast M-
320, Atlantic Paste MB7D2, Catchmaster 72MB or
equal. Minimum order; 25 cases

150

Case

551-
01064

Insecticide, fire ant control, active ingredient,
Abamectin Bl, packaged in 2-lb. Recloseable
containers. Ascend fire and bait, Formula 1,
manufactured by Whitmire Micro Gen or equal.
Packaged 4 or 6 containers per case. Minimum
order: 100 cases

400

Case |

551-
0155

Glue board, for trapping rats and mice. 10" X 18",
filled with glue, Pre-scented. 24 per case. Max-Catch
Giant Catchmaster 24GRB, Atlantic Paste and Glue
or equal. Minimum order: 25 cases

150

Case |-

551-
0163

Trap, rat, wooden base, spring snap with expanded
trigger. Packed 12 per box. Woodstream #M4,
Victor #M9/M326 or equal. Minimum order: 10
boxes

80

Case ||

553-
0296

Spreader, biochem fire ant regulator, designed
especially for application of Logic fire and bait.
Micro-flow control plate to be installed in each
spreader. Plate allows for spreading product | to 1.5
acres. Spreader diffuser plate provides uniform 7
foot broadcast pattern. Spyker #24-22 or equal.

Minimum order: 1 each

15

Each
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