THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

V. an SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING
C.‘ : 1450 Northeast Second Avenue
Miami, FL 33132

Miami-Dada Cougty Public Scrl;\;als
1! Stud= h . . ..
QIviRg our stud=ria the wo Direct all inquiries to Procurement Management

Services,
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM SUYER NAME.
BID NO. 094-GG06 G. Jackson

E-MAIL ADDRESS: diackson@dadeschools.net
PHONE: (305} 995-2345
FAX NUMBER:305-523-2214

TDD PHONE: (305) 995-2400

BID TITLE Air Conditioners, Window and Wall

Bids will be accepted until 2:00 PM on Qctober 23, 2007 in room 351, School Board Administration Building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue, Miami, FL 33132, at which time they will be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for__ 120 days after opening.
{Refer to Instructions to Bidders, para. IV.B.)

The submission of the bid by the vendor, acceptance and award of the bid by The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida, and
subsequent purchase orders issued against said award shall constitute a binding, enforceable contract. Unless otherwise stipulated in the
bid documents, no other contract documents shall be issued.

3 BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION
A. |cerify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or person
submitting a bid for the same matenais, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. |
agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and | certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder.

B. Vendor certifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Flonda.

C. | certify agreement with the School Board of Miami-Dade County Business Code of Ethics, and agree to comply with this
Code and alt applicable Schooi Board contracting and procurement policies and procedures. (Schocl Board Rule 6Gx13-
3F-1,025})

Il INDEMNIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold hamless, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hereinafter defined) against any claim, action, loss,
damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whalscever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation, attomey's fees and
court costs arising out of bodily injury to persons, including death, or damage to tangible property arising out of or incidental to
the performance of this contract {including goods and services provided thereto) by or on behalf of the Bidder, whether or not
due to or caused in part by the negligence or other culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sole negligence or culpability
of the indemnity. The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida, its
members, officers and empioyees.

Ii. PERFORMANCE SECURITY, is required on thisbid.  YES [} NO

Refer to INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. VIL.IF PERFORMANCE SECURITY IS REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE
TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Performance Bond [ Check (Cashiers, Certified, or equal) [ B

An original, manual signature |Is required on the Bldder Qualiification Form.
(Bidder Is requested to use blue Ink, do not use pencll)

Legal Name of Vendor
Mailing Address
City Zip Code

Telephone No.
E-mail Address
By: Signature (Original)

Of Authorized Representative

Name (Typed or Printed)
Of Authorized Representative

FM-3191 Rev. {08-07)




DISCLOSURE OF EMPLOYMENT OF FORMER SCHOOL BOARD EMPLOYEES

Pursuant to School Board Rule 6Gx13- 3F-1.025, which may be accessed at
http:/imwww2.dadeschools.net/schoolboard/rules all bidders, proposers, consultants, and contractors are required
to disclose the names of any of their employees who serve as agents or principals for the bidder, proposer or
contractor, and who within the last two years, have been or are employees of the School Board. Such
disclosures will be in accordance with current School Board rules, but will include, at a minimum, the name of
the former School Board employee, a list of the positions the employee held in the last two years of his or her
employment with the School Board, and the dates the employee held those positions.

NAME LIST OF POSITIONS DATES EMPLOYEE HELD POSITION

FM-3191 Rev. (08-0T)




INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

NOQTICE OF ESTABLISHMENT OF A CONE OF SILENCE

The School Board of Miami-Dade Ccunty Publlc schools shacts a Cone of
Siignce from Lssuance of a soficiation to writien recommendation of award.,
Al provisions of School Board Rule BGx13-8C-1.212 apply.

I.  PREPARATION OF BIDS

A. BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM quallfies the bidder and the bid
and must ba completed and submitted as page 1 and 2 of the bid.

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY shall not be submifted with the bid.
The form of parformance securlty the bidder will submit, when
required to do 50, must be fumished.

2. BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. Bid must
contain an original manual signature from an authorized
representative. An unsigned bld will be considered non-responsive.

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines conditions of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any Inconsistency In this bid shall
be resolved by giving precedence In the following order:

A. Specifications

B. Special Conditiona

C. Instructions To Bidders
2. FOR M/WBE designated bids. The SPECIAL CONDITIQNS-
Minority/Women owned and controlled Business Particlpation
Statemeni and the M/MWBE Cartification Application MUST be
completed and SUBMITTED with the bld if the bidder is not certified
by Miaml-Dada County Public Schools. Failure to submit the
compiletad application with the bld will be considerad non-responsive.

C. BID PROPOSAL FORM. Defines requiremoent of items to be
purchased, and must be completed and submilted as page 2 and
subsequent pages, if any, of the bid. The bidder should indicale
Ms/har namae In the appropriate space on each page.

1. (TEM SPECIFICATION. Specifying a certain brand, make or
manufacturer Is lo denote the quality, type, and standard of the article
desired. Articles offered must be naw merchandise only, of equal or
supefior grade. On blank lines provided, the bidder Is requestad to
Insert the brand name, manufacturer's number and other Information
necessary to sufficiently klentify articie offered, Failure to do 50 may
prevent consideration of the Hem. Also, refer to paragraph X.
Packaging.

2 PRICES are requestad In units of quentity specified In the bid
spactfications. In cass of a discrepancy in computing the total
amount of bid, UNIT PRICE quoted will govem. Al prices bid shall
Include delivary F.O.B. destinaton, freight prepaid {bidder pays and
bears freight charges. Blddsr owns goods In transh and filea any
claims) and shall Include all cartage, drayage, packing, etc., delivered
to and unicaded at the recelving station at the site designated In BID
PROPOSAL FORMS and there recelvad by the designatad agent of
the Board.

3. TAXES. The Board doses nof pay Federal Exclse and State taxes
on direct purchasas of tangible parsonal propafty. The applicable tax
axamption number is shown on the purchase order. This examption
does not apply o purchases of tangible personal property made by
contraciore who use the langble parsonal property in the
parformance of contracts for the Improvemant of Board-owned real
property as defined In Chapter 192 of the Florida Statutes.

II. SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A. Bids must ba submitted on forms fumished by the Board and in
sealed packages or anvelopes. Bld submissions must be clearly
marked with bid number, bid tile and bid opening date.

B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When filing out the bid
proposal form, bidders are required to complets bid proposal In ink,

1. Use of pencil s prohibited.

2. Do not erase or use correction fwid to correct an esror.

3. All changes must be cfossed out and initlaled In ink.

Page 1

0oL

Those bida for Individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and
3 above will be congidered non-responslve for that item(s).

C. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids shall ba submittad by U.S.
Malt, Courier/Express Service, or daposiied In the BID BOX located in
Roorn 351, 8:00 AM. to 4:30 P.M., Monday through Friday, SCHOOL
BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 1450 N.E, Second Avenus,
Miami, Florida 33132. Bids received alter the dats and hour
spacified In the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM will not be
considered.

D. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Sectlon 207.133(2}{a) Fiorida
Statute. A parson or affillate who has been placaed on the conviciad
vendor Hst following a conviction for a public entity crime may not
submit a bid on a contract to provide any goods or esrvices to &
public entity, may not submit a bid on a contract with a public entity
for the construction or mepalir of a public bullding or public work, may
not submit bids on leasee of real property to a public entity, may not
be awarded or perform work aa a contractor, aupplier, subcontracior,
or consultant under a contract with ary pubfic entity, and may not
transact busineas with any publlc entity In excess of the thresheld
amount provided In Section 287.017, for CATEGORY TWO for a
perlod of 38 months from the date of being placed on the convicted
vendor list.

E. SUBMITTING A “NO BID." H not submitting a bid at this time,
relurn the form enttled “NOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS.'
Faflure to respond, efther by submiting a bid or the "NOTICE TD
PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS® form for three consecutive times, may
result in the company belng removed from the School Board's bid list,

F. AVAILABILITY OF BID INFORMATION. Immediately following
the public opening, bids will be read, upon requesi, and then
complled in a tabular form, a copy of which will be avallable for
axamination In Procuremant Managemeni Sarvices.

CANCELLATION OF BID3 OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

An invitallon for bids may be canceled, In whole or in part, as may be
spacified In the solichation, when It is in the best interest of the Board.
The reasons shall be made a part of the master bid file.

A. Prior to opening, a solichation may be canceled in whole or in
part, prior to the date and hour epecified in the Bidder Cualification
Form fof recelpt of bids, when the Assistamt Superintandent,
Precuremen Manegement Services, determines in wriling, that such
action Is In the bost interest of the Board for reasons Including, but
not Smited to:

1. The Board no flonger requires the supples, eervices, or
construction;

2. The Board no longer can reasonably expect 1o fund the
procursiment;

3. Areview of a valid prolest filed by a bidder as may be determined
by the administrative staff; or

4, Proposed amendments to the soliciiaion would be of such
magnitude that a new solicitation (s deslrable.

B. When a solicitaion is canceted prior to opening, notice of
cancallation shall be posted on the District's webasite, and sent bo all
businessss solicitad, via facsimile or mal. Any hids or proposals
received for the cancelled solicitation shall be retwned to the vendor
unopsnad.

The notice of cancellation shan:

1. ldentify the solicitation:

2, Brisfly axplain the raason for cancellation; and

3. Where appropiats, sxplain that an opportunity will be given 1o
compate on any future re-soflcitation for procurements of similar
supplias, sarvices, or construction.

Revised September 2007




Iv.

Y.

CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL, OF BIDS

A. PRICR TO BID OPENING. Should the bidder deskre t change or
withdraw his/her bid, he/she shall do so In writing.  This
communication Is to be recelved by the District Director, of
Procurement Management, Room 352, School Board Administration
Building, prior to date and hour of bid opening. The bidders name,
the bid number, the bid title and the date the bid Is due must appear
on the anvelope.

B. AFTER BID OPENINQG. After bids are openad, they may not be
changed, nor withdrawn, for S0 days after the determined opening
date, uniess otherwise specified on the "BIDDER QUALIFICATION
FORM."

€. FAILURE TO ACCEPT BID AWARD. Bidders who, pror 1o the
Bid Award by The School Board of Miaml-Dade County, Florida,
indicate that they are unable to accept the bid award shall either:

1. Pay to the Board, as liquidated damages, an amount equal to 5%
of the unit price bid, imes the quantlty, or $10, whichever amount is
larger, or

2. Lose eligibillty to transact new business with the Board for a period
of 14 months from the date the Board acts on the withdrawn bid.

PROTESTS TO CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD

A. The Board shall provide notice of a declsion or Intended declsion
conceming a $olicitation, contract award, or exceptional purchase by
electronic posting which can be accessed at the district's website
www.dadeschools.net

B. Any person who s adversely affected by the agency decision or
intended decision shall fle with the agency a notice of protest In
writing within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decislon or
intended decislon. With respect to a protest of the terms, conditions,
and specifications cortalned In a selictation. including any provisions
goveming the methods of ranking bids, proposals, or replies,
awarding contracts, reserving fghts of futher naegofiation, o
modifying or amending any contract, the natice of protest shall be
filed In writing within 72 hours after the posting of the solicitation. The
formal written protest shall be filed within 10 days after the date the
notice of proteat Is fled. The formal wsitten protest shall state with
particularity the facis and law upon which the protast ls based.
Satwdays, Sundays, and stale holidays shall be exciuded In the
computation of the 72-hour time perlods established hereln.

C. The protesting party shall be requived to post a bond consistent
with F.A.C. Rule 28-110.005(2). and Board Rule 3C-1.11. Fallure to
file a protast within the time prescribed In Section 120.57(3), Florida
Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law
within the time allowad for filing a bond shall constitute a waher of
proceadings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

D. Formal, written protasts will be reviewed by Procurement
Management Services, who will offer the protesting bidder the
opportunity to maeet and discuss the mertts of the protest. If tha
protest s not resoived, the bldder may seek an administrative hearing
pursuart to §120.57 Fla. Stat Petitions for hearing pursuant to
§120.57 Fla Stat,, must be filed In accordance with School Board

Rule 6Gx13- 8C-1,084.
AWARDS

A. RESERVATION FOR REJECTION CR AWARD. The Board
resarves the right to reject any or all bids, to walve lregularitas or
technicalities, and to request reblds. The Board reservee the right to
award on an Individual Item basls, any combination of [tems, total low
bid or, if an alternate bid Is accepted, on such terms as are spacified
for the alternate bid, whichever manner I [n the best interest of the
Board.

The Board resarves tha right to utllize other gavernmental contracts, if
in the best interest of the Board.

B. NOTIFICATION OF INTENDED ACTION wili be postad on the
District's webslte no later than the Friday preceding a regulady
scheduled Board mseting.
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C. OFFICIAL AWARD DATE. Awards bacome officlal upon the
Board's formal approval of the award.

D. TERMINATION FOR CONVENIENCE

The Board reserves the right 1o terminate this cortract at any time end
for any reason upon giving thirty (30) days' notice to the other party. If
sald contract should be terminated for convenlence as providad hereln,
the Board will be relleved of all obligations under sald contract. The
Board wiil oniy ba required to pay that amount of the contract actually
performed to the date of termination. Upon euch payment, both parties
shall be relleved of any further obligations under this contract.

E. PURCHASE ORDERS mailed to successful biddsrs are the officlal
notHication to deliver materials described thereln; and the time allowed
for delivery begins with the date of the purchase order. In the event
that the successiul bidder falls to daliver the materfals in accordance
with the terms and conditions of the bid and purchase order, the biddar
shall be conaldered to be in default of the contract and subject to the
default provisions stated In Section VI. F.

F. DEFAULT. A vendor who falls to perform according to the terms of
the cantract (bid) shall be considerad in default. In the avent of defauh,
which may include, but Is not limited to poor performance and/er non-
performance, a vendor shall either {1) pay Gquidatad damages of 10
percent of the unit price of the tem(s) awarded times the quantity when
no purchase order has been lssued, 10 percent of the purchase order
when a purchase order has been Issued or $100, whichever s graater
or (2) lose eligibility to transact new business with the Board for a perlod
of 14 months from date of termination of award by the Board. Bidders

" that are determined lneligible may requast a hearing pursuant to

Chapter 120 of the Florida Statutes, and School Board Rule 6Gx13- §C-
1.064.

G. The Imtert of the bid documents ls to inciude only the writlen
requirements for materlals, equipment, systems, standards and
workmanship necessary for the proper sxecution and completion of the
work by the Bidder. The bid documents shall not ba construad to craate
an entitlemant to any other scope of work except as spacified hereln,

YIL PERFORMANCE SECURITY (FOR SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS ONLY)

A, PURPOSE. A perfomance bond or check may be required to
guarantee performance.

B. BONDING COMPANY. Performance Bonds shall be written through
a roputahle and rasponsibla surety bond agency lcensad t do
busingas In the State of Florida and with a sumety company or
corporation meating both of tha following specifications:

1. Awards Greater than $500.000
A minimum rating in the latast revislon of Best's Insurance Repoits of

Contract Amourt Minimym Raiing by A.M, Bast
$ 500,000.01 to § 2,500,000 None
$ 2,500,000.01 to § 5,000,000 B+ or NA-3

No Minkmum Class
$ 5,000,000.01 to $10,000,000 A- Class IV
$10,000,000.01 or more A- Class V

Current catificata of authority as accaptable suraty on Federal Bonds In
accordance with the latest edition of the United States Treasury
Department Circular 570 emitted “Companles Holding Cortificates of
Authority as Acceptable Suretiee on Federal Bonds and as Accaptabie
Ralnsuring Companies" shall be accepted for an amount not excesding
the underwrliting limitation thereon.

2. 8

Bonds shall be written with a surety company or corporation measting the
qualifications as set forth In Paragraph VILB. abave or the qualificationa
sat forth In sectlon 287.0835, Florida Statutes,

C. AMOUNT, When required aa delined hereln, the fimn or Indivicual(s)
to whom an award has besn made shall axecute and deliver to The
School Board of Miaml- Dade County, Florida, a Performance Bond,
Cashiers/Certifiad Check, or equal,

1. Awards less than $200,000 shall he axempt from performance
sacurity.
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2. Performance security shall not be required, unless otharwise
defined in the bid specifications. I performanca security |s required, it
shall saqual 100% of the award smount.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMAMCE SECURITY, Retwm to the
Awardae of his/her cash sacurity, or nofffication to the Awardee and
the bonding company 1o cancel the parformance bond, wili be made
when all goods/services have been accepted and invoices have bean
approved for paymeant

VII.SAMPLES

When bid sainplas are required, the buyer will notify bidder to submit
samplas of the tema bld In accordance with the foliowing procedures:

A. All samples must be identiflad with the bidder's name, bid number,
ftem number, and product name and number. Where non-compliance
with this requiremant s noted, sald tam may be considerad as being
unidantifiable and may not be aliglble for consideratlon in the award
recommandaton.

B. AD samples are 1 bs delivered within 7 calendar days after
recelpt of notification from buyer, unless otherwise stated in the
Special Conditions of the bid. It the bidder does not submlt samplas
by the date and ime indicatad by the buyer, the bid submitted for that
tem may not be considered for award.

C. Bidder must obtain, from Materlals Testing and Evaluation, &
signed racelpt acknowiedging dalivery of samples. Bidder shall
include a ssH-addressed, stamped envsiope for return of sample
raceipt when submiting samples by masil or delivery sarvice. The
bldder will raceive the original copy of the recalpt snd the duplicale
copy will remaln with the Miami-Deds County Public Schools
recelving department as the fle copy. Bidder shall be solaly
rasponsible for delivary of samples and for retaining sample dalivery
receipts, which must be presantad in any dispute regarding receipt ot
bid samplas.

D. Samples should be daliverad to tha following addrass:

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION
7040 West Flagler Strest
Miami, Fiorida 33144
Tetephone Number, 788.275-0750

Miami-Dade County Publlc Schools will not ba rasponsible for
samples sent to & location other than the location martiened in the
bid.

E. PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Board will buy no samples and
will assuma no cost Incidental thereto.

F. RETURN OF SAMPLES. Samples not destroyed In testing may
be claimed by unsuccessful bidders 14 days after bid award dete and
by successiul biddera 14 days after final payment: but the Board will
assume no rasponsibilty for sampiss not claimed within the time
specified, and it will pay for no sampisa damaged In testing.

G. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS. If a sample submitted for
testing does not comply, the buyer wili advise the bidder fo contact
Matarials Testing and Eveiuation for further detaila.

SUBSTITUTIONS

Should the bidder find it necsssary to use a materdal, equipment,
product or systam other than spacified, the biddar shall secure from
the Board, through Procurement Management Services, wiritten
approval for the usa of the aftarnate materials, equipment, product or
system. Tha Board la not obligated to spprove requests for
substitutions and has the discretion 10 require the biddar to provide
tha materlals a3 specified in the bid documents. In no case shall tha
bidder be entitied to additional time and/of money arising out of the
Board's failure to approve requests for substitutiona.

PACKAGING

A. {f packaging is different from that specified, the bidder must note
the mannesr and amounts in which packaging is ® be made;
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otherwisa the successful bidder shall furnish packaging as specified. All
packaging, wrapping and bundling shall be adequate to insure that
matarials will be raceivad in undamaged condition. The Board assumes
no responsibility for damages of any kind Incurred In transit,

B. The following identification shall be printed, sienclled or legbly
wrftiten in a conspicuous lecation on @sch shipping contalner:

1. Bid Numbar And/Or Purchase Ordar Number
2. Vandor's Name And/Or Trademark

3. Name(S) Of Item(S) Contalned

4. Item Number({S) With Quantity(les)

XI. PURCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

With the consent and sgreament of the successful bidder(s), purchases
may be made under this bid by Mlami Dade County, Florida, and other
govammenial agencies or pofitical subdivisions within the State of
Florida. Such purchases shal be governed by the same terms and
conditions staled hereln. This agreememt in no way resticis or
interferas with the right of any State of Florida Agency or polfticat
subdivision to rebid any of all of these ltems.

X11, RECYCLING REQUIREMENTS

Miami-Dade County Public Schools suppords recycling and
racomimends the usa of recycled producte whers possible. Vendors ara
requestad 1 submit a letter, alonpg with thair bid, indicating whather
each item bld and/or fts packaging cortalna pra-consumer or post-
cotigumer waste, and if the product and/or packaging may be recyclad.

XII1. ENVIRQNMENTAL PRODUCTS

Miaml-Dade County Public Schools encourages the use of
environmentally safe preducts,

X1V, DELIVERY AND BILLING

A. DELIVERY. Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays excepted, deliveries
shall be mada as follows: Schools and Departmenis - 8:00 AM, to
3:00 P.M. Morchandise shal be unloaded at the racelving station of
the designatad delivery point and recatved there by a designated agent
of tha Board. A delfivery ticket, or one copy of the Invoice, prepared as
indicaled below, shall accompany each defivery.

B. RECEIVING INSPECTION AND TESTING, Delivered items which
do not fulfill el requirgmonts will be rejectad. Rejected tems shall be
removed and replaced prompily by the vendor, at no cost to the
purchaser.

C. INVOICES. Each Involce shall be Issued by the successful bidder
and shall ba submittad in DUPLICATE to the Accounts Payable
Saction, P.O. Box 01-2570, Mlami, Florida 33101. To be considered
for payment, aach invoice muat show the following Information, which
appears on the Purchase Order:

Purchase Order Nomber

am

Quantities and Units

Prica Extensions

Total price of afl ttams on involce

D. PAYMENT. Unless othsrwise specified by Miami-Dade Courty
Public Schools, payment will ba made only after delivery, authorized
Inspection, and acceptance. Payment will be made only 1o the
successful bldder, unless otherwise requasted, In writing, by the
successful bidder and accepted by Miami-Dads County Public Schools
Administretion. Whan bidders are directed to send Invoices to a
school, the school will meke directad payment to the bidder.

Lok ol ol o

XV. NO GRATUITY POLICY
ft is the poficy of Procurement Managemart Services not o accept

gifts, gratuities, or favora of any kind, or of any value whatsoevar, from
vandors, membera of their staffs, or familles.

XVI. COMPLIANCE WITH STATE/FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A. Al contracts involving federal funds will cortain cartain provisions
required by applicabie sections of Title 34, Section B0.35() and
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Section 85.510 Code of Federal Regulations and are included by
reference harein. The vender certifies by signing the bid that the
vendor and hisher principals are not presentty debarred,
suspended, proposed for debarment, declared Ineligible or
volurtarily excluded from participation in federally funded
transactions and may, in certain instances, be required to provide a
saparate written certification 1o thia affect.

During the tarm of any contract with the Board, in the event of
dgbarment, suspension, proposaed dabarment, declared inellgible or
voluntarily excluded from paricipation in federally funded
transactions, the vendor shall immediately nolify the Aassistant
Superimtendert, Procurament Management Services, in willing.
Vendors will also be required to provide access to records, which
ara directly pertinent to the contract and retain all required records
for tres years after the Board makes final payment.

employea will notify the Contractor/Employer of any arrest(a) of
conviction(s) of any offensa enumerated in School Board Rules
8Qx13- 3F-1.024 and 6Gx13- 4C-1.021 within 48 hours of fis
occurrence. Contractor agrees to provide the Board with a fist of all
of its employees who have compioted background screening as
required by ths abova-referenced statutes and who mest the
slatutory requirements contalned thersin. Contracior agrees that it
has an ongoing duly to maintaln and update these Hsts as new
employeea ara hired and In the event that any previously screaned
empioyee [ails to meel the statutory standards. Contractor further
agreea to notify the Board kmmediately upon becoming aware that
one of its employesa who was previously certified as completing the
background check and meeting the statulory standards Ia
subsequantly arrested or cornwicted of any disqualifying offensa.
Failure by Contractor to notify the Board of such arest or conviction
within 48 hours of being put on notice and within 5 business days of

the occurrence of qualfying amest or conviction, shal constitute

B. For all contracts involving Federal funds in sxcess of $10,000, grounds for immediate tetmination of this Contract by the Board.

the Board resarves the right 1o terminate the contract for causa, as
well as for conveniance, by Issuing a certified notice to the vendor.

XVvIl, COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS - Bidders shall comply with all tederal,
stats of Florida and local laws applicable to it and the performance
of its abligations under this bid.

The partles further agree that fallure by Cantractor to perform any of
the duties described In this section shall constiute s material breach
of the Contract entiling the Board to terminate thls Contract
immediately with no furthar responsibliity to make payment or perform
any other duties under this Agreement.

XVIIl. BACKGROUND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS

In accordance with ths raquirements of Sections, 1012.485,

101232, and 1012.487, Florida Stafutes, School Board Rulss

BGix13- 3F- 1,024 and 8Gx13- 4C-1.021 as amendad from tme 10

time Contractor agrees that, if Contractor recelves remuneration for

services, Contractor and ait of ts employees who provide or may

provide services undar this Contract will compiete criminal history

chaecks, and all background screaning requirements, including tevel

2 screening requiremants as outlined in the above-referenced

statutes and School Board rules prior to providing services © the XX.
School Board of Miami-Dade County.

XIX. COMPLIANCE WITH SCHOOL CODE

Contractor agrees to comply with all sections of the Florida K-20
Education Code, Title XLVIN, Florlda Statutes as It prsssntly exsts,
and further as it may be amended from time to time, Further Contractor
agrees that failure to comply with the Florida K-20 Education Code
shall constitute a materiai breach of this Contract and may result in the
termination of this Cortract by the Board.

CHARTER SCHOOLS

items or Services awerded under this contract shall be made avafiable
to Charter Schosls approved by the School Boerd of Mlami-Dade
County Public Schools. M-DCPS Ia not responsibie or Hable for
purchasss that may be made by Charter Schools.

Additionally, Contractor agrees that each of Its ampiloyess,
raprasentatives, agents, subcontractors or suppliers who are
parmittad accese on school grounds when students are present,
who have divect contact with students or who have accass to or

control of achool funds must meet level 2 screening requirements XXI1. CONFLICY OF INTEREST
as described in the above-referenced statutes, and School Board
rules, Former Mlami-Dade County Public Schools employees, clasaified as

Manageral Exempt Parsonnel, Pay Grade 22 and abovs, Dade County
School Administrators Association, Pay Qrads 47 and above, and
other equivalent positions, are prohibited from personally representing
another parson or antity or acting as an agam or atiomaey for
compensation In connection with any matier In which The Schoo!
Board ot Miami-Dade County, Florica, I8 Interastad, for two yeare afier
the School Board employses’ aervice terminates. This provieion s
pu1r1l:lnt to School Board Rule 8Gx13 — 4A-1,212 and Fiofida Statute
[} .313(B).

Pursuant to the 2007 amendments to the JLA enacted by the
Florida Legislature, requirements for certaln fngerprinting and
ciminal history ¢hecks shall be inapplicable to non-ingtructional
contracted personnal who qually for sxempton from level 2
scresning requirements as provided under § 1012.468, Fla. Stat.
(2007). In addition, the provislons of § 1012.467, Fla. Stat. (2007)
are Incorporated hefein by reference, and any provisions of this
saction that may be Inconsistent with, contrary o, or determnined to
be in confilct with 8 1012.467, will bé superseded by sald statute,

XXT1, PUBLIC RECORDS LAW
A noninstructicnal contractor who is exempt from the screening
requirementa set forth In § 1012.485, § 1012.4568 or § 1012487,
Florida Statutes, 8 subject to a search of his or her name or other
identifying Information against the registraion information
regarding sexual predators and sexual offendars malntained by the
Department of Law Enforcement under § 543.043 and the national
3ex oftender public registry maintained by the United States
Department of Justica. Contractor will not be charged for this
search,

Pursuant to Florida Statute, it ia the practice of M-DCPS ©w make
avallable for public Inspection and copying any kformation racaved In
reaponse 1o an Invitatlon to Bid or Request for Proposals (RFF), No
action on the part of the respondent to a Bid or RFP will creats an
obligation of confidentiality on tha part of the School Board, Including
but not limited to, making a reference in the response to tha trade
sacret stahutes. It Is recommended thal potentlal suppliers exciude
from their response any information that, In ther judgment, may be
considered a trada secret.
Further, upon obtaining clearance by Board, if Board deems
pacessary, Board will issue a photo identification badge which shall
be worn by the individual at all imes whila on Board property when
students are present,

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DAPE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contractor agrees to bear any and all costs assoclatad with
acquiring the required background screening — including any costs
associated with fingerprinting and obtaining the required photo
identificaion badge. Contractor agrees 1o require all s affected
amployees to gign a statement, as a condiion of employmant with
Corttractor In relation to performance under this Bid/RFP, agreeing
that the amployea will abide by the heralofors described
background screening requirements, and also egreaing that the
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FROM: AFFIX

POSTAGE
HERE

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES
ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2N° AVENUE

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO.: 094-GGO6

BID TITLE: Air Conditioners, Window and Wall

BID OPENING DATE: October 23, 2007




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Procurement Management Services

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID
if not submitting a bid at this time, for informational purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the information requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Our company does not handle this type of product/service.
We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.
Cur company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
OTHER, {Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

Signature
Title

Company.

NOTE: Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may result In
your company being removed from the School Board's bid list. To qualify as a
respondent to the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID,




Vendor Information Sheet

1A. 2, Telephone/Fax/Contact Person
Federal Employer Identification Number

Telephone number

Or
Owner's Social Security Number
1B. Fax number
Name of Firm, Individual{s), Partners or Corporation
Contact Person
Streel Address
City State Zip Code E-mail address

3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship,or joint venture, the full legal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director, or owner who holds, directly or indirectly the majority of the
stack or ownership, If the contract or business transaction is with a trust, the full legal name and address shall be provided for

each trustee and each beneficiary. Post Office addresses are not acceptable.

Race-
Name Title Address Gender |ethnicity  |Stock Ownership

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided on the "Vendor's

Application". All vendors must have a current vendor's application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be

familiar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: (a) Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free Workplace, (¢} Family Leave

Policy, (d} Code of Business Ethics, () Conflict of Interest, (f) Perception, (g) Gratuities, and (h) Business Meals. Failure to
rovide M-DCPS a current vendor lication m use the vendor n r ny n iness with M-DCP

Vendor applications can be downloaded at: hitp://procurement.dadeschools.net




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOQLS
BID PROPQSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE CAUNTY FLORIDA

BID 094-GG06 BUYER G, Jackson PAGE SC1

Air Conditioners - Window and Wall

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

1. PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract, at firm unit prices, for the purchase of window and wall
air conditioners, for Maintenance Matenials Management stock. The term of the bid shall be for one year from the date
of award, and may, by mutual agreement between Miami-Dade County Public Schools and the successful bidder(s), be
extended for two (2) additional one (1) year period(s) and, if needed, 90 days beyond the expiration date of the current
contract penod. Procurement Management Services, may if considering to extend, request a letter of intent to extend
from the successful bidder(s), prior to the end of the current contract period. All prices shall be firm for the term of the
contract. The successful bidder(s) agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

2. QUANTITIES: The quantities or usage shown on the Bid Proposal Form are estimates only. No guarantee or
warranty is given or implied by the Board, as to the total amount that may or may not be purchased from the resulting
contract(s). These quantities are for bidders’ information only, to aid in determining whether they will be able to supply
the amounts which may be required by the Board.

3. SPECIFICATIONS: [f anitemis to be considered as an equal to the specified item, complete technical specifications,
together with ilustrative materials providing brand name and model number of the item, are requested to accompany
bid. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the item not to be considered for award.

4. DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made as soon as possible, but not later than 45 days after receipt of the purchase
order. Units must be shipped no more than six (6) to a pallet and stacked three (3) high or shipment may be refused.

DELIVER TO:

Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Maintenance and Matenals Management
12525 NW 28" Avenue
Miami, FL 33167

5. WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be for one
year or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater. The successful vendor will be responsible for repainng each unit
during the warranty peried, at no cost to the Board. Vendor agrees to repair and return equipment within five (5) days
from receipt of request or provide a temporary replacement.

6. UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unauthorized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination. Vendors shall be considered in default of the contract and shall lose eligibility to transact new business
with the Board for a period of fourteen (14) months from the date of termination by the Board.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BiD 094-GGOB BUYER G, Jackson PAGE 2

Air Conditioners - Window and Wall

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

7. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS: When filling out the bid proposal form, bidders are requested to use a typewriter or
complete bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an ervor.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item(s).

8. VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: All bidders are requested to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor{s) have a current vendor application on
file. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
vendor(s} not be awarded any new business. Vendor applications can be downloaded at
http://procurement dadeschools.net.

9. OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County's Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 8A, Article IX of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a location outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested to be submitted
with the bid proposal. If the bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required while the
license is valid and in effect. |t is the bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after expiration or
termination of the current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to be considered for
award.

10. CONE OF SILENCE: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this solicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or information
regarding this bid must be requested in writing by FAX or E-mail to:

Mr. Greg Jackson, Buyer
Procurement Management

Fax #305-523-2214

E-mail: gjackson@dadeschools.net

A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously to:




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOQLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TQ: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BID

094-GG06 BUYER 5. Jackson PAGE SC3

Air Conditioners - Window and Wall

1.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

lleana Martinez, School Board Clerk
Miami-Dade County Public Schools

1450 N.E. 2n Avenue, Room 2688

Miami, Florida 33132

Fax #305-995-1448

E-mail: martinez@dadeschools.net

BID ADDENDUMS: Ail bidders should monitor continuously, the M-DCPS, Procurement website, for any addendums
that may be posted, prior to the opening of this solicitation. The procurement website, which list all bids, addendums,
and award information, is as follows: http:/procurement.dadeschoois net, (click) bid solicitation.




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #094-GG06
Air Conditioners ~ Window and Wall

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or peint in thisbox the PLEASE COMPLETE
comiplete name of the bidder: ALL SHADED AREAS

Bid #094-GG06 NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Air Conditioners - Window and Wall . :
Buyer: Q. Jackson

ESTIMATED PRICE PER MANUFACTURER &
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY LUNIT UNIT MODEL#
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S WARRANTY, IF
GREATER THAN ONE YEAR
1 [[102-0111)A/C window/wall, w/electrical heating elements, shall have 493 Each

slide out chassis, 208-230V, min BTU 36,000, min EER 8.5,
must be on pallets for forklift unloading. Must include wilk kit.
6 units per pallet.

Friedrich model #EL36L35A, or equal,

2 1102-00214A/C, window, min BTU 28,000, Cool 208/230 volts. Shall 107 Each
have slide out chassis: 20 3/16' high, 25 15/16" wide and 33
5/8" deep, min EER 9.5, must be on pallets for forklift
unloading. Must include wilk kit. 6 units per pallet.

Friedrich model #SL28L30, or equal.

3 (|102-0072){Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, with 41 Each
reverse cycle heating. Shall have slide out chassis, min BTU
12,700, min EER 11.0, heat pump 11,000, and operate on
208/230 volts. Must be on pallets for forklift unloading. Must
include wilk kit. & units per pallet.

Friedrich model #YS13L33, or equal.

4 1102-0098| Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, with 632 Each
reverse cycle heating. Shall have slide out chassis and operat
on 230/208 volts, 24,000 BTU cool minimum, 22000 BTU
heat pump, 1 7300 back-up electric strip heat, EER 9.0. Must
be on pallets for forklift untoading. Must include wilk kit. 6
units per pallet.

Friedrich model #Y1.24L.35, or equal.

5 [[102-0013]|Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, with 69 Each
clectrical heating and cool elements.. Shall have slide out
chassis and operate on 230/208 volts, min BTU 17,800,
minimum EER 10.0, Must be on pallets for forklift un]oading
Must include wilk kit. 6 units per pallet.

Friedrich model #EM18L34, or equal.

6 [102-0128)Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, straight 28 Each
cooling unit. Shall have slide out chassis and operate on 115

volts, min (BTU/hr) 11,600, min EER 10.5. Must be on pallets
for forklift unloading. Must include wilk kit. 6 units per pallet.

Friedrich model #KS12L10, or equat.
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #094-GG06
Air Conditioners - Window and Wall

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or print in this box the PLEASE COMPLETE
complete name of the bidder: ALL SHADED AREAS
Bid #094-GG06 |namE oF BIDDER:

Title:Air Conditioners - Window and Wall

Buyer: G. Jackson

ESTIMATED PRICE PER MANUFACTURER &
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION CF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT UNIT MODEL#
7 |[102-0048 | Air conditioner, cool only, window mount and wall mount unit, 6 Each

Shall have slide out chassis and operate on 230/208volts, min
BTU 12,000 cool, min EER [ }.0. Must be on pallets for
forklift unloading. Must include wilk kit. 6 units per pallet.

fFriedrich model #3312L.30, or equal.

& |102-00648Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, straight 10 Each
cooling unit. Shall have slide out chassis and operate on 115
volts, min (BTU/hr) 8,200, min EER 11.0. Must be on pallety
for forklift unloading. Must include wilk kit. 6 units per pallet.

Friedrich mode| #SS08L 10, or equal.

8 |[t02-0056§ Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, with 45 Each
reverse cycle heating, with no electrical heating elements.
Shall have slide out chassis and operate on 115 volts. min BTU
7,400 cool, min BTU 9200, min BTU heat pump, min EER
11.5. Must be on pallets for forklift unloading. Must include
wilk kit. 6 units per pallet.

Friedrich model #YS09L 10, or equal.

10 [102-0t37] Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, straight 18 Each
cooling unit. Shall have slide out chassis and operate on
230/208 volt. min {BTU/hr) 20,200, min EER 9.7. Must be o
pallets for forklift unloading. Must include wilk kit. 6 units per
pallet.

Friedrich model #8M211.30, or equal.

t1 [102-0030) Air conditioner, window mount and wall mount unit, straight 5 Each
cooling unit. Shall have slide out chassis and operate on
230/208 volts. min (BTU/hr) 16,300, min EER 9.8. Must be L
on pallets for forklift unloading. Must include wilk kit. 6 uni
per pallet.

Friedrich model #83161.30, or equal.
12 Pallets (6 units per pallet) 250 Each
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