e THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
ng SCHOOQOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING :
L 1450 Northeast Second Avenue !

Miami, FL 33132

Direct all inquiries fo Procurement Management

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Services:
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM BUYER NAME:
BID NO. __ 087-FF06 G Jackson

E-MAIL ADDRESS: giackson@dadeschoois.net
PHONE: (305) 995-2345
FAX NUmeer 305-523-2214

TDO PHONE (305) 995-2400

BID TITLE Window Shade Fabric and Accessories

Bids will be accepted until 2:00 PM on March 27, 2007 i room 351, School Board Administration building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue, Miami. FL | 33132, at which time they will be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for _ 120 days after opening.
(Rafer to Instructions to Bidders, para. {V.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BID BY THE SCHOOL BOARD OF
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL
CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BID DOCUMENTS, NO
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED.

l. A BIODER CERTIFICATION AND iDENTIFICATION

i cerify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collugion
or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and | certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder.

B. Vendor certifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

. INDEMNIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold hammless, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hereinafter defined) against any claim, action, loss,
damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation, attorney’s fees and
court costs arising out of bodily injury to persons, including death, or damage to tangible property arising out of or incidental to
the performance of this Contract (including goods and servicas provided thereto) by or on behalf of the Bidder, whether or not
due to or caused in part by the negligence or othar culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sole negligence or culpability

. of the indemnity. The following shail be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its
members, officers and employees.

In, PERFORMANCE SECURITY, is required on thisbid.  YES |3 No [
Refer to INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. ViI., and VI,

tF PERFORMANCE SECURITY IS REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Pedformance Bond ) Check (Cashiers, Certified, or equal) L 1

An original, manuat slgnature Is required on the Biddsr Qualification Form.
{Bldder is requested to use biue ink)
(Do not use pencll)

Legal Name of Vendor
Mailing Address

City State Zip Code

Telephone No. E-mail address
By: Signature {Original)

Of Authorized Representative
Name (Typed or Printed)

Of Autharized Renrosontative

v
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. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
NOTICE OF EBTABLISHMENT OF A CONE OF SHLENCE

The School Board of Miami-Dade Caunty Public schools enacte & Cone
of Sience from lssuance of a adlicitation to written recommendation of
award. Al provisions of School Board Fule 6Gx13-8C-1.212 apply.

L

PREPARATION OF BIDS

A. BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM qualifies the bidder and the
bid and must be compleiad and submitted as page 1 of the bid.

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY. The form of performance security
the bidder wik submit, when required t© do 30, must be fumishexl
Ferarmance security shall not be submitted with the bid.

2. BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. Bid must
contaln an onginal manual signature from an  authorized
reprasentative. An unsigned bid will be considerod non-reaponsive.

8. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines conditions of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any inconsistency in this bid shaill
be resolved by giving precadence in the followlng erder:

A, Spacitications
B. Special Conditons
C. Instructiona To Bidders

2. FOR M/WBE designated bids. The SPECIAL CONDITIONS-
Minority/Wemen owned and conibrofled Business Faricipation
Statement and the WWBE Certificalion Application MUST be
complated and SUBMITTED with the bid if the bidder s not cestifled
by MamiDade County Public Schools. Falkie to submit the
completed application with the bid wil be considered non-
responaive.

C. BID PROPOSAL FORM. Definas requitememn of items to be
purchased, and must be completed and submilled as page 2 and
subssquent pages, If eny, of the bid The bidder should indicate
hisher nama in the appropriate space on each page.

1. ITEM SPECIFICATION. Speacifiing a certain brand, make or
manufacturer is to danote the quality, type, and standard of the
artcls desired. Aricles offerad must be now merchandise only, of

“equidl or supenof grade. On blank Enes provided, the bidder is’

requosted to Insert the brand name, manufacturers number and
othar Information necessary to sufficiently identify article offered.
Failure to do a0 may prevent consideration of the item. Also, refer o
paragraph X. Packaging.

2. PRICES, Frices are raqueated in units of guantity specified in
the bid epecifications. In case of a discrepancy In computing the
lotal amount of bid, UNIT PRICE quoted wil govern, All prices bid
shall include dellvery F.Q.B. deatination, freight prepaid (bidder pays
and beara freight charges. Bidder owns goods In ransit and files
any claima) and shall include all cartage, drayage, packing, eto
delivared to and unloaded &t the rocsiving station at the wite
designated in BID PROPOSAL FORMS and there received by the
designated agent of the Board.

3. TAXES, The Board doss not pay Federai Excige and Stale taxes
on direct purchases of tangible personal property. The applicable
tax exempton number is shown on the purchase order. This
sxemption doss not apply [0 purchazes of tangible personal property
made by contraciors who use the tangibla persanal property in the
performance of contracts for the inprovement of Board-owned real
proparty s deflined in Chapter 192 of the Florkla Statutes.

SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A. BID FORMS AND ENVELOPES. Bids must be submitted on
forma fumished by the Board and in sealed envelopes.

Envelopes must ba clearly marked with bid number, bid titke and bid
opening,

B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When filling out the bid
propoaal farm, bidders are required to complets bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use correction fluid 10 comect an emer.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in nk.

Those bids for individual items that do nat comply with itena 1, 2 and 3
above will be considered nor-rasponsive for that item(s).

C. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids shall be submitied by U.S. Mall,
Courlet/Express Service, or deposited in the BID BOX located in
Room 351, 8:00 AM. to 4:30 P.M., Monday through Friday, SCHOOL
BOARD ADMIMISTRATION BUILDING, 1450 N.E. Second Averws,
Missni, Flotida 23132 Bids recaived atter the dats and hows specified
in the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM will not be considered,

D. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Section 287.133(2){a) Florida Stahste.
A person or affiiate who has been placed on the convicted vendor Ilst
fotlowlng & conviction {or a public entity ¢ritne may not submit a bid on
& contract to provide any goods or services to & public entity, may not
submit a bidd on n contract with a public enlity for the conatruction or
repalr of a public bullding or public work, may not submit bids on
logues of real properly to a public entity, may not be awardad or
perform work as a contractor, suppller, subcontracior, of consultant
under & vontract with any public entity, and may not transact business
with any public enfity in exess of the threehold amount provided in
Section 287.017, for CATEGORY TWO for & periad of 38 months from
the date of being piaced on the convicted vendor sl

E. SUBMITTING A “NO BID* I not submiting a bid at thie time,
relum the torm entifed "MOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS.*
Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or the *NOTICE TO
PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS® form for thres congecutive times, may
reaylt in the company being removed from the School Board's bid kst

F. AVAILABILITY OF BID INFORMATION. following the

public opaning, bids will be road, uponrequest.mdlmmpl.dina
tabular form, a copy of which wil be avaliable for examination In
Procurement Management Servicas.

CANCELLATION OF 8IDS OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

“An'invitation for bids may Ba cancelad, in whola of in part, a8 may be

vpecifiad in the sclicitation, when it ia in the baat interast of the Board,
The reasons shall be made a part of the master bid file.

A. Pror to opening, a solicitation may be cancelad In whole or In part,
prior to the date and hour specified in the Biddar Qualilication Fom for
recelpt of bids, when the Assistant Suparintendsni, Procursment
Managemant Sarvices, determinas in writing, that such action is in the
bast Intareat of the Board for reasons including, but nat limited ta:

1. The Board no longer requires the gupplies, services, or
oonstruction;

The Board no longer can reasonably expect to fund the
procurement;

A review of a valid protest fled by a bidder as may be detssmined
by the administrative steff; or

Propesed amendments to the sdicitaton would be of such
magnitude that a new scicitalion is deeirable.

B. When a sdlicitation ia canceled prior to opening, nolice of
cancsifation shall be sent to all businesses solicited, via (aceimile or
mail, and bids or proposata retumed to the vendor uncpened.

Tha notice of cancellation shall:

1. Idontify the solicitation;

2. Bdslly axplain the reason for cancellation; and

3. Where appropriate, explain that an opportunity will be given to
compete on any future re-solicitation for procurementa of simdar
supplies, senices, of constuction.

> w N
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IV, CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS

a PRIOR TO BID OPENING. Should the bidder desire to change or
withdraw haher bid, hd‘i\o‘d'lll do 30 in willing. This

Managemen
Buliding, prior to date and hour of
the bid numbaer, the bid ttle and !he date the bid is Jus must appear

on the envelope.

ng:l'M. uniges ctherwise spuciied on the "BIPDER QUALIFICATION

€. FAILURE TO ACCEPT BID AWARD. Bidders who, prior to the
Bid Award by The Schact Board of Miami-Dade . Florida,
indicabe that they are unable to accept the bid award shall either;

1. Pay ¥ the Hoard, as liquidsiod damages, sn amount equal v
5% of the it price bid, tmae the quantity, or $10, whichever
amount ie lamger, or

2. Lose oligibifty to ransact new business with the Board for &
pariod of 14 months from the date the Board acis on the
withdrawn bid.

PROTESTS TO CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD
A. The Board shall provide nolice of a decision or intended decision

A RESERYATION FOR REJECTION OR AWARD. Tho Board
resarves the right © reject any or al bide, to walve Imegulardiies or
technicalities. and to request rebide. The Board reserves the right to
awerd on an Individual kem basts, any combination of ems, total low
bid or, ¥ an altemais bid is sccepted, on such lerme ae are apecified
for the aliemate bid, whichever manner is Jn the best interast of the
Board.

B NOTIRCATION OF INTENDED ACTION wil be posted on the
District’s webwite 7-10 days prdor to a regulady echeduled Board
mestng.

C. OFFICIAL AWARD DATE. Awards become officisl upon the
Bowd's formal approval of the award.
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D. PURCHASE ORDERS. Purchase ordem malied 0 succossiyl
biddiera are the cificil natification ko deliver matedals described thersin;
and l\olmonﬂowldlwdﬁwyhlglmnﬂhlndlhd the
order, In the event that the successiul bidder falls to deliver
materialy in accordance with the tems and conditions of the bid
purchass order, the bidder shal be considered to be In default of
contract and subject io the default provistona stated in Instructions i
Biddars, Saction V1. E.

E. DEFAULT. A vendor who falle to perform according bo the ems of
the contract (bid) shall be considered in dofaukt. in the avent of defauk,
which may inciuda, but is not imited to poor

?

when a purchass order has been issued or $100, whishever ia greater
of (2) lose eligiblity to transact new busineas with the Board for a pericd
of 14 montha from date of termination of award by the Board. Bidders
that are determined ineligible may request o hearing pursuant o
Chaglor 120 of the Florkia Statutes, and School Board Rule 6Gx13- 8C-

F. The intent of the bid documents is to include only the written
requiremanis for mateials, aquipment, systems, standards and
anehip for the proper sxecution and completion of the
work by the Bidder. The bid documents shall not be construad 1o create
an snitiernent (o any other acope of work except as specified herein.

VII. PERFORMANCE SECURITY (FOR SBUCCESSFUL BIDDERS ONLY)

A PURPOSE. A performance bond or check may be requirad to
guarantes performance.

B. BONDING COMPANY. Perdormance Bonds shall be written through
a mputable and responsible surety bond mgency licensed v do
businosa In the State of Flodda and with a surely company o
corporation maating both of the following specificationa:

1. Awards Greater than 3300000
A minimum rating in the latest revision of Bast's Insurance Reports of;
Coniract Ampunt hiinimpm Rating by AN, Beat
$ £00,000.01 to § 2,500,000 None
$ 2,600,000.01 to § 5,000,000 B + or NA-3
No Minfmwm Clasa
$ 5,000,000.01 to $10,000,000 A- Clasa IV
- $19.000:0000 1 ormote - - - - - - A OlssV - o

Cument certificate of authority as acceptable surety on Federal Bonds In
accordance with the lateet odtion of the United States Treasury
Depastment Circular 570 sntited “Companies Holding Cestificates of
Authority as Acceptable Sureties on Federal Bonds and as Acceplabls
Rainsuring Companles’ shall be accepted for an amount not sxceeding
the underwiiting imitation thereon,

2 Awyards ot 3300000 or Lese

Bonds shall be wrilten with a surety company or corporation meeting the
qualifications as set fosth in Paragraph VI1L.B. above or the qualificalions
sot forth in seciion 287.0935, Fiorda Statdes,

C. AMOUNT. When required as defined harain, the firm or individual(s)
to whom an award has besn made shall execute and deliver to The
Schoal Board of Miamni- Dade County, Florida, a Performance Bond,
Cashlers/Certifled Check. or squal.

1. Awards loss than $200,000 shall be exempt from performance
security.
2. Performancs security shall not be required, unisss cthorwise defined

in the bid specifications. H performance security in required, it shall
equsal 100% of the award amount.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMANCE SECURITY. Astum to the Awardoe
of hisher cash gecurity, or notification to the Awardes and the bonding
company to canoei the pedormance bord, will be made when ol
goodafearvices have bean accepled and inwoicea have baen approved
for payment

Ravised July 2008



VILSAMPLES

When bid sampiea are required, e buyer will notily bidder to submit
samples of the itemns bid in accordance with the lollowing procedures:

A. Al samples must be identified with the bidder's name, bid number,

with this requirement is noted, said ltlem may be considerad ss beilng
unidentifishie and may not be oligible for consideration in the award
recommuendation.

B. AR samples are to be delivered within 7 calendar days alter
receipt of notification from buyer, unless otherwise stated in the
Spacial Conditions of the bid. || the bidder doas nat submit samplas
by the date and tme indicated by the buyer, the bid submitted for that
ftem may not be considered for award,

€. Bidder must oblain, from Materdals Tesling and Evaluation, a
signed receipt acknowiedging delivery of sasmples. Bldder shall

D. Samplea should be delivarad to the following adidrass:

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION
7040 Weat Flagler Streat
Miaml, Florida 33144
Telsphone Number; 786-275-0780

Mami-Dade County Public Schools will not be responsible for
samples sent (o a localion cther than the location mentioned in the

v

E PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Board will buy no samples and
wiil assuma no cost incidental thereto,

F. METURN OF SAMPLES. Samples not deatroyed in lesting may

he cleimed by unauccesyiul bidders 14 days after bid award date and .

———

by succesaiul bidders 14 days after final payment; but the Board wil
sasume no respanaiblity for sumples not cleimed within the time
spacified, and it Wil pay for no sampleas damaged in testing.

G. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS. II a sample submitted for
doss not comply, the buyer will advise the bidder to contact
Materists Testing and Evalustion for further detals.

SUBSTITUTIONS

Bhould the hidder find It necessary to use a materdsl, squipment,
product or system other than specilied, i biddar shall secure from
the Board, through Procurement Mansgement Sorvices, wiitten
approval for the use ol the altemate materials, aquipment, product of
wystom. The Board Is not obligsted to approve requests for
substiujons and has the diecretion to require the bidder to provids
the materiais as specifiad in the bid documents. in no case shall the
bicddes be enttied to additonal tme and/or money arsing out of the
Board's faliure to approve requests for substiatjions.

PAGCKAGING

A TYPE If packaging is different from that specified, the bidder
must note the manner and amounts in which pachkaging (s to be
made; otherwise the successhd bidder shall fumish packaping ss

®

specified. Al packaging, wrapping

B. CONTAINER IDENTIACATION. The lollowing identficalion shail
bae pinted, slenciled or lagbly written in a conapicuous keallon on each
shipping contalner:

1. BID NUMBER ANDYOR PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER

2. VENDOR'S NAME AND/OR TRADEMARK

3. NAME(S) OF [TEM(S) CONTAINED
4, (TEM NUMBER(S) WITH QUANTITY(IES)

PURCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

With the consent and agreeinsnt of the sucosesful bidder(s}, purchases
may ba made under this bid by Miaml Dade County, Florida, and other
govemmaental agencies or political subdivisions within the Stats of
Florida. Such purchases shall be govemed by the same terms and
condiions alated herein. This agreement in no way resticts or
intectorcs with the dght of any State of Florida Agency or political
subdivision to rebid any or all of these itema.

XII. RECYCLING REQUIREMENTS

Mami-Dade County FPubfc Schoois supports recycling and
recommends the use of recycled products whare possible. Vendors are
requested to aubmit & lotter, along with thelr bid, indicating whether
sach #tem bid and/or its packaging contains pre-consumer or poat-
consumar waste, and if the product and/or packeging may be recycled.

XIIL ENVIRONMENT AL PRODUCTS

Miami-Dade County Public Schools sncoursges Bw use of
erviconmenially safe products.

XIv, DEUVERY AND BILLING

A. DEUVERY. Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays excepiod, deliveries
shal be made ax fclows: Schoola and Depariments - 800 AM. fo
3:.00 P.M. Marchandias shall be unlcaded at the receiving station of
the designated delivery point and received thare by o designated agent
of the Board. A delivery ticket, or one copy of the Invoice, prepared as
indicated below, shall accoompany sach delivery,

8. RECEIVING INSPECTION AND TESTING. Dadlivarsd Rems which
do not iUl all requirements wil be rejected. Rejected itoms shall be
removed and roplaced promptly by the vendor, at no cost 1o the

T puirChape.

C. INVOICES, Each invoice shall be issued by the successtul bidder
and shal be aubmitted in DUPLICATE w the Accounts Payable
Section, P.O. Bax 01-2570, Mami, Florida 33101. To be considersd
for payment, each invoice must show the following information, which
appowrs on the Puchase Crder:

1
2 Item Descriptions
3. Quantities ard Uinits
4. Prce Exansions

5. Total price of all fama on invoice

D. PAYMENT. Unlesa otherwise specified by Miami-Dade County
Public Schools, payment will be mads only after delivery,
Inapeclion, and acoeptance. Payment will be made only to the
sucoweshut bidder, unless otherwise requesiad, In wriling, by the
sucosashul bidder and accepted by Miami-Dade County Public Schaols
Administraton, When bidders are directed to send invoioas to &
achoot, the achool will make directed payment to the bidder.

é

8

XV, NOGRATUITY POLICY

uhhpdbydemanmgmtsﬂvbumuomtw.
gratuiies, or favora of any Wnd, or of any value whatsoever, from
vendors. members of thoir staffe, or famikes.
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XV1. COMPLIANCE WITH STATEFEDERAL REGULATIONS smployses who was previocusly certified as completing he background i

A Al contrects Wwolving federat funds will oontain cartain convicted of any disqualifying cffense. Falfure by Bkider to noty the
provisione required by applicable sections of Tifle 34, Sacion demwmmma?mdmmm
80.38(!) and Section 85.5610 Code of Federal Fegulatons and are nolice and within 5 business days of the oooustence of 8 quallfying
included by reference heveln. The vendor cartifies by signing the bid arvest or oonviction, shall consititrte grounds for immedisie
that the vendor and hisher principals are act pressnily debarred, mrmination of this Agreemeni(isid) by the Board.

syspanded, proposad lor debament, declared Ineligble o

voluntarily  excluded from paricipaon in foderally funded Fajlure by Bidder 10 pedform any of the dulles desceibed in this section
Urahsactions and may, in cortain instances, be required to provide a shall constiute & materal breach of the Agreement (bid) and default
separate written certification 1o this effect. _ sniiing the Board © utilize the provisions of secton V1. E of this bid

Dufing the torm of any contract with the Board, In the event of with ro lurthar responsibility for the Board to makse payment or perform
debarment. suspension, proposed debarment, deciared ineligible or any other dulies under this Agreement (bid}.

voluntarily excluded from paricipation in  federally tunded

transaclions, the vendor shall Immaediately notify the Acsistant XIX. COMPLIANCE WITH SCHOOL CODE

Superntundert, Procurement Managemunt Services, in wiiling.

Vendors wil aleo be required to provide socess to records, which Bidder agress o comply with all sections of the Florida X-20 Educatic
are direcly partinent 1o the contract and rotain ail requirad records Code, Tills XLVII, Florkda Statites &8 # presarily axists, and further ae
for three years after the Board makes final payment. i may be amended from time to time. Fufther Bidder agrees thet lallure
B.  For all oontracts Involving Federal funds in sxcess of $10,000, to mﬂv with "; '1:”' K-20 Education sﬂodomlﬁll mﬂ;mm-
the Board reserves the right 1o terminats the contract for cause, as mal b'-ddm‘ wm('m ay result o
woll as for convenience, by fssuing a certfied notios 16 the vendor. termination Agresimaent (bid) by the Board.

XX CHARTER SCHOOLS

XVIL COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

toma or Services awarded under this contract shall be made avaitable
Bidders shall comply with all federal, stale of Florida and local laws to Chater Scheools approved by the School Board of Mami-Oade
applicable 1 it and the performance of its obligaions undor this County Public Schools. M-DCPS ie not responsible or fable for
bid. purchapes that may be made by Charter Schools.
XvUL BACKGROUND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS XX1. CONFUCT OF INTEREST
in eccordance with the requirements of sections 101232, Miami-Diade Public Schocle employess, classified
1012.486, and 435,04, Florda Statules (2004) as well as With the mdmmhmmﬂ“mmm;
requirements of HB 1677, The Jeesica Lunslord Act (2006}, School Adminisirsiors Associalion, Pay Grade 47 and abowe, and
ofeclive September 1. 2005, Bidder agrees ta certity under cath othet equivalent pasitions, ars prohibited from personally reprenenting
and penaity of perury by completing the altached Swom Statement another person of ently or actng as an agent of attormey for
Pursuant to Sections 1012.32, 1012465, and 435.04, Flonda compensation in connaclion with any matter in which The School
Stalutas {2004) and HB 1877, The Jessica Lunsford Act (2006). Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida, i interosted, for two years after
w“mmwhmwd'mm‘tm“uﬂ the School Board employeos’ sorvics temeinates. Thia provision e
smployoes provide or may provide services unde pursuant to School Board Aule BGX13 — 441,212 and Florida Statule
Agresment have completed all background oorowlno requirements § 112.31%(9).
s outiined in the above-raferenced statules
Additionally, Bidder agress that each of s employess, : e RECORDS LAW
-_— Purmuant to-Florida Statute, it-is the pracice of M-DCFS. -0 make .
available for public inapaction and copying any Information recelved in
response (0 an Invitation to Bid or Request for Propossis (RFP}. No

action on the part of the respondent to a Bid or RFP wili creats an
obligation of confidentiaiily on the part of the Sohcol Board, including
but not kmited to. making & reference in the meponse to the trade
secret stajutes. It & recommended thal potential supplers sxclude

all on e mtm:rpau:mm&ﬂmmmmmmm“ybo

Oidder agrees to bear any and all cosls assocvisted with
Soquiring the required beckground scresning — Including any
oasts associsted with fingerpeinting and obisining the THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE , FLORIDA

requirsments,

and aiso agresing that the empioyse will notlly thw

of any arresifs} or conviction(s) of any

offennas anumeraind I 5. 435,04, Florids Statutse wilthin 48 hours
of its occumence,

Bidder agress 1o provide the Board with & I8t of il of ka smployess
who have completed background acreening as required by the above-
reforonced staties and who mest the stahitory mequiremants
ocontained thersin, Bidder agreee thal % has an ongoing duty to
maintain and updale thees lists a8 new employees are hired snd in the
svent thal any previcusly scresned smployes falls to mest the
stuiutory standards,  Bldder furtther agrees to nolify the Board
Immediately unon bacoming aware tel ons nof Im
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FROM; AFFIX

POSTAGE
HERE

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES
ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2%° AVENUE
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO.: 087-FF06
BID TiTLE: Window Shade Fabric and Accessories
BID OPENING DATE: March 27, 2007




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Procurement Management Services

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID
If not submitting a hid at this time, for informational purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the information requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Qur company does not handle this type of product/service.
We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.

Our company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
QTHER, (Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

. Signature
Title
Company

NOTE: Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may result in

your company being removed from the School Beard's bid list. To qualify as a
respondent te the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID.

e e h e e P



Vendor Information Sheet

1A. 2. Telephone/Fax/Contact Person
Federal Employer [dentification Numbar
Or Telephone number
Owners Social Secunty Number
1B Fax number
Name of Firm, ndividual{s), Partners or Corporation
Coniact Person
Streat Address
City State Zip Code E-mail aodress

3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship,or joint venture, the full legal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director, or owner who holds, directly or indirectly the majority of the
stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with a trust, the full legal name and address shall be provided for
each trustee and each beneficiary. Post add

Race-
Name Title Address Gander  |ethnicity  [Stock Ownenship

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided on the "Vendor's
Application". All vendors must have a current vendor’'s application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be
familiar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: {a) Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free Workplace, (¢) Family Leave
Polncy {d) Code of Busmess Ethics, {e) Conﬂlct of Interest. {h Perception, (g) Gralultles and (h) Bus:ness Meals. Failure to

Vendor appllcatlons can be downloaded at http: l!procurernent dadeschools net '




Miami-Dade County Public Schools
SWORN STATEMENT - NEW CONTRACTS

ATTACHMENT ___
SWORN STATEMENT PURSUANT TO SECTION 1012.465,
FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY
HB 1877, THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT

THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED AND SWORN TO IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY
PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICIAL AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

I This swom statement is submitted to The Schoo} Board of Miami-Dade County, Fl

(Hereinafter “Board” or “School Board™) by

(Print individual’s name and title)

for
(Print Name of entity submitting sworn statement)

whose business address is

and its Federal Employer Identification Number (FEIN) s
. If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security
Number (SSN) of the individual signing this sworn statement and so indicate.

2. I, , am duly authorized to make this
(Print individual’s name and title)
sworn statement on behalf of
(Print Name of entity submitting sworn statement)

3. [ understand that during the 2005 Legislative Session, House Bifl 1877, The Jessica Lunsford
Act (hereinafter “The Act” or “Act™) was passed and approved by Governor Bush on May 2,
2005, with an effective date of September 1, 2005.
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4, 1 understand that the Act amends the background screening requirements of section
1012.465, Florida Statutes (2004) for all non-instructional school district employees or
“contractual personnel” by requiring all non-instructional school district employees or
contractual personnel who are permitted access on school grounds when students are present
to undergo and pass “level 2 background screening,” and further [ understand the Act defines
“contractual personnel” to include any vendor, individual, or entity under contract with the
Board.

5. [ understand that pursuant to section 1012.465, Florida Statutes as amended by the Act, non-
instructional school district employees or contractual personnel who are permitted access on
school grounds when students are present. who have direct contact with students or who
have access to or control of school funds must meet level 2 screening requirements as
described in sections 1012.32 and 435.04, Florida Statutes.

6. 1 understand that as a {eg. a private bus
Type of entity
service contractor) all contractual personnel, as defined in section 1012.465, Florida
Statutes, must meet level 2 screening requirements as outlined in sections 1012.32
and 435.04, Florida Statutes in order to do business with The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

7. I understand that “level 2 screening requirements,” as defined in sections 10i2.32 and
435,04, Florida Statutes means that fingerprints of al! contractual personnel must be obtained
and submitted to the Florida Department of Law Enforcement for state processing and to the
Federal Bureau of Investigation for federal processing.

8. [ understand that the School Board will implement local procedures to comply with level 2
screening requirements, as defined in sections 1012.32 and 435.04. I understand that my
company must comply with these local procedures as they are developed.

9. Funderstand that any costs and fees associated with the required background screening will
be borne by my company.

10. I understand that any personnel of the contractor found through fingerprint processing and
subsequent level 2 background screening to have been found guiity of, regardless of
adjudication, or entered a plea of nolo contendere or guilty to any offense outlined in Section
435.04, Florida Statutes (or any similar statute of another jurisdiction), shall not be permitted
to come onto school grounds or any leased premises where school-sponsored activities are
taking place when students are present, shall not be permitted direct contact with students,
and shall not be permitted to have access to school district funds.
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[l.  lunderstand that the failure of any of the company’s or my affected personnel to meet level
2 screening standards as required by section 1012.4635, Florida Statutes, may disqualify my
company from doing business with The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida.

12. I hereby certify that the foregoing statement is true and correct in relation to the company for
which | am submitting this sworn statement. | further certify that this statement is being
given knowingly and voluntarily by me on behalf of my company.

The company submitting this sworn statement agrees to be bound by the provisions of SECTIONS
1012.32, 1012.465, AND 435.04 OF THE FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY HB 1877,
THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT 2005.

ICERTIFY THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-
DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA ON BEHALF OF THE COMPANY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH
ONE (1) ABOVE BINDS THE COMPANY TO FULLY COMPLY WITH THE BACKGROUND
SCREENING REQUIREMENTS OF SECTIONS 1012.32, 10]12.465. AND 435.04, FLORIDA
STATUTES.

(Signature)

Sworn to and subscribed before me this day or ,20_

Personally known

TTTTTTTTTTTOR Produced Tdenfification T

Notary Public -State of

(Type of Identification)
My commission expires

(Printed typed or stamped commissioned
name of notary public)
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE CAINTY FLORIDA
BiD 08/-FF06 ' BUYER . Jackson PAGE st
SPECIAL-CONBITIONS:

1. PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract, at firm unit prices, for the purchase of window shade
fabric and accessories for Maintenance Materials Management stock. The term of the bid shall be for one year from the
date of award, and may, by mutual agreement between Miami-Dade County Public Schools and the successful
bidder(s), be extended for two (2) additional one (1) year period(s) and, if needed, 30 days beyond the expiration date
of the current contract period. Procurement Management Services, may if considering to extend, request a letter of
intent to extend from the successful bidder(s), prior to the end of the current contract period. All prices shall be firm for
the term of the contract. The successful bidder(s) agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

2. AWARD: Contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder(s) meeting specifications.

3. ESTIMATED QUANTITIES: The estimated quantities provided in the bid proposal are for bidder's guidance only. No
guarantee is expressed or implied, as to quantities that will be used during the contract period. The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida is not obligated to place an order for any given amount, subsequent to the award of this
bid. Estimates are based upon M-DCPS'’s actual needs and usage during a twelve (12) month period, and include an
additional ten percent to cover unanticipated increases in requirements.

4. SPECIFICATIONS: if an item is to be considered as an equal to the specified item, complete technical specifications,
together with illustrative materials providing brand name and model number of the item, are requested to accomgang
bid. Non-complignce with this condition may cause the item not-to be considered for award.

5. BRAND NAME OR EQUAL: Theuseofa manufacturer's brand name, trade name; or mode! is for reference purposes
~----  -only-and shouidnot be-interpreted asastatement-of preference: Bids with be-avcepted-onthese and comr:arabls T
’ products, provided the quiality of the product meet or exceed the quality of the products listed.

8. DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made as soon as possible, but not later than 30 days after receipt of the purchase
order.

DELIVER TO:

Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Maintenance and Materials Management
12525 NW 28t Avenue
Miami, FL 33167
Telephone (305} 995-7770

7. WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be for one
year or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater. The successful vendor will be responsible for repairing each unit
during the warranty period, at no cost to the Board. Vendor agrees to repair and retum equipment within five (5) days
from receipt of request or provide a temporary replacement.




MAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A} TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COINTY FLORIDA

BUYER PAGE
087-FF06 G. Jackson SC2

Window Shade Fabric and Accessofies

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

8. UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unauthorized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination. Vendors shall be considered in default of the contract and shalt lose eligibility to transact new business
with the Board for a period of fourteen (14) months from the date of termination by the Board.

9. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS: When filling out the bid proposal form, bidders are requested to use atypewriter or
complete bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use cofrection fluid to comect an error.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item(s).

10.  VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: All bidders are requesied to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor{s) have a current vendor application on
fle. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
vendoi(s) not be awarded any new business.  Vendor applications can _be downloaded at ... ..
- - fittpprocorement dadeschoolsael

11.  OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County's Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 8A, Article X of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a location outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested to be submitied
with the bid proposal, If the bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required white the
license is valid and in effect. It is the bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after expiration or
termination of the current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to be considered for
award.

12.  CONE OF SILENCE: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this solicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or information
regarding this bid must be requested in writing by FAX or E-mail to:

Mr. Greg Jackson, Buyer
Procurement Management
Fax #305-523-2214

E-mail: giackson@dadeschools.net




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID PROPQSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TQ: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE CANTY FLORIDA
BIiD BUYER PAGE
087-FF06 G. Jackson SC3

Window Shade Fabric and Accessories

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously to:

lleana Martinez, School Board Clerk
Miami-Dade County Public Schools

1450 N.E. 27 Avenue, Room 2688

Miami, Florida 33132

Fax #305-995-1448

E-mail; marlinez@dadeschools.net

13.  BID ADDENDUMS: All bidders should monitor continuously, the M-DCPS, Procurement website, for any addendums
that may be posted, prior to the opening of this solicitation. The procurement website, which list all bids, addendums,
and award information, is as follows: http:/iprocurement dadeschools.net, (ctick} bid solicitation,

14.  CREDIT CARDS: Maintenance Materials Management may place some orders and utilize, as the form of payment, a
District-issued credit card, to the extent authorized by the School Board. These orders will be made via phone or fax
for direct delivery and billing to the requesting work location. Please note that credit card purchases will benefit
all_vendors_by providing immediate payment (ie.. within 48-72 hours).. thereby efiminating. the need. o submit. . ..

"~ ""an invoice o the District's Accounts Payable Department or reconcile receivable balances. For credit card
purchases, alt vendors must have the capability to accept fax orders, which must be confirmed by caliing back

the requesting work location to verify prices and obtain a credit card number.

Only actual items shippedidelivered can be charged to the credit card account (i.e., no back-orders). All purchase
deliveries must include a packing slip or receipt/invoice fisting the items and prices of goods delivered. For security
reasons, the credit card charge receipt showing the work location's credit card number cannot be attached to the
packing slip or receipt/invoice submitted as part of the purchase delivery. District work locations may request that a
vendor maintains secure records of the credit card account assigned an alias or password, to avoid divulging the actual
card number upon every purchase.




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #087-FF06
Window Shade Fabric and Accessories

e:Window Shade Fabric and Accessories
Buyer: G. Jackson

PLEASE COMPLETE

ALL SHADED AREAS

1573

equal.

ESTIMATED PRICE PER | MANUFACTURER & MODEL
ITEM[ DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT NUMBER
NDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
JARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR_
o | s Cord, shade, w/fiberglass core #5,5/32", cotton, nat. 21 RL
0003 leolor (500yd/rl) C-Mort #5 or equal.
Fabric, shade, aqua mist, 4 ply fiberglass, 72" wide,
2 | o530 [30 yds/rl, 72" x 30 yards, washable, flame retardant. | 40 | RL
Butler 943 or equal.
Fabric, shade, light peach, 4 ply fiberglass, 72" wide,
3 { oo |30 ydsirl. 72" x 30 yards, washable, flame retardant. | 22 | RL
Butler 979 or equal.
Fabric, shade, fed. slate blue, 4 ply fiberglass, 72"
a | a5+ twide, 30 yds/tl, 72" x 30 yards, washable, flame 39 |RL
retardant. Butler 935 or equal.
495 . [|[Roller, shade, wood 1-1/4 Dia. 55" long singie notch.
* | 188 lc-Mor 1314555 or equal, 2275 | BA
s | 955 Roller, shade, wood 1-1/4 Dia, 73-1/4 In, single 125 EA
WIT Inotch. C-Mor 1314738 or equal.
-9 - 495.- {Slat _shade fir wedge 1-34x9.8 50pk. . . . - st ead
1085 RC-Mor 30129 or equal.
s | 45 Slat, shade, wedge shaped, 1-1/2" wide 3/8 + 3/16 1900 EA
083 lthick edge 54" [n. C-Mor 301254 or equal,
o | %% jCord, sash, #8,200 ft. Duraline #08 or equal. 73 | HK
485. [|Pully, velvet lock, metal step pully 100/pk.
1 811 foMor 24SP or equal. 180 EA
N ER Bracket, shade, spring end, double, outside mount 43
1620 {100 per order. C-Mor 186 ot equal.
Fabric. shade, #68 tan, fiberglass matte, 30 yds/rl,
12 | o3y 172" x 30 yards, 72" wide, washable, flame retardant. 20
Butler 929 or cqual.
y3 | 408 [Cord, sash, #10 gauge, 100' HK Norman #10 or 56
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