THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
SCHOOL EQARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING

1450 Northeast Second Avenue

Miami, FL 33132

Direct all inguiries to Procuremant Managemenl

Miaimi-Durds County Pbiie Sehaals

Servicas:
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM e
BID NO, 086-GG06 L (3. Jackosn

E-MAIL ADDRESS. Alackson@dadeschools.nel
PHONE: (305) 995-2345

Fax NUuMBER 305-523-2214

TOD PHONE (305) 995-2400

BID TITLE Pest Control Supplies

Bids will be accepted until 2200 PMon ___ August 14, 2007 in room 351, School Board Administration building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue Miami FL 33132, at which ime they will be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for __ 120 days after opening
{Refer 1o Instructions to Bidders, para IV.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BID BY THE SCHOOL BOARD OF
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL
CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BID DOCUMENTS, NO
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED.

I A BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION

| cerify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreemenl, or connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same malenals, supplies, or equipment, and s in all respects fair and without collusion
or fraud | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid, and | certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder,

B \Vandor cerifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requiremants as an enlity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

i INDEMMIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold harmiess, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hereinafter defined) against any claim, action, 1oss,
damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, bul not by way of limitation, attorney's fees and
court costs ansing out of bodily injury to persons, including death, or damage to tangible property ansing out of or incidental to
the pariormance of this Contract (including goods and semvices provided thereto) by or on behalf of the Brdder, whether or not
due 1o or caused in part by the neghigence or other culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sole negligence or culpability
of the indemnity. The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and ils
members, officers and employees

i PERFORMANGE SECURITY, is required on thisbid. ~ YES 1 No [
Refer o INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. VI, and V1.
IF PERFORMANGE SECURITY 1S REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Performance Bond [:I Check (Cashier's, Cerlified, or equal) I:l

An original, manual signature is required on the Bidder Qualification Form.
{Bidder is requested to use blue ink)
(Do not use pencil)

Legal Name of Vendor _
Mailing Address
City State
Telephone No. E-mail address

By: Signature (Qriginal)

Of Authorized Representalive
Name (Typed or Printed)

Of Authorized Representative _

FM-3191 Rev. (01-04)
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INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

MOTICE OF ESTABLISHMENT OF A COME OF SILENCE

The School Board of MiamkDade County Public schools enacls a Cona
frown ksuanca of a solicitation o writlen recommendation of

award, All provisions of School Board Rule BGx1 3-BC-1.212 apphy.

I. PREPARATION OF BIDS

A. BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM qualifies the bidder and the
bid and must be completed and submitted as page 1 of the bid

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY. The form of perfarmance sacurity
ihe bidder will submil, whan required to do so, must be furnished.
Performance securily shall not be submitted wilh the bid

2. BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION, Bld must
contain an  original manual  signature from an  authorzed
reprasentative. An unsigned bid will be considered NON-Fesponsve,

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines canditions of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any mconsistancy In this bid shall
be resohed by giving precedence in the following order.

A, Specfications
B Special Condiions
. Instructions To Bidders

2. FOR M/WBE designated bids. The SPECIAL CONDITIONS-
Minority/Woman owned and controlied Business Participation
Slalement and the MAWBE Cerificalion Application MUST be
cmﬂﬁﬂﬁlﬂﬂiﬂﬂwﬂﬂnbﬂﬂth&hﬁﬁerhnﬂtmtﬁﬁbﬂ
by Miami-Dada County Pubhc Schools.  Faflure lo submil tha
:ormi&lndnppﬂrjﬂnnwﬂhihebid'ﬂﬂlhiMMIednm-
responsive

C. BID PROPOSAL FORM. Defines requirement of dems 10 be
purchased, and must be compleled and submitied as page 2 and
subsequent pages, if any, of Ihe bid. The bidder should indicate
his/her mame in the appropriale space on each page.

1. ITEM SPECIFICATION. Specifying & cedain brand, make or
manufacturer is lo denole the qualty, type, and standard of the
adicle desired. Aricles offered must be new merchandise only, of
equal or superor grade.  On blank lines provided, the bidder is
requestad o inser (he brand name, manufaclurers number and
other information necessary to sufficiently ientify aricle offered,
Failure to do 50 may prevent consideration of the item. Alza, refer o
paragraph X. Packagmg

2. PRICES. Prices are requasted in unils of quantity spacified in
the bid spechcalions. In case of @ discrepancy n computing the
total smount of bid, UMIT PRICE guoted will govern, Al prices bed
shall include delivery F.0.B. destination, freight prepald (bidder pays
and bears freight charges. Bidder owns goods In transil and fikes
any clams) and shall include all canage, drayage, packing, elc.,
dalivered o and unloaded sl the recaiving station al the site
designated in BID PROPOSAL FORMS and there received by the
designated agent of the Board.

3. TAXES. The Board does nol pay Federal Excise and State taxes
on difect purchases of langible personal property. The apphicabile
tax exemption number s shown on the purchase order. This
exemplion does not apply 1o purchasas of tangible personal propety
made by coniraciors who usa tha tangible personal property in the
performance of contracts for the improvement of Board-owned real
property &s defined in Chapter 192 of the Flonda Statutes.

1. SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A. BID FORMS AND ENVELOPES. Hexds must be submitted on
forms fumished by the Board and in sealed packages of envelopes.
B submssions must be claarly marked with bid number, bid title
and bid opening date,

Page 1

B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When filling out the bid
proposal form, bidders are raquired o complete bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase of use correction fuid to correct an emror.
3 Al changes must be crossed oul and indiaked in ink

Thasa bids for individual iterms thal do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3
above will be considered non-responsive for that Remds).

C. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids shall be submitted by U.S. Mail,
Courier/Express Senice, of deposiled in the BID BOX located in Room
351, BOD AM. to 430 PM., Monday through Friday, SCHOOL
BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 1450 N.E. Second Avenue,
Miami, Florida 33132, Bids received after the dale and hour specified
in the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM will not ba conskdered,

0. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Section 287.1332)(a) Florida Stalule.
A person or affliale who has been placed on the convicted wendor kel
following @ conviction for a public antity crime may not subirmil a bid on
a contract to provide any goods or sarvicas o a public enbty, may nol
submit @ bid on & conlract with a public entity for the construction o
repalr of @ pubhc building of public werk, may not submit bids on
leases of real properly o a public antity, may nol be awarded or
perform work 83 a conbractor, supplier, subcontractor, or consullant
under a contract with any public entity, and may not lensad busmess
with any public entity in excess of tha threshold smount provided in
Section 287.017, for CATEGORY TWO for a period of 38 months fram
the dale of being placed on the convicled vendor Ist

E. SUBMITTING A "NO BID." Il not submitting 8 bid al this time,
return the form eniitled "MOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS.”
Failure o respond, either by submitting a bed or the “"NOTICE TO
PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS™ form for Whree consecutive times, may
resull in the company being removed from the School Board's bid lisl.

F. AVAILABILITY OF BID INFORMATION. Immadiately following the
public opening, bids will be read, upon request, and then compiled in @
labular form, a copy of which will be available for examination in
Procuremen Management Services.

CANCELLATION OF BIDS OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

An invitation for bids may be canceled, in whole of In parl, as may be
gpecified in the sohciation, when it is in tha bast inlerest of the Boand
The reasons shall be made a part of the master bid file.

A. Prior lo opening, a solicitation may be canceled in whole of in part,
priar to the date and hour specified in the Bidder Qualification Fom fiof
recelpt of bids, when the Assistant Superinlendent Procuremant
Management Services, determinas in wriling, that such achon & in the
bast intarest of the Baand for reasans including, bul not fimited 100

1. The Board no longar requires the supphes, safvicas, of
construction,

2. The Board no longar can reasonably expect lo fund the
procurement;

3. A review of a valid prolest fled by a bidder as may be delemmined
by the administrative staff, or

4. Propesed amendments to the solckation would be of such
magnitude that a new solicitation is desirabke

8. When a soficiation is canceled priod lo opening, nolice of
cancallation shall be posted on the District's website, and senl 1o all
businesses solicied, via facsimie or mail. Any bids o proposals
received for the cancelled solicitation shall be retumed Lo the vendor
unopened.

The notie of cancallation shal:

1. ldentify the solicitation;

2. Boefly explain the reason for cancellation; and

3. Where approprale, explain |hal an opponunity will be gven lo

compete on any future re-solicitation for procurements of similar
supplies, services, or conslruchon

Revised June 2007
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CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS

A, PRIOR TO BID OPENING. Should the bidder desire 1o change o
wilhdraw his/her bid, hefshe shall do so in wriling.  This
communication i to ba recefved by Ihe Distridd Direclor, of
Procurement Managemant, Room 352, School Board Adminisiration
Buildmg, prior 1o date and hour of bid opening. The bidders name,
the bed number, the bid title and the date the bid is due musl sppear
on lhe envelope.

B. AFTER BID QPEMNING. Afiar bids are opened, they may nol be
changed, nor wilhdrawn, for 80 days afler the determined opening
date, unless olherwise specified on the "BIDDER QUALIFICATION
FORM.®

C. FAILURE TO ACCERT BID AWARD. Didders who, prior to the
Bid Award by The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Flonda,
indicate that they are unable 1o accept he bid award shall aither:

1. Pay to the Board, as bquidated damages, an amount #qual to
5% of the unil price bid, limes the quantity, ar $10, whichever
amaunt is larger, or

2. Lose eligibifity lo transad new business with the Board for a
pariod of 14 months from the date the Board acls on the
withdrawn bad.

PROTESTS TO CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD

A. The Board shall provide notica of a decision or inlended decision
conceming a soclation, contract award, or exceplional purchase by
ekecironic posling which can be accassed at the district's website
o d hi ;

B. Any parson who is adversely affected by the agency decizian or
niended decision shall fle with the agency @ nolice of protest in
wiiling within 72 hours afer the posling of the notice of decision or
intended decision, With respact to a protest of the terms, condilions,
and specifications contained in a solicitation, including any provisions
govering lhe methods of ranking bids. proposals, or replies,
gwanding contracts, feserving nights of further negoliation, of
modifying or amending any confracl, the nolice of prolest shall be
filed in writing within 72 hours afler the posling of the solicitation. The
formal written prolest shall be filed within 10 days after the dale the
notice of protest s fled  The formal written protest shall stale with
particularity the facts and law upon which the prolesl is based
Saturdays, Sundays, and state holidays shall be excluded in the
computation of the 72-hour time periods established herein,

C. The protesting pary shell be reguired to- post a hond
congistent with F.A.C, Rula 28-110.005(2), snd Board Rule 3C
1.11. Failure to file @ prolest within the tima prescribed in
Saction 120.57(3), Flarida Siatutes, or feilure 1o post the bond or
other security requirad by law within the time aflowad for filing &
bond shall cengtituta 8 welver of procecdings under Chaptar 120,
Florida Statutes.

0. Fomal, writtan prolests will be reviewsd by Procurement
Management Services, who will offer lhe protesting bidder the
opporunity to mesl and discuss the merits of the prolest If the
protes! is not resabved, tha bidder may seek an adminisliative hearing

M 1o §12057 Fla. Stat Petitions for hearing pursuant (o
§120.57 Fla Stat., must be filed in accordance with School Board
Ruke 6Gx13- BC-1,064

AWARDS

A. RESERVATION FOR REJECTION OR AWARD. The Board
reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to wane imegulantes or
lechnicalities, and 1o request mbids. The Doard reserves the right to
gward on an individual item basis, any combination of items, lotal low
bid o, if an allemale bid is accepted, on such tems a3 are speced
for the alemale bid, whichever mannar is in the best interest of the
Board.

The Board reserves the rght to ulilize cther govemmental conlracts, if
in the besl interest of the Board.

B. MOTIFICATION OF INTENDED ACTION will ba posted on the
Distric’s websie no laler lhan Whe Friday precading a regulardy
scheduled Board meeting.

ViL.
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C., OFFICIAL AWARD DATE. Awards become official upon the
Board's formal approval of the award.

0. TERMINATION FOR CONVEMIENCE

The Board reserves the nght lo ferminate this contract at any time and
for any reason upon giving thirty (30) days’ notica 1o the other party. H
said contract shoukd ba tarminated for convanience as provided herein,
the Board will be releved of all obligations undar said contract. The
Board will only be required to pay thal amount of the contract actually
performed to the date of tarmination. Upon such paymant, boith pariias
shall be relieved of any further abfigations undar this contract

E. PURCHASE ORDERS. Purchase orders mailed o successhul
biddars are the official notification o deliver materials described tharein,
and the time allowed for dalivary begins with the date of the purchase
ordar,  In the avent that the successhul bidder feils to deiver Lhe
matenals in accordance with the terms and conditions of the bid and
purchase order, the bidder shall ba considered o be in defaull of the
contract and subject to the defaull provisions slated in Instructions 1o
Brdders, Section Y. G.

F. DEFALLT. A vandor who fails to perdomm according to the terms of
the contract (bid) shall ba considered in dafault. In the event of defauli,
which may include, but is not limited to poor performance andfor non-
pedormance, a vandor shall either (1) pay liquidaled damages of 10
percent of the unit price of the Rem(s) ewarded times the gquanity when
no purchase order has been issued, 10 percent of Ihe purchase order
when a purchase order has been issued or 3100, whichever 15 grealer
of (2} lose eligibility to transact new business with the Board for a period
of 14 menths from date of lermination of award by the Board, Bidders
that are determined ineligicle may requesl a heanng pursuanl lo
Chapter 120 of the Florida Slatutes, and School Board Rule 6Gx13- 8C-
1.064

G. The intent of the bid documents is to include only lhe written
requirernents  for malerials, equipment, systems, slandards and
workmanship necessary for the proper execulion and complation of the
work by the Bidder. The bid documents shall not be construed 1o creale
an entitiement 1o any olher scope of work excepl as specified harein

PERFORMAMCE SECURITY (FOR SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS ONLY)

A, PURPOSE. A pedomnmance bond of check may be fequired to
guarantee perfomance,

B. BONDING COMPANY. Performance Bonds shall be writlen thiough
a reputable and responsible surety bond agency licensed lo do
business in tha State of Florde end wilh a surely company of
comaration meating both of the fokowing specificalrons:

1. Awards Groater than $500,000
A mimamum rating in the latast revision of Best's Insurance Reports of.
Confract Amourt ni i A

§ 500,000.01 to § 2,500,000 Hone
$ 2,500,000.01 to % 5,000,000 B+ or HNA-3

Ho Minimum Class
$ 5,000,000.01 to $10,000.000 A- Class IV
$10.000,000.01 or more A- Class WV

Current certificate of aulhonty as acceptable surety on Federal Bonds in
accomdence wilh the lalest eddion of the Unked Stales Treasury
Department Circular 570 enldled "Companies Holding Cenficales of
Authority es Acceplable Sureties on Federal Bonds and as Acceplable
Reinsuring Companies® shall be accapted for an amount nol exceeding
{he: underwiiting imitation therean.

2. Awgrds of $500,000 or Less
Bonds shall be wiitten wilth @ surely company of corporation mesling the

gualifications as sel forlh in Paragraph V11 B above or the qualilicalions
sat farth in section 287.0935, Florda Statutes.

C. AMOUNT. When required as dafinad herain, the firm or individual(s)
to whom an award has bean made shall axecule and delver to The
School Board of Miami- Dade County, Florida, a Performance Bond,
Cashiers/Cerified Chack, or equal

Reviged Juna 2007



1. Awards lsss than 5200,000 shall be exempl from pedormance
Securiy

7 Pedormance securty shall nol be mquined, unless otherwise
gefined in tha bid speciications. N performance secunty is requined, il
shall squal 100% of the award amounl.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMAMCE SECURITY. Retum 1o the
Awardes of his/her cash security, or nolification 1o the Awardee and
the bonding company to cancel Ihe performance bond, will be made
when all goods/services have been accepled and invoicas have basan
appraved for paymant

YIIL.SAMPLES

When bid samplas are reguired, the buyer will nolify Didder 10 submit
samphes of the ftems bid in accordance wilh the following procedures:

A. All samplas must be kenlified with the bidder's name, bid numbar,
flem number, and product name and numbar. Where non-compliance
with this requirement is noted, said ilem may be considered as baing
umdentifiable and may not be eligible for consideration in the award
recommendation

B. Al samples ame lo be deliversd within 7 calendar days afler
receipl of nolification from buyer, unless otharwize slated in the
Spacial Conditions of the bid. If the bidder does nol submit samples
by the dale and time indicated by the buyer, the bid submitied for that
item may nol be considered for award

C. Bidder must obtain, from Malenals Testing and Evalualion, a
signed recespl acknowledging delivery of samples. Bidder shall
include 2 sell-addressed, stamped envelope for return of sample
receipl when submitting camples by mail or delivery service. The
bidder will receivie the onginal copy of the receipl and Ihe duplicale
copy will remain with the Miami-Dade Counly Public Schools
receiving depanmenl as lhe file copy.  Bidder shall be solely
responsible for delivery of samples and for relaining sample delivery
receipts, which must be presanted in any dispule regarding receipl of
bid samples.

0. Samplas should be delivered lo the following addrase:

MLAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION
T040 Wesl Flagier Sireat
Miami, Flonda 33144
Telephone Number TB6-275-0780

Miami-Dade County Public Schools will nol be responsibde for
samples sant fo a kocalion other Ihan the location mentioned in the
b

E. PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Board will buy no samples and
will assume no cost incklental thereto,

F. RETURN OF SAMPLES. Samples not destroyed in lesting may
be claimed by unsuccessiul bidders 14 days after bid award date and
by successful bidders 14 days afler fmal payment; but the Board will
assume na responsibility for samples nol climed within the fime
spectfied, and & will pay for no samples damaged in 1esting.

G. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS. If a sample submitted for
testing doas not comply, the buyer will advise the bidder lo contact
Matenals Testing 8nd Evaluation for further delails

IX. SUBSTITUTIONS

Should the bidder find it necessary o use a maleral, equipment,
poduct or systam ather than specified, the bidder shall secure from
the Board, through Procurement Managemen] Senices, written
approval for the usa of the sllemate malerials, equipment, product or
systam. The Board &5 nol obiigated lo approve requesls for
substitulions and has the discretion lo require the bidder to provide
ihe materials as specified in the bid docpmenis. In noe case shall the
bidder be entiled o additional time andior money anising out of he
Board's failure to approve requasts for substitutions.
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X. PACHAGING

A. I packaging is different from thal specified, the bidder must note the
manner and amounts in which packaging s To be made; olherwise 1ho
successful bidder shall fumish packaging 85 specified. AR packaging,
wrapping and bundling shall be adoguale 10 nsure thal malenals will be
recetved in undameged condition. The Board assumes no fesponsdbility
for damages of any kind incurmed n transi

B. The following identification shall be printed, stenciled or legibly
wrilen in a conspicudus lacation on each shipping container:

1. BID NUMBER AND/OR PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
2. VENDDR'S NAME ANDIOR TRADEMARK

3 MAME(S) OF ITEM{S) CONTAINED

4. ITEM NUMBER(S) WITH QUANTITY(IES)

X1. PURCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

With the consent and agreement of the successful bidder(s), purchases
may be made under his bid by Miami Dade County, Florida, and ather
governmenial agencies o polilical subdivisions within the Stale of
Flarida. Such purchases shall be govemned by lhe same terms and
conditions stated herein.  This agreement n no way resincls of
inlerderes with the right of any Stale of Florida Agency or political
subdivision 1o rebid any or all of thase items.

X, RECYCLING REQUIREMENTS

Miami-Dade Counly Public Schools suppords rfecycling  and
recommends the use of recycled products where possibis. Vendors are
requesied to submid @ letler, along with their bid, indicating whather
each ilem bid andior ds packaging conlains pre-Consumer of posl-
consumer waste, and i the produd andior packaging may ba recyched.

X111 ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCTS

Miami-Dade County FPublic Schocls encoursges the wse of
environmantally safe products.

X1V. DELIVERY AND BILLING

A. DELIVERY. Satwrdays, Sundays, and holidays excepled, deliveries
shall be made as follows: Schools and Departments - 8:00 AM. fo
.00 P.M. Merchandise shall be unloaded al Ihe recening station of
the designated delivery point and receved there by a designated agent
of the Board. A delivery ticket, or one copy of the invoice, prepared as
indicatad batow, shell sccompany each delrvery,

B. RECEIVING INSPECTION AND TESTING. Delivared itams which
do not fulfill gl reguirements will be rejected.  Rejecied tems shall ba
removed and replaced promplly by the vendor, at no cost o the
purchaser.

C. INVOICES. Each imvoice shall be issued by the successful bidder
and shall be submitted in DUPLICATE 1o the Accounts Payabie
Section, P.O. Box 01-2570, Miami, Florida 33101, To ba considersd
for payment, each invoice must show the following infermation, which
appears on the Purchase Qrder;

Purchase Order Mumber

ltem Descriptions

Quanlites and Linds

Price Extensions

Tolal price of all dems on invaics

L

D. PAYMENT. Unless otherwise specified by Mami-Dade County
Public Schools, paymenl will be made only after delivery, authorized
inspection, and acceplance. Payment will be made only fa the
succassful bidder, unless olherwise requesied, n wiling, by the
succassful bidder and accepled by Miami-Dade County Public Schooks
Administration. When bidders are direcled 1o $end invoces fo a
school, the school will make direcled payment 1o Ihe bidder.

XY, NO GRATUITY POLICY
It is the policy of Procurement Management Senvices nol 10 accept gifts,
gratuities. or favors of any kind, or of any value whatsosves, fram
vendors, members of their staffs, or families.
Revised June 2007
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XVI. COMPLIANCE WITH STATE/FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A, Al contiacts involving federal funds will contsin ceriain
provisions requied by applicable sections of Tile 34, Section
80.36(1) and Saction 85.510 Code of Federal Regulations and are
included by referance herein. The vendor cerlifies by signing the bid
that the vendor and hisher principals are not presently debarmed,
suspended, proposed for debarmant, declared neligible o
volurlarily excluded from padicipstion in  federally funded
transactions and may, in carain instances, be required Lo provide a
separale wiillen carification 12 this effect

During the term of any cantract with the Board, in the event of
debarmenl, suspension, proposed debarmenl, declared ineligible of
voluntanly excluded from paricipation in federally funded
transactions, the vendor shall immedialely nolify the Ascistant
Superntendent, Procurement Managemenl Services, in writing.
Vandors will also be required to provide access lo records, which

are directly pertinent 1o the contract and retain all required records -

far threa years afler the Boarnd makes final payment.

B. For all conlracls involving Federal funds in excess of $10,000,
{ha Board reserves the night (o terminate the conbract for cause, as
well as for convanience, by issuing a cadified notice to the vendor.

XV1l. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

Bidders shall comply with ail federal, state of Florida and local laws
applicabla to it and lhe performance of its obligations under this
bid.

xVIil. BACKGROUND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS

In sccordance with the requirements of seclions 101232,
1012455, and 435.04, Flarida Statules (2004) as well as with the
requirements of HB 1877, The Jessica Lunsford Adl (2005),
effective Seplember 1, 2005, Bidder agrees o cerify under oath
and penalty of perjury by compheting the attached Swom Statémant
Pursuant to Sections 1012.32, 1012.465, and 43%.04, Florida
Stalules (2004) and HB 1877, The Jessica Lunsiord Act {2005},
which is incorporated fully herain by reference, Ihat Bidder and all
of s employses who provide or may provide scrvicas under 1his

have completed all background screaning requirements
as outlined in the above-referenced statutas

fry SOl 04, Flgrida Slgfulas,
furthar upon oblaining level 2 cearance, mus! oblein @ required
Board issued pholo ienlification badga which shall be won by the
individual al all Emes while on Board proparly when students are
prasant.

Biddaer agrees lo bear any and all cosls assooaled with acquinng
the requied backgound screaning - including any casls
associated with fingerpinting and obtaining the roquired photo
idantification badge. Bidder agrees [o require all ils affected
employees [0 50 o stalement, 8z & condilion of employment with
Bidder in relation fo performance under this Agreamant (bid),
agreaing that the amployee will abide by the heretofors described
background screaning requirements, and also agrealng thal the
omployes will nolify the BiddewEmployer of any amesi(s) or
conviction(s) of any offense enummmied in & 435.04, Florda
Statutes within 48 hours of ils occurrenca

Biddar agreas lo provide the Board with a list of 8l of its employees
wha have completed background screening as required by the sbove-
referanced stalules and wha mest the stelulory requirements
contained thersin, Bidder agrees thet K has an ongoing duty 1o
mainlain and update thasa Esls a3 new employees are hired and In the
ovend thal any previously screened employee faile to mest the
stallory standards.  Bidder further egrees to nolify the Board

pagas

immedialely upon becoming aware that one of its employees who was
previously ceried as completing the background chack and meseting tha
statutory slandards 5 subsequenlly amested o convicled of any
disqualifying offense. Failure by Bidder lo nolify the Board of such ames!
o conviction within 48 hours of baing put on nolice and wilhin 5 business
days of the cocumanca of a qualifing ames! or comvclion, shell conshitule
grounds for immediale termination of this Agreamaeniibid) by the Board.

Failure by Bidder o perform any of the duties described in this seciion
shall constitute a materal breach of tha Agreement (bid) snd defeul
enldiing the Board 1o utilize tha provisions of section V1. E of this bid as
well as enlitling the Board to terminete the Agreement(bid) mmediately
with no further responsibility for the Board lo make payment or parform
any other duties under this Agreement (bid).

XIX. COMPLIANCE WITH SCHOOL CODE

Bidder agrees to comply wilth all sections of the Flonda K-20 Education
Code, Title XLV, Flodda Statuies a5 il presently axists, and funther as
# may be amended from tima o bme, Further Bidder agrees that falui
lo comply wilh the Florida K-20 Educalion Code shall consttule @
material bieach of this Agresmant (bid) end may resull in the
termingtion of this Agreement (bid) by the Board.

XX, CHARTER SCHOOLS

tems or Services awarded under this contract shall be made available
to Charter Schools approved by lhe School Board of Mami-(ade
County Public Schools. M-DCPS Is not responsible or liable for
purchases thal may be made by Charter Scheols.

XX1. CONFLICT OF INTEREST

Former Miami-Dade County Publc Schools employees, classified as
Managerial Exempl Personnel, Pay Grade 22 end above, Dade Counly
School Administrators Asgociation, Pay Grade 47 end ebove, and
othar equivalenl posilions, are prohibited from personally reprasenting
snother person or enlity of acting @3 an agenl or attormey for
compensalion n connection with any matler in whioi o Schogl
Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida, is inlerested, for two years afier
ihe School Board employees’ sarvica terminaies. This provisaon is
pursuant to School Board Rule 6Gx13 — 4A-1.212 and Florda Statule
§ 112.31349).

XXJl. PUBLIC RECORDS LAW

Pursuant to Florida Stelute, # is the practics of M-DCPS to make
available for public inspection and copying any information received in
responsa 1o an Invitation lo Bid or Request for Proposals (RFFP). Na
action on the part of the respondent lo a Bid or RFP will creale an
obligation of confidentiality on the pan of the School Board, including
but nat fimiad to, making @ reference in tha response lo the trade
secret statutes. It is recommended that potential suppliers exclude
from thalr response any nformaton that, in thek judgmenl, may be
considared a trade secral.

THE.SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Revised Juna 2007



FROM:

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES
ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2"° AVENUE
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO - _UB‘G-GGUE»

AFFIX
POSTAGE
HERE

BID TITLE: Pest Control Supplies

BID OPENING DATE: August 14, 2007




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Procurement Management Services

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID

If not submitting a bid at this time, for informational purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the information requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE |5 NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED.

Our company does not handle this type of product/service.
We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.
Qur company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
OTHER, (Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

Signature
Title
Company

NOTE

Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may result in

your company being removed from the School Board's bid list. To qualify as a
respondent to the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID.



Vendor Information Sheet

i

~ 3’ MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, PUALIC SEHODLS

1A. _ - N 2. Telephone/Fax/Contact Person
Federal Employer ldentificatian Number
Or Telaphane number
Crwnier's Social Secunty Number
1B. Fax number
Hame of P, Indridual(s), PARNErs of Corporation
Contact Person
Streat Address
City State Zip Code E-mail address

3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship,or joint ventura, the full legal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director, or owner who halds, directly ar indirectly the majority of the
stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with a frust, the full legal name and address shall be provided for
sach trustee and each beneficiary Post Office addresses are not acceplable.

Race-
Name Tille Agdress Gender  (ethnicily | Stock Ownership

NOTE; The information provided by the vendor on this form should ba consistent with that provided on the “Vendor's
Application”. All vendors must have a current vendor's application an file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be
familiar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: (a) Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free Workplace, (c) Family Leave
Palicy, (d) Code of Business Ethics, (g) Conflict of Interest, {f) Percaption, (g) Gratuities, and (h) Business Meals. Failure lo
provide M-DCPS a current vendor application may caus vendor not to be awarded any new business wilh M-DCPS.

Vendor applications can be downloaded al. http:fiprocuremant dadeschodls.net



MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

086-GG06 G. Jackson &C1
TITLE

Pest Control Supplies

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a conlract at firm unit prices, for the purchase of pest control supplies
for Stores and Mail Distribution stock. The term of the bid shall be for one year from the date of award, and may, by
mutual agreement between Miami Dade County Public Schools and the successful bidder(s), be extended for two (2)
additional one (1) year period(s) and, if needed, 90 days beyond the expiration date of the current contracl period.
Procurement Management Services, may if considering to extend, request a letter of intent to extend from the
successful bidder(s), prior to the end of the current contract period. All prices shall be firm for the term of the contract.
The successful vendor(s) agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

SPECIFICATIONS: If an item is to be considered as an equal to the specified item, complete technical specifications,
together with illustrative materials providing brand name and model number of the item, are requested to accompany
bid. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the item not to be considered for award,

BRAND NAME OR EQUAL: The use of a manufacturer's brand name, trade name, or model is for reference purposes
only and should not be interpreled as a statement of preference. Bids will be accepled on these and comparable
products, provided the quality of the proposed products meet or exceed the quality of the products listed.

AWARD: In the best interest of the Board, the bid will be awarded by item to the best responsive, responsible bidder
offering the lowest price.

DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made as soon as possible, but not later than 30 days after receipt of the purchase
order.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES: The estimated quantities provided in the bid proposal are for bidder's guidance only. No
quarantee is expressed or implied, as to quantities that will be used during the contract period. The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida is not obligated to place an order for any given amount, subsequent to the award of this
bid. Estimates are based upon M-DCP'S actual needs and usage during a previous contractual period, and include an
additional ten percent to cover unanlicipaled increases in requirements.

PRODUCT & SAFETY LABELS: The School Board will not accept any potentially hazardous product without the
product having safety instructions. The instructions for safe usage shall be printed (preferably in red ink) on the product
label or printed instructions shall be included with each container. These instructions must be in both English and
Spanish. In addition, these instructions shall advise of precautions to be taken, i.e.. eye protection, hand protection,
anlidotes, elc.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

086-GG06 (. Jackson SC 2
TITLE

Pest Control Supplies

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CON'T.

8 MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET: Bidders are requested to submit material safety data sheel(s) with bid. Items will
not be recommended for award until the Bureau of Procurement and Materials Management has received these sheets.

9. WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be for
one year or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater. The successful vendor will be responsible for repairing
each unit during the warranty period, at no cost to the Board. Vendor agrees to repair and retumn equipment within
five (5) days from receipt of request or provide a temporary replacement.

10,  UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unauthorized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination. Vendors shall be considered in defaull of the contract and shall lose eligibility to transact new business
with the Board for a period of fourteen (14) months from the date of termination by the Board.

11, ERASURES AND STRIKEOUTS: When filling out the bid proposal form, bidders are requested to use typewriter or
black ball point pen.
¥; Use of pencil is prohibited,
2 Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an error.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item(s).

12 VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: All bidders are requested to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor(s) have a current vendor application on
fle. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
vendor(s) not be awarded any new Dbusiness. Vendor applications can be downloaded al
http://procurement dadeschools.net

13.  OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County's Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 84, Article IX of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a localion oulside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested lo be
submitted with the Bid Proposal. If the Bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required
while the license is valid and in effect. It is the Bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after
expiration or termination of the current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to be
considered for award.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE

086-GG06 G. Jackson SC3
TITLE

Pest Control Supplies

14.

19.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CON'T.

CONE OF SILENCE: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this selicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or information
regarding this bid must be requested in writing by FAX or E-mail to:

Mr. Greg Jackson, Buyer
Procurement Management

Fax #305-523-2214

E-mail. gjackson@dadeschools.net

A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously fo:

lleana Marlinez, School Board Clerk
Miami-Dade County Public Schools

1450 N.E. 2 Avenue, Room 2688

Miami, Florida 33132

Fax #305-995-1448

E-mail: martinez{@dadeschools.net

BID ADDENDUMS: All bidders should monitor continuously, the M-DCPS, Procurement website, for any addendums
that may be posted prior to the opening of this solicitation. The procurement website, which list all bids, addendums,
and awarded information, is as follows: http://procurement dadeschools.net, (click) bid solicitation.




The School Baard of Mami-Dade Counly, Flonda
Bid #086-GG0G6
Pest Controd Supplies

BIO PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

ypu ow guinl |8 M bax ehr

prammgbeir wame ul dle bidder
b=

Bid Mo, 086-GGOG

Tille. Pest Control Supplies

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS

NAME OF BIDDER:

L

acres. Spreader diffuser plate provides umform 7
foot broadeast pattern. Spyker #24-22 or equal,
Minimum order: 5 cuch

EETIMATED FRIGE FER [
ITeMll DCPS o) DESCRIPTICON OF ITEM QUANTITY LT LNIT BAANUFAS TURER A MEXCHIT ML FI
qunou SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
ARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
TEAR R
S Bail, unt control, containerized, (regular), 96 child
' || ooy fresistant bait trays per case, Clorox Max Foree FC 400 || Case
45800 or equal. Minimum order. 100 cases
[aut, roach control, containerized, (large), 288 child
] ;;I; resistant bait trays per case, Clorox Max Force FC 250 || Case
ﬂ#-lH':lt.‘rE or equal, Minimum order: 30 cases
Gluehoards, mouse and insect pre-haied trap, pre-
5 5351_;_ seented, pulfkr:d 72 per case. 'nilcmr Hold Fast M- 60 | Case
320, Atlantic Paste MBTDZ. Catchmaster 72MB or
equal. Minimum order 30 cases,
Insecticide, tire anl control, active ingredient,
Abamectin B1, packaged in 2-1b. Recloseable
551- fleontainers. Ascend fire and bait, Formula 1, 2
4 ; 2y : 3 S00 Case
0104 Banntacured by Whitmire Micro Gen or equal.
Packaged 4 or 6 containers per case. Minimum
order: 10 cases
Cilue board, for trapping rats and mice. 10" X 187,
s || 551 filled with ghie. Pre-scented, 24 per case. Max-Caich 150 | case
0155 [Giant Catchmaster 24GRB, Atlantic Paste and Glue
or equal. Minimuwm order. 25 cases
|T1-.||:, rat, wooden base, spring snap with expanded
s || 551 trigper. Packed 12 perbag. Woodstream #M4, 40 Case
0183 Ivietor #MMI26 or cqual. Mismoam order 10
cuses
Spreader, biochem fire ant regulator, designed
especially for apphestion of Logic fire and bait,
553 Micro-flow control plate to be installed in cach
7 || goag fepreader. Plate allows for spreading product | o L3 13 Each
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