., THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING

§ 1450 Northeast Second Avenue
m Miami, FL 33132

siety wat stikonis B world

Direct all inquiries to Procurement Management

Services:
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM BUYER NAME:
BID NO. 081-FF06 G. Jackson

E-MAIL ADDRESS: giackson@dadeschools.net
PHONE: (305) §95-2345
FaX NUMBER 305-523-2214

TDD PHONE (305) 995-2400

BID TITLE Air Conditioners

Bids will be accepted until 2:00 PM on June 29, 2006 in room 351, School Board Administration building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue, Miami, FL., 33132, at which time they wiil be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for __120  days after opening.
(Refer to Instructions to Bidders, para, IV.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BID BY THE SCHOQOL BOARD OF
MIAMI-DADE CQOUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL
CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BIiD DOCUMENTS, NO
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED.

L A BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION

I cerify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same matenals, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collusion
or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and | certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder.

B. Vendor certifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

N INDEMMIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold harmless, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hereinafter defined) against any claim, action, loss,
damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation, attomey's fees and
court costs arising out of bodily injury to persons, including death, or damage to tangible property arising out of or incidental to
the performance of this Contract {inciuding goods and services provided thereto) by or on behalf of the Bidder, whether or not
dus to or caused in part by the negligence or other culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sole negligence or culpability
of the indemnity. - The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its
members, officers and employees.

m PERFORMANGE SECURITY, is required on thisbid.  YES [ .3 NO
Refer to INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. VIL, and VI,
IF PERFORMANGE SECURITY IS REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Performance Bond : Check (Cashier's, Certified, or equal) ]:

An original, manual signature Is required on the Bldder Qualification Form.
(Bldder Is requested to use blue ink)
(Do not use pencll}

Legal Name of Vendor

Mailing Address
City State 2ip Code
Telephone No. E-mail address

By: Signature (Original)

Of Authonized Representative
Name (Typed or Printed)

Of Authonized Representative

FM-3191 Rev. (01-04)



INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

NOTICE OF ESTABLISHMENT OF A CONE OF SILENCE

The School Board of Mieml-Dade County Pubfic schaals enacts a Cone
from issyance of a solicitation to written recommandation of
award. All provisions of School Board Rule 8Gx13-8C-1,212 epply.

L PREPARATION OF BiOS

A, BIDDER QUAULIFICATION FORM quaiifiss the bidder and the
bid and must be completed and submiited as page 1 of the bid.

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY. The form of performance
security the bidder will submit, when required to do 30, must be
furnished. Performance security shall not be submitted with the bid.

2 BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. Bid must
contaln  an original manual signature from an authorized
reprasentative. An unsigned bid will be considered non-responsive.

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines conditions of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any inconsistency in this bid shall
be resolved by giving precedence in the following order;

A. Specifications
B. Special Conditions
C. Instructions To Biddars

2. FOR M/WBE designated bide. The SPECIAL CONDITIONS.
MinorityfWomen owned and controlled Business Participation
Statemant and the MWBE Certification Applicaion MUST be
completed and SUBMITTED with the bid f tha bidder is nat certifled
by Miami-Dada County Public Schools. Fallure to submit the
completed application with the bid wil be considered non-
responsive, :

C. BID PROPOSAL FORM. Defines requirement of items to be |

purchased, anc must be completed and submitted as page 2 and
subsequent pages, if any, of the bid. The bidder shouid indicate
his'her name in the appropriate space on each page.

1. ITEM SPECIFICATION. Specifying e certain bvand, maks or
manufacturar is to denote the quality, type, and slandard of the
article dasired. Articles cffered must be new marchandise only, of
equal of suparior grade. On blank lines pravided, the bidder ls
requestad to insaert the brand name, manufactuwrers number and
other information nacessary to suffictently identify article offered,
Failure 1o do 30 may prevent consideration of the itam. Also, refer
to paragraph X. Packaging.

2. PRICES. Prices are requeatad in units of quaniity specified in
the bid specificaions. In case of a discrepancy in computing the
total smount of bid, UNIT PRICE quoted will govern, All prices bid
shall include delivery F.O.B. destination, freight prepaid (bidder
pays and bears freight charges, Biddar owns goods In transit and
files any claims) and shal include all cartage, drayage, packing,
olc,, delivered to and unicaded at the recsiving station at the alte
deslgnaiad in BID PROPOSAL FORMS and there received by the
designaied agent of the Board.

3. TAXES. The Board doas not pay Federal Excise and State
laxes on direct purchases of taygible psrscnal property. Tha
applicable tax examption number is shown on the purchase order.
This essmption does not apply to purchases of tangible personal
property made by contractors who use the tengible personal
property in the perfarmance of contracts for the improvamant of

Board-owned real property as defined in Chapter 192 of the Florida
Stetutos,

. SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A, BID FORMS AND ENVELOPES. Bids must ba submitted on
forms furnished by the Board and in asaled snvelopas.

Envelopas must be clearly marked with bid number, bid tide and bid
opening.

1L

B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When flling out the bid
propoesal form, biddars are required to complete bid proposal in Ink,

1. Use of pancil is prohibited.
2. Do nol erase or use corection fiuid to corect an error,
3. All changes must bs cressed cut and initfaled iq Ink.

Those bids for individus ilems that do not comply with ltems 1, 2
and 3 above will ba considered non-responsive for that itemy(s),

C. PLACE, DATE ANO HOUR. Bids shall be submitted by U.S.
Mail, Courier/Express Service, or deposited In the BID BOX
located in Room 351, 8:00 AM. to 4:30 P.M., Monday through
Friday, SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 1450
M.E. Second Avenue, Miami, Florida 33132, Bids racsived after
lhe date and hour specified in the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM
will not be congidered.

D. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Section 287.133(2)(s) Floride
Stafita, A person or gffiliate who has been placed on the convicted
vendor Tist following e conviclion for a public entily csime may not
submit a bid on a contract to provide any goods or services lo a
public entity, may not submit a bid on a contract with a public entity
for the construction of repair of a public building or pubfic work, may
not submit bids on leases of real property to & public sntity, may not
be awarded or pedform wok as a contraclor, supplisr,
subcontractor, or consultant under a conlract with any public entity,
and may not fransect business with any public entity in excess of
the threshokd amount provided in Section 287.017, for CATEGORY
TWO for a period of 36 months from the date of being placed on the
convicted vendor list.

E. SUBMITTING A “NO BID.” If not submitting a bid af this ime,
return the form entited "NOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS -
Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or the "NOTICE TO
PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS" form for three consecutive times, may
result in the company being removed from the Schocl Roard's bid
list. -

F. AYAILABILITY OF BID INFORMATION. immediately followirg
the public opening, bids will bs read, upon request, and then
compiled in s tabular form, a copy of which will be available for
examination in-Procurement Management Services.

CANCELLATION OF BIDS OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

An invitation for bids may be cancaled, in whole or in part, as may
be specified In tha solicitation, whan it is {n the bast interest of the
Board. The raasons ahall ba made a part of the master bid fle.

A, Priot to opsning, a solicitation may be canceled In whole o In
peart; prior to the date and hour specified in the Bidder Qualification
Form for receipt of bids, when the Agsistant Superintendent,
FProcirement Managament Services, delermines In writing, that
such action is In the bast interast of the Board for reasons including,
but not imitad to:

1. The Board no longer requires the supplies, aervices, or
construction;

2 The Board no jengar can reascnably expect to fund the
procurement

3. A review of a valld protest filad by e bidder may be
determined by the adminisirative staff; or

4. Proposed amendments o the solicitaion would ba of such
magnitude that a new solicitation is desirable.

B. Whan e solicitation is cenceled pricr to opaning, notice of
cancelfation shall be sen! to all businesses soliclied, via facsimile or
maii, and bids or proposals raturned to the vendor unopenod.

The nolice of cancedlation shall;

1. Identity the salicilation;

2. Briefly explain the raason for cancellation; and

3. Where appropriste, axplain that an opportunity will be glven lo
competa on any future re-solicitation for procurements of similar
supglies, services, or constructon.




iv.

CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS

& PRIOR TO BID OPENING, Should the bidder desire to
change or withdraw his/her bid, he/she shall do 30 in writing. This
communicafion s {0 be received by the District Director, of
Procurament Management, Room 352, Schoo! Board
Adminiatration Bulding, pror to date and hour of bid opening. The
bidders name, the bid number, the bid title and the date the bid Is
due rmuyt eppear on the anvelope,

B. AFTER BID OPENING. Al bids are opaned, thay may not be
changed, nor withdrawn, for 30 days efter the determined opening
data, uniess otharwise specified on the "BIDDER QUALIFICATION
FORM.*

C. FAILURE TO ACCEPT BID AWARD. Biddars who, prior to the
Bid Award by The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida,
indicata that they are unable 10 accept the bid award shall either:

1. Pay lo the Board. as ilquidated damages, an amount equal
to 5% of the unit price bid, imes the quantity, or $10, whichever
amount is larger, or

2 Lose sligibility to transaect new business with the Board for a
period of 14 months from the date the Board acts on the
withdrawn bid.

PROTESTS TO CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD

A. The Board shall provide notice of a decision or intsnded
decision conceming & solicitation, contract award, or axceptional
purchase by elachronic pesting which cen ba accessed at the
district’s website www dadeschocts nel.

B. Any parson who is advermely affected by the sgency decision or
intended decision shall file with the agency a notice of protast In
writing within 72 hours after the posting of tha notice of decision or
Intended decision. With respect 1o a protest of the tarms,
eonditions, and specif.cations contained in a sdicitation, including
any/ provisions governing the methods of mnking bids, propasals, or
repliss, awanding contracty, reserving rights of further nagotation,
of modifying or amending any contract the notice of protest ahell
be fed in writing within 72 hours after the paating of the solicitation.
Tha tormal weitten protest shall be fied within 10 days aRter the date
the notica of protast is fied. Fsllure o file @ notice of protest or a
formal written protest shall conatitute a waiver of thess
proceedings. The forma!l wrilten protesl shall state with particularity
the facis end law upon which the protast Is based. Satwdays,
Sundays, and stats holidays shall ba excluded in the computation
of the 72-hour ime periods etlablished harein.

© C, All notice of protests Wil be reviewed by Procurement

Management Services, who will offer the prolssting bidder the
opportynity v mest and discuss tha merits of the protast, I the
protest s not resolved, the bidder may sesk an administrative
haasing pursuant to §120.57 Fla, Stat, by filing a formal written
protest within 10 days after fling the notca of protest, Paiitions for
hearing pursuant to §120.57 Fla, Stat, must ba filed in accordance
with School Board Ryle 6Gx13- 8C-1,064.

AWARDS

A, RESERVATION FOR REJECTION OR AWARD. The Board
reswrves tha right 1o refect any or ail bids, to waive irragularities or
technicaliies, and o raquest rebids. The Board resarves the right
to award on an Indivkiual temn basiz, any combination of tems, total
fow bid or, if an efemats bid is accepled, on such terms as are
spacified for the alternate bid, whichever ranner Is in the best
interest of the Beard,

B. NOTWFICATION OF INTENDED ACTION will ba pested on the
District's webske 7-10 days prior to a regulary scheduled Board
measting.

C. COFFICIAL. AWARD DATE. Awards bacome official upon the
Board's formal approval of the awerd.
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D. PURCHASE ORDERS. Purchase orders mailed 1o suctasshi
bidders are the official notification to delivar matsials described
therain; and the tme allowed for delivary begins with the dsts of
the purchase order. In the event that the auccassfl bidder fails to
delivar the materials in sccordance with the tarms and conditiors of
the bid and purchase order, the biddar shall be considered to be in
defauit of the contract and subject to the default provisions atated in
Instructions to Bidders. Section VI. E.

E DEFAULT. A vendor who falls o perfam according to the
tarms of the contract (bid) ahall be considered In dafaull In the
event of default, which may include, but & not limited to poor
performance and/or non-perfomance, & vendar shall sither (1) pay
kquidated damages of 10 parcent of the unit prica of the Item(s}
awarded times the quantity when no purchase order has bean
msued, 10 percent of the purchase ordar when a purchase order
has beaen lasued or $100, whichever I greater or (2) [oss ebglbliity
1o transact new business with the Board for a period of 14 months
from date of termination of award by the Board. Biddery that are
detervined insligible may request a hearing pursuent to Chapter
120 of the Florida Statules, and Schoo! Board Rule 60x13- 8C-
1064,

F. The intent of the bid documents is to inciyde only the wiitten
requirements for materials, equipment. systarns, standards and
wockmanship necassary for the propar exscuton and completion of
the work by the Bidder. The bid documents shall not be construad
to cresls en enliterment to any other scope of woak excepl as
spacified herein.

PERFORMANCE SECURITY (FOR SUCCESSFUL BIODERS
ONLY)

A. PURPOSE, A performance bond or check may be required o
guamntes perfomnance.

B. BONDING COMPANY. Performance Bonds shall be written
through a reputable and responsible surety bond agency Hcersed
to do business in the State of Flarida and with a surety company or
carparation meeting both of the following specifications:

1. Awardy Greater than $500,000

A runimum rating in the latast revision of Besfs Insurance Reports
of: '

Contract Amount Mini Rating b

$ 500,000.01to0 % 2,500,000 Nonae
$2,500,000.01 1o $ 5,000,000 B + or NA-3

. Mo Minimum Class
$ 5,000,000.01 to $10,000,000 A-Clasa IV
$10,000.000.01 or more A-Class V

Cument certificate of suthority & acceptable surety on Federa
Bonds in accordance with tha latest ediion of the United Slates
Treasury Department Clrcular 570 entiled "Companies Holding
Cerfificates of Authority ss Acceptable Surgtias on Feders! Bonds
and a3 Acceplabla Reinsuring Companies” shall be accepled for an
amount not exceading the underwriting imitation thereon,

2 Awgrds of $580,000 or Less

Bonds shall be writan with a surely company or corporation
meeting tha qualifications = set forth in Paragraph VI1.B. sbove or
tha qualfications set [orth In section 287.0535, Florida Statutes.

C. AMOUNT. When requred as defined hersin, the firm or
ndividuel{s) 1o whom an award has been made shall executs and
deliver 1o The School Bosard of Miami- Dade County, Florida, a
Performance Bond, Cashiars/Certifled Check, or equal.

1, Awards less than $200,000 ahall be exampl from performance
security. .

2. Performance security shall not be required, unless othe_tw'n_o
defined in the bid specifications. i performance secunty o
required, it shall aqual 100% of the zwerd amaunt.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMANCE SECURITY. Return ko the
Awardes of his/her cash security, or netification to the Awardes and
the bonding company to cancel the perfarmanca bond, will be made
when all goods/sarvices heve been acceptsd and Invoices have
baen approved for payment

Ravised Sepl 2005

—




VIO.SAMPLES

When bid samples are required, the buyer will notfy bidder Lo

submit sempies of the itarm bid in accordance with the follawing
procedurss; ’

A, All sarples must be identified with the bidders name, bid
number, itern number, and product name and number. Whers non-
compliance with this requirement Is nolad, said Ksm may be
considered as being unidentfiable and may nol be eligibie for
consideration in the award recommendation.

B. Al samplas are to be delivered within 7 calandar days after
raceipt of notification from buyer, unless otherwize stated In the
Special Condiiors of the bid.  the bidder does nct submit
samples by the dats and Ume indicated by the buysr, the bid
submitted for that item may not be considered for award.

C. Bidder must oblain, from Malerials Testing sand Evaluation, a
signad receipl acknowledging dellvery of samples. Bidder shall
inckide & seif-addrassed, stamped anvelope for retum of sample
raceipt when aubmitting yamples by rmail or deflvery service. The
bidder wil receive the original copy of the roceipt and the dupiicate
copy will remaln with the Miarmi-Cads County Public Schools
recaiving department as the fle copy. Bidder shall be solely
responsible for defivery of samples and for retaining sample
dellvery receipts, which must be presented in any dispute regarding
receipt of bid samples.

D. Sampies should ba delivered (o the following addrass:

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBL!C SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION-
7040 Wast Flagier Straat
Miami, Floride 33144
Telephone Number: 786-275-0780

Miami-Dade County Public Schools w.'l not oe rmesponsible for
samples sent to a location other than the location mentioned in the
bid.

E, PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Board wil buy no samplas
and will assume no cosl incidental thersto,

F. RETURN OF SAMPLES. Samples not destroyad in testing may
be ciaimad by unsuccessful bidders 14 days after bid award date
and by successhul biddars 11 days after final payment but the
Board will ssaurme no responsibility for s amples not claimed within
the tme specified, and it will pay for no samples damaged in
tasting.

0. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS. If a sample submitted for
tosting doas not comply, the buyer will advise the bidder \o contact
Matarialx Testing and Evaluation for further detais.

SUBSTITUTIONS

Should the bidder find it necassary to use & material, equipment,
product or system other than spacified, the bidder shall secure from
the Board, through Procurament Management Servicas, wrilten
approval for the use of the alternate metariats, squipment, product
or systom. The Board Is nol obligaied ® approve raquesty for
subslitutions and has the discretion o require the bidder o provide
tha malerials as spacified in the bid documents, In no case shall
the bidder be entited to edditional ime end/or money arising out of
the Board's failure to approve requests for substitubors,

PACKAGING

A. TYPE. If packaging &s different from that apacified, the bidder
must nots the manner and emounts In which packaging b» o be
made; oherwise the auccessful bidder ahall fumish psckaging as
spacified. Al packaging, wrapping and bundling shall be adequate
t0 Inmure that materiats will be recalved in undamaged condiion.
The Board msaumas no respensibiity for damages of any kind
Incumed in ransit
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B. CONTAINER IDENTIFICATION, The following Kantfication
shall be prntad. stencied or leglbly written in a comsplcuous
tocation on each shipping container:

1. BID NUMBER AND/OR PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
2. YENDOR'S NAME AND/OR TRADEMARK
3. NAME(S) CF ITEM{S) CONTAINED

4. ITEM NUMBER({S) WITH QUANTITY(IES)

PURCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

Yith the consent and agreemant of the successful bidders),
purchases may be made undear this bikd by Miam Dade County,
Florida, and cther governmaental agencies or politicat subdivisions
within the State of Flodda. Such purchases shafl be govemned by
the sama lerms and condions stated herein. This agreament in no
way rastricts or intarferss with the right of any Stal of Florida
Agency or political subdivision to rebid any or sl of thase iterrs.

XIL RECYCUNQ REQUIREMENTS

MiamiDede County Public Schools supports recycing snd
recommands the use of mcycled products where passible.
Vendors are requested to submit a tefer, alang with their bid,
indicating whether each itern bid and/or its packaging contains pre-
consumer or pash-consumer wasta, and if the product sndfor
packaging may be recycled.

XHL ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCTS

Miami-Dade County Public Schocls encourages the use of
environmentally safe products.

XIV. DEUVERY AND BILLING

A. DEUVERY, Saturdays, Sundays, and holduys excepted,
deliverias shall be made es foflows: Schovls and Departmants -
8:00 AM. o 3:00 P.M. Merchandise sheil ba unicacea at the
receiving station of the designated dasiivery point and receivad
thers by a dasignatad agent of the Board. A dalivery Scket, or one
copy of tha invoice, prepared & indicated bajow, shall accompany
each delivery.

B. RECEIVING INSPECTION AND TESTINQ. Daliverad itans
which do not fuffiil all requiremants will be rejectsd. Ruejected
Items shall be removed and replaced promptly by the vander, at
no cost 1o the purchaser.

C. INVOICES. Each invoice shall be imsued by the successfu
bidder and shall bs submitted in DUPLICATE 10 the Accounts
Payahls Section, P.O. Box 01-2570, Miami, Florids 33101, Tobe
considered for payment, sach invoice must show the following
Inforrnation, which appaars on the Purchase Order.

Purchase Order Number

ltem Dascriptions

Quantties and Units

Price Extensions

Total price of all Rems on invoice

wE LN

D. PAYMENT. Uniass olharwise specified by Miami-D ade County
Public Schools, payment wil be made only aftar defvery,
authorizad inspecton, end acceptance. Paymant wil bs made
only to the successful bidder, unlasa ctherwise requesied, In
writng, by the successful bidder and accepied by Miarmi-Dade
County Public Schaols Administration, When bidders are dinacted
to send invoices v e school, the school wil nwke directed
payment o the bidder.

XV. NOGRATUITY POLICY
it} the poficy of Procurement Managemaent Services nol (o accepl

gifts, gratuities, o favors of any kind, of of any value whatsoaver,
from vendors, members of their steffs, of famifies.

Revised Sept. 2005




NYL COMPLIANCE WITH STATE/FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A Al contacts involving federal funds wilfl contain certain
provisions required by appliceble sections of Tille 34, Section
80.38(!1) and Section §5.510 Code of Federsl Ragulatons and are
induded by refarence harein. Tha vendor certfias by signing the
bid that tha vendor and his/her principals are not presenty
debarred, suspanded, proposed for debarmani, declared neligible
or voluntarly excluded from perticipstion in {ederally funded
transactions and may, In cartain instancas, be required to provide
& separate written certification to this effact.

During the term of any contract with tha Board, in the event of
debarment, suspension, proposed debarment, declarad ineligible
or voluntarly excluded from participation in federaly fundad
transactions, the vendor shall immadiately notify tha Assistant
Superintendent, Procuremen! Mansgemen! Services, in writing.
Vandors wil also be required to provide access to records, which
are directy partinent to the contract and ratain all requirad records
for thrae years aflar tha Board rmakes final payment.

B. For al contracts involving Fedweral funds in axcess of $10,000¢,
the Board resarves tha right to terminata tha contract for caxise, as
well as [or conveniance, by issuing s cartified notice to the vendor.

XVIL COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

Biidars shal comply with all federal, atate of Florida and local
laws applcable to it end the performanca of its obligations under
this bid.

XVYIIl. BACKGQROUND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS

In accordsnce with tha requirements of aections 1012.32,
1012.465, and 435.04, Florids Statules (2004) as well a5 with the
requirements of HB 1677, The Jessice Lunsford Act (2005},
offactive Septembar 1, 2005, Bidder agrees 1o certify under cath
and penalty of perjury by comglating the sftached Swom
Statemenl Pursuari to Secives 1012.32, 1012.465, and 435,04,
Florida Statutes {20G4) and HB 1677, Tha Jessica Lunsford Act
(2008), which is incorporaled fully herein by referance, that
Bidder and alf of its employees who provida or may provide
asrvices undar this Agreament have completed all background
sCreshing requirements as outlined in tha abou-rafernncod
atatutes.

Additionally, Bidder sgroea thet each of its ampioyees,
represaniativea, sgents, subconiractors or suppifars who
are permijtied agcess on school groynds when students gre
present, who have direct contact with students or who have
access to or control of school funds_must meet leysl 2
goresning requirements ag described in sections 101232
and 43504 Horida Siatules, and further upon obtaining
level 2 clearance, must obtaln & required Board iasued
photo Mdentification badge which ehall be wom by the
indlvidual at all tmes whils on Board property when
students are present.

Bidider agrees o bear any and all coats assoclated with
acquiring the required background acresning - Inciuding
any costs asgociated with fingerprinting and obtalning tha
reqguired photo Identifcation badge. Bidder agrees to
require all its affectad empioyess (o aign a statement, as a
condition of empioyment with Bidder In relation to
perfarmance under this Agreament (bid), agreeing thet tha
empioyse will sbida by the heretofore describad background
screening rmequiremenis, and also agresing that the
empioyes will notly the BidderEmpioyer of any sirest(s) or
comviction(s) of any affense snumaerated In 3. 435.04, Florids
Statutes within 48 hours of Its occurranca.

Bidder agrees 1o provida the Board with a list of all of Ity
amployess who have complelad background screening as
required by the sbove-referenced atatutes and who meel the
slatutory requirements contained thersin, Blddar agrees that it
has an ongoing duty o maintain and update thesa listy zs new
employses ara hired and in the event thal any previously
scresnad amploysa (aits to meet tha statutory standards. Bidder
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fisther agrees to nolfy the Board lmmediately wpon becoming
aware that ona of its employess who was previcialy certified as
complating the background check end rmeeting tha stalutory
standards is subsequently emeatsd or convicted of any
disqualifying offense. Fallure by Bidder (o notify tha Board of
such srrest or conviction within 48 hours of being put on
notice and within § business days of the octtrrence of &
qualifying arrest or conviction, ahall conettuts grounde for
immediate terminetion of thie Agresmert{bid) by the Board,

Failure by Bikider 1o perform any of tha duties described In this
saction shall constituts 8 matarial breach of the Agraemant (bid)
and defaul entiting the Board to utilze the provisions of section
V1. E of this bid as we!l &3 entiting tha Board lo terminate the
Agrsemaent{bid) immedlately with no further responsiblity for the
Board to make paymeant or perform any othar dufies under this
Agreement {bid).

XIX COMPLIANCE WITH SCHQQL CODE

Bidder agrees to comply with all sections of the Florida K-20
Education Code, Title XLVIII, Florida Statutes =3 # presently
axisty, and further sz 1 may be amended from tma to tme.
Further Bidder agreas that failure to comply with the Fiorkia K-20
Education Code shsll constitute a matsial braach of this
Agreament (bid}) and may result in the termination of this
Agreament (bid) by tha Board.

THE SCHCOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIOA

-

SuUP ENT OF SCHOOLS

Ravised Sepl, 2005




FROM: AFFIX

POSTAGE
HERE

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BUREAU OF PROCUREMENT AND MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2N° AVENUE
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO.: 081-FF06

BID TITLE: Air Conditioners

BID OPENING DATE: June 29, 2006




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Bureau of Procurement and Materials Management

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID

If not submitting a bid at this time, for informational purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the information requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Our company does not handle this type of product/service.

We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.

Qur company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
QTHER, {Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

Signature
Title

Company,

NCTE: Fallure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may result in

your company being removed from the School Board's bid list. To qualify as a
respondent to the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID.




Vendor Information Sheet

1A. 2. Telephone/Fax/Contact Person
Federal Employer [dentification Number
Or Telephone number

Owner's Sodal Security Number
1B. Fax Aumber

Wame of Firm, Individuai(s), Partners or Corporation

Contact Person

Street Address

City State Zip Cade E-mail address
3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporaticn, partnership, scle proprietorship,or joint venture, the full iegal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director. or owner who holds, directly or indirectly the majority of the
stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with a trust, the full legal name and address shall be provided for
each trustee and each beneficiary. Post Office addresses are not acceptahle,

_ o
Name Title Address Gender  |ethnicity Stock Ownership

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided on the "Vendor's
Application”. All vendors must have a curent vendor's application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be
familiar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: (2) Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free Workplace, (c) Family Leave
Palicy, (d} Code of Business Ethics, (e) Conflict of Interest, (f) Perception, (g) Gratuities, and (h}) Business Meals. Failure to
provide M-DCPS a curent vendor application may cause the vendor not to be awarded any new business with M-DCPS.

Vendor applications can be downloaded at: hitp://procurement dadeschools.net




Miami-Dade County Public Schools
SWORN STATEMENT - NEW CONTRACTS

ATTACHMENT _ A
SWORN STATEMENT PURSUANT TO SECTION 1012.465,
FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY
HB 1877, THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT

THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED AND SWORN TO IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY
PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICIAL AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

1.

Initials

This sworn statement is submitted to The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fl

(Hereinafter “Board” or “School Board™) by

(Print individual’s name and title)

for
(Print Name of entity submitting sworn statement)

whose business address is

and its Federal Employer Identification Number (FEIN) is
. If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security
Number (SSN) of the individual signing this swom statement and so indicate.

I, , am duly authorized to make this
(Print individual’s name and title)
sworn statement on behalf of
(Print Name of entity submitting sworn statement)

I understand that during the 2005 Legislative Session, House Bill 1877, The Jessica Lunsford
Act (hereinafter “The Act” or “Act”) was passed and approved by Governor Bush on May 2,
2005, with an effective date of September 1, 2005.

Pagel of 3
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10.

Initials

I understand that the Act amends the background screening requirements of section
1012.465, Florida Statutes (2004) for all non-instructional school district employees or
“contractual personnel” by requiring all non-instructional school district employees or
contractual personnel who are permitted access on school grounds when students are present
to undergo and pass “level 2 background screening,” and further I understand the Act defines
“contractual personnel” to include any vendor, individual, or entity under contract with the
Board.

T understand that pursuant to section 1012.465, Florida Statutes as amended by the Act, non-
instructional school district employees or contractual personnel who are permitted access on
school grounds when students are present, who have direct contact with students or who

have access to or control of school funds must meet level 2 screening requirements as
described in sections 1012.32 and 435.04, Florida Statutes.

I understand thatas a (eg. a private bus
Type of entity

service contractor) all contractual personnel, as defined in section 1012.465, Florida

Statutes, must meet level 2 screening requirements as outlined in sections 1012.32

and 435.04, Flonida Statutes in order to do business with The School Board of

Miami-Dade County, Florida.

I understand that “level 2 screening requirements,” as defined in sections 1012.32 and
435.04, Florida Statutes means that fingerprints of all contractual personnel must be obtained
and submitted to the Florida Department of Law Enforcement for state processing and to the
Federal Bureau of Investigation for federal processing.

I understand that the School Board will implement local procedures to comply with level 2
screening requirements, as defined in sections 1012.32 and 435.04. I understand that my
company must comply with these local procedures as they are developed.

I understand that any costs and fees associated with the required background screening will
be borme by my company.

I understand that any personnel of the contractor found through fingerprint processing and
subsequent level 2 background screening to have been found guilty of, regardless of
adjudication, or entered a plea of nolo contendere or guilty to any offense outlined in Section
435.04, Florida Statutes (or any similar statute of another jurisdiction), shall not be permitted
to come onto school grounds or any leased premises where school-sponsored activities are
taking place when students are present, shall not be permitted direct contact with students,
and shall not be permitted to have access to school district funds.

Page 2 of 3
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11.  Tunderstand that the failure of any of the company’s or my affected personnel to meet level
2 screening standards as required by section 1012.465, Florida Statutes, may disqualify my
company from doing business with The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida.

12.  Thereby certify that the foregoing statement is true and correct in relation to the company for
which I am submitting this swom statement. I further certify that this statement is being
given knowingly and voluntarily by me on behalf of my company.

The company submitting this swom statement agrees to be bound by the provisions of SECTIONS
101232, 1012.465, AND 435.04 OF THE FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY HB 1877,
THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT 2005.

ICERTIFY THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-
DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA ON BEHALF OF THE COMPANY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH
ONE (1) ABOVE BINDS THE COMPANY TOFULLY COMPLY WITH THE BACKGROUND
SCREENING REQUIREMENTS OF SECTIONS 1012.32, 1012.465, AND 435.04, FLORIDA
STATUTES.

(Signature)

Swom to and subscribed before me this day or , 20

Personally known

OR Produced Identification

Notary Public -State of

(Type of Identification)
My commission expires

(Printed typed or stamped commissioned
name of notary public)

Page 3 of 3
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BID BUYER
081-FF06 G. Jackson PAGE SC1

Air Conditioners

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

1. PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract, at firm unit prices, for the purchase of estimated
requirements for the items listed. The term of the bid shall be for one year from the date of award, and may, by mutual
agreement between Miami-Dade County Public Schools and the successful bidder(s), be extended for two (2)
additional one (1) year period(s) and, if needed, 90 days beyond the expiration date of the current contract period.
Procurement Management Services, may if considering to extend, request a letter of intent to extend from the
successful bidder(s), prior to the end of the current contract period. All prices shall be firm for the term of the contract.
The successful bidder(s) agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

2. AWARD: Award of this contract shall be made as a total low bid to the best responsive, responsibie bidder.

3. QUANTITIES: The quantities or usage shown on the Bid Proposal Form are estimates only. No guarantee or
warranty is given or implied by the Board, as to the total amount that may or may not be purchased from the resulting
contract(s). These quantities are for bidders' information only, to aid in determining whether they will be able to supply
the amounts which may be required by the Board.

4, SPECIFICATIONS: If anitem is to be considered as an equal to the specified item, complete technical specifications,
together with illustrative materials providing brand name and model number of the item, are requested to accompany
bid. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the item not to be considered for award.

5. BRAND NAME OR EQUAL: The use of amanufacturer’s brand name, trade name, or model is for refererice purposes
only and should not be interpreted as a statement of preference. Bids will be accepted on these and comparable
products, provided the quality of the product meet or exceed the quality of the products listed. Brands bid as equal should
pass a field performance evaluation test.

6. DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made as soon as possible, but not later than 30 days after receipt of the purchase
order. '

DELIVER TO:

Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Maintenance and Materials Management
12525 NW 28% Avenue
Miami, FL. 33167

7. WARRANTY: The warmranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be for one
year or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater. The successful vendor will be responsible for repairing each uriit
during the warranty penod, at no cost to the Board. Vendor agrees to repair and return equipment within five (5) days
from receipt of request or provide a temporary replacement.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) | TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD QF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID 081-FF06 BUYER G, Jackson . PAGE SC2
Air Conditioners

10.

1.

12.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unauthorized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination. Vendors shall be considered in default of the contract and shall lose eligibility to transact new business
with the Board for a period of fourteen (14) months from the date of termination by the Board.

ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS: When filling out the bid proposal form, bidders are requested to use a typewriter or
complete bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an error.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item(s).

VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: Allbidders are requested to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor(s} have a current vendor application on
file. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
vendor(s) not be awarded any new business. Vendor applications can be downloaded at
http://procurement.dadeschools.net. '

OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County’s Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 8A, Article IX of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a location outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested to be submitted
with the bid proposal. If the bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required while the
license is valid and in effect. It is the bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after expiration or
termination of the current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to be considered for
award.

CONE OF SILENCE: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this solicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or information

“regarding this bid must be requested in writing by FAX or E-mail to:

Mr. Greg Jackson, Buyer
Procurement Management

Fax #305-523-2214

E-mail: gjackson@dadeschools.net

A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously to:




BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A)

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BID

081-FF06 BUYER G. Jackson PAGE SC3

Air Conditioners

13.

14.

15.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

lleana Martinez, School Board Clerk
Miami-Dade County Public Schools
1450 N.E. 2nd Avenue, Room 2688
Miami, Florida 33132

Fax #305-995-1448

E-mail: martinez@dadeschools.net

BID ADDENDUMS: All bidders should monitor continuously, the M-DCPS, Procurement website, for any addendums
that may be posted, prior to the opening of this solicitation. The procurement website, which list all bids, addendums,
and award information, is as follows: http./procurement.dadeschools.net, (click) bid solicitation.

CREDIT CARDS: Maintenance Materials Management may place some orders and utilize, as the form of payment, a
District-issued credit card, to the extent authorized by the School Board. These orders will be made via phone or fax for
direct delivery and billing to the requesting work location. Please note that credit card purchases will benefit all vendors
by providing immediate payment (i.e., within 48-72 hours}, thereby eliminating the need to submit an invoice to the
District's Accounts Payable Department or reconcile receivable balances. For credit card purchases, alt vendors must
have the capability to accept fax orders, which must be confirmed by calling back the requesting work location to verify
prices and obtain a credit card number.

Only actual items shipped/delivered can be charged to the credit card account (i.e., no back-orders). All purchase
deliveries must include a packing slip or receipt/invoice listing the items and prices of goods delivered. For security
reasons, the credit card charge receipt showing the work location’s credit card number cannot be attached to the
packing slip or receipt/invoice submitted as part of the purchase delivery. District work locations may request that a
vendor maintains secure records of the credit card account assigned an alias or password, to avoid divulging the actual
card number upon every purchase.

CONFLICT OF INTEREST: Former Miami-Dade County Public Schools employees, classified as Managerial Exempt
Personnel, Pay Grade 22 and above, Dade County School Administrators Association, Pay Grade 47 and above, and
other equivalent positions, are prohibited from personally representing another person or entity or acting as an agentor
attomey for compensation in connection with an7 matter in which The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida, is
interested, for two years after the School Board employees’ service terminates. This provision is pursuant to School
Board Rule 6Gx13 - 4A-1.212 and Flonda Statue § 112.313(9).

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida shall be prohibited from entering into any business refationship or
continue an existing business relationship with any person or entity determined to have engaged in violation of the
restriction contained in this provision.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE
081-FF06 G. Jackson SC4
Air Conditioners

16.

17.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

PUBLIC RECORDS LAW: It is the practice of The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida, to evaluate all
Requests For Proposals in a public forum open to the Sunshine, pursuant to Florida Statute § 286.011 and to
make available for public inspection and copying any information received in response to an RFP, in accordance
with Florida Statute § 119, as such any information sent to M-DCPS is being sent into the public domain. No
action on the part of the proposer would create an obligation of confidentiality on the part of the School Board,
including but not limited to, making a reference in the proposal to the trade secret statutes, Florida Statutes §§
812.081, 815.045. It is recommended that potential suppliers exclude from their response any information that, in
their judgment, may be considered a trade secret.

CHARTER SCHOOLS: Items awarded under this contract shall be made available to Charter Schools approved by
the School Board. The School Board is not responsible or liable for any purchases that may be made by
Charter Schools.




The School Beard of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #081-FF06
Air Conditioners

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type “printin.this box the ...
complebs niame of the bidders - .7

Bid No. 081-FF06

Title:Air Conditioners

Buyer: G. Jackson

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS
|#aME OF BiDDER:

ESTIMATED PRICE PER || MANUFACTURER &
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT UNIT MODEL#
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR
102- Adr conditioner, vertical mount, 25,000 BTU's with 5 KW
1 0170 strip heater,208/ 230 volts, single phase, 60 HZ, 11 seeq 52 Each
Bard model WA253A05 or equal.
102- Air conditioner, vertical mount, 30,000 BTU’s, with § KW|
2 0188 strip heater, 208/230 volts, single phase, 60 HZ. Bard 8 Each
model WA302A08 or equal,
102- Air conditioner, vertical mount,wall unit, self contained
3 0196 with 10 KW heat strip, 37,000 BTU's, 208/230 volts, 68 Each
single phase. Bard model WA372A10 or equal.
102- Air conditioner, vertical mount, packaged unit, with 10
4 0200 KW heat strip, 48,000 BTU's, 208/230 volt, single phasd, 112 Each
60 HZ. Bard model WA484A10 or equal.
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