P THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

1450 Northeast Second Avenue

T SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING
Miamt, FL 33132

Miami-Dads Caunty Public Schools
apestey Gt rigders e mardld

Direct all inquiries to Procurement Management
Services:

BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM BUYER NAME:

BID NO. 036-FF06 G. Jackson

Sorinkl L d Turf E-MAIL ADDRESS: gjackson@dadeschaols.net
BID TITLE =prnkers, Lawn and Tu . PHONE: (305) 995-2345

Fax NUMBER 305-523-2214
TDD PHONE (305) 995-2400

Bids will be acceptad until 2:00 PM on May 18, 2006 in room 351, School Board Administration building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue, Miami, FL., 33132, at which fime they will be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for __ 120 days after opening.
{Refer to Instructions to Bidders, para. IV.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BID BY THE SCHOOL 80ARD OF
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL
CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BID DOCUMENTS, NG
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED.

i A, BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collusion
or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and | certify that | am authorized o sign this bid for the bidder.

B. Vendor cerlifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

18 INDEMNIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold harmless, indemnify and defend the indemnities (as hereinafter defined) against any claim, action, loss,
damage, injury, fiability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation, attorney's fees and
court costs arising out of bodily injury te persons, including death, or damage to tangible property arising out of or incidental to
the performance of this Contract {inciuding goods and services provided thereto} by or on behalf of the Bidder, whether or not
due to or caused in part by the negligence or other culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sale negligence or culpability
of the indemnity. The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its
members, officers and employess.

. PERFORMANCE SECURITY, is required on this bid.  YES [ .3 NO
Refer to INSTRUCTICNS TO BIDDERS, para. Vll., and VI,

iF PERFORMANCE SECURITY IS REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Performance Bond D Check (Cashier's, Certified, or equal} :

An original, manual signature is required on the Bidder Qualification Form.
{Bidder is requestad to use blue ink)
{Do not use pencil}

{Legal Name of Vendor
Mailing Address

City State Zip Code

Telephone No, E-mail address
By: Signature (Original)

Of Authorized Representative
Name (Typed or Printed)

Of Authorized Representative

FM-3191 Rev. (01-04)



INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

NOTICE OF ESTABLISHMENT OF A CONE OF SILENCE

The School Board of Miaml-Dada County Public schools enacts a Cong
of Sdence from issuance of a sclicitation to written recommendation of
award. All provisions of Schooi Board Rute EGx13-8C-1.212 apply.

L PREPARATION OF BIDS

A. BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM qualifies the bidder and the
bid and must be completed and submitted as page 1 of the bid.

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY, The fxm o pefomance
securlty the bidder will submit, when required to do o, must ba
furnished, Ferformance security shall not be submitied with the bid,

2. BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. Bid must
contain an ofiginal manua signature from an  authorized
reprasentative. An unsigned bid will bes considered non-responsive.

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines conditions of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any inconsistency in this bid shait
be rasoived by giving precedencs in the fallowing order:

A. Specificalions
B. Special Conditions
C. Instruclions To Bidders

2. FOR M/WEBE dasignated bids, Tha SPECIAL CONDITIONS-
Mineority/Women owned and controlled Business Participation
Statement and the MWBE Cectification Applicaton MUST be
complelad and SUBMITTED with the bid if the bidder ia not certified
by Miami-Dade County Public Schools. Falure to submit the
completed application with the bid wil be consldered non-
responsive.

C. BID PROPOISAL FORM. Defnes requiremsnt of items to ba

purchased, anc must ba complisted and submitted as page 2 and
subssquent pages, if any, of the bid. The bidder should indicate
hiz/her name In the appropriate space on each page.

1. ITEM SPECIFICATION. Specifying a cerlain brand, make or
manufacturer is 1o denote the quality, type, and standard of the
article desired. Articles offered must be new merchandise only, of
equal or superior grade. On blank lines provided, the bidder is
reguestad to insert the brand hame, manufaciurers number and
ather information necsssary to sufficiently identify aricle offersd.
Failure to do ¢ may prevent consideration of the jlem. Also, refer
o paragraph X, Packaging.

Z,  PRICES. Prices are requested in units of guantity specified (n
the bid specifications. In case of a discrepancy in computing the
total amaunt of bid, UNIT PRICE quated will govemn. All prices bid
shal include delivery F.O.B. destination, freight prepaid (bidder
pays and bears freight charges, Bidder owns goods In transit and
files any claims) and shall include ail cartage, drayage, packing,
elc., delivered te and unloaded at the receiving station a! the site
designated in 81D PROFPOSAL FORMS and there received by the
designatad agent of the Board,

3. TAXES. The Board doss not pay Federsl Excise and State
taxes on direct purchases of tangible parsonal property. The
applicable tax examption number is shown on the purchase order,
This exemption doas not 2pply to purchases of tangible personal
property made by conwaciors who uas the tangible personal
property in tha performance of contracts for the improvement of
gou’d-awnad real property ag dufined in Chapter 192 of the Flaida
tatutgs,

. SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A. BID FORMS AND ENVELOQFES. Bids must bs submilted on
forms furnished by the Board and in sealed snveiopes.

Envelopes must be clearly marked with bid number, bid title and bid
apening.

Y.

B, ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When filling out the bid
proposal form, biddars are required to completa bid propesal in ink.

1. Use of pancil is probibitad.
2. Do naot erase or use corection fMuid 1o comact an error,
3. All changea must ba croased out and initlaled in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with ltems 1, 2
and 3 abave will be considered non-responsive Tor that item(s),

€. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids sha!f be submitted by U5,
Mail, Courier/Express Service, o deposited in the BID BOX
lecated in Room 351, 8:00 A.M. to 4:30 P.M., Monday through
Friday, SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 1450
MN.E. Second Avenue, Miami, Florida 33132, Bids received ofter
the date and hour specilied in the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM
will not be considered.

D. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Secton 287.133{2){s) Florida
Statute, A person or ffiliate who has been piaced on the convicisd
vendor fist foliowing a conviction for a public antity crime may no!
aubmit a bid an a contract fo provide any goods ar services (o a
public entity, may not submit a bid on a contract with a pubilc entity
for the construction o repalr of a public building or public work, may
not submit bids on leases of real proparty to a public entty, may not
be awarded or perffom work b5 a coniractor, supplier,
subcontractor, or consullant under a contract with any public entity,
and may not ransact business with any public antity in excess of
the thresheld amount provided in Section 287.017, for CATEGORY
TWO for a period of 36 months from the date of being placed on the
convicted vandor fist

E. SUBMITTING A "NO BID.™ if not submitting a bid at this time,
return the form entited "NOTICE TG PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS."
Failure 1o respond, either by eubmitting a bid or the "NOTICE TO
PROSPECTIVE BIDOERS” form for three conseculive limes, may
resull in the company being removed from the Schont Board's bid
Iist.

F. AYAILABILITY OF BID INFORMATION. immediately following
the public opening, bide will be read, upen reguest, and then
compled in a tabular form, a copy of which will be avaifable for
wxamination in Procurement Management Servicas,

CANCELLATION OF BIDS OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

An lavitation for bids may be cancselad, in whole or in part, as may
be specified in the solicitalion, when it is in the bast interest of the
Hoard. The reasons shall be made a part of the master bid file.

A. Prior to opening, a sdlicitation may be canceled In whole o In
part, prier to the date and hour spacified in the Bidder Qualific ation
Form for receipt of bids, when the Assistant Superintendent,
Procurement Management Services, determines in writing, that
such achonis in the best interast of the Board for reasons including,
byt not Imited to:

t. The Board no longer requires ths supplies, services, o
construction;

2. The Board no longer can reascnably expect lo fund the
procurament;

3. A review of a valld protest filad by a bidder may ke
determinad by the adminisirative stalf, or

4. Proposed amendments to the solicitation would te of such
magnitude that a new soficitation is desirable.

B. When a solicitatlon |5 canceled prior to apening, nolice of
canceiftation shall be sent {o all businesses solicited, via facsimila or
mail, Bnd bids or proposals returned to the vendor unopened.

The notice of canceliation shail:

1. [dentify the solicitation;

2. Briefly explain the reason for cancellalion; and

3. Whera sppropriate, explain that an opportunity will be giv_enl to
compein on any future re-sclicitation for procurements of similer
supplies, secvices, of consfucton.




1v. CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS

& PRIOR TO BID OPENINQ., Should the bidder desks to
chang® or withdraw his/haer bid, hefshe shall do s in writing. Thia
communicalion k& o bs recelved by the Distiict Dirsctor, of
Procuremant  Management, Room 352, School Board
Aderiniztration Buiding, prior 1o dats mrd hour of bid opaning. The
biddars name, the bid numier, the bid titts and the date the bid is
dus must appear on the anvelope,

B. AFTER BID OPENING. Afiw bids ars opaned, they may not be
changed, nor withdrawn, for 90 days after the determined opsning
data, unisss otherwise specified on the "BIDDER QUALIFICATICN
FORM."

C. FAILURE TO ACCEPT BID AWARD. Bidders who, prior to the
Bid Award by The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida,
indicale that thoy are unable (5 accept e bid award shall either

1. Pay to tha Board, as liquidated damagas, an amount equal
to 5% of the unit prize bid, imes the quantity, or $10, whichaver
amount is larger, or

2. Lose aligibility to transact new business with the Board for 2
period of 14 months from the dale the Beard actx on the
withdrawn bid.

PROTESTS TO CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD

A. The Board shall provide nolice of a decision or Intended
decision ning a solicitalion, contract award, or axcepbonal
purchasa by elacironic pesting which can bs accessed at the
district’s website waw dadeschools net,

B. Any parson who is advensely sffected by the agency decisioh oc
intended decision shall fila with the agency 2 notice of protest In
writing within 72 hours after the posting of the notica of decision or
infended dacision. Wik respect to a protast of the terrrs.
condibonx, and spacilicyions contained in & solcitaton, ncluding
any provisions governing the mathods of ranking bids, proposals, oc
replies, awarding contrachy, raserving rights of further negobation,
or modilying or amending any contract the notice of peotest shall
be fled In writing within 72 hours sfter the poating of the solicitation,
The forrmat written protest shall be fSed within 10 days after the dats
tha notice of protest is fied. Fallure 1o fila a notice of protest or a
formal written protest shall consbtute a waiver of these
procesdings. The forinal written protest shall state with particutarity
the facts and law upen which the protest Is bassd. Satwrdays,
Sundays, and state hofidzys shall be axcluded in the computation
of the 72-hour irm pericds estabished hecwein.

" €. All notice of protests wiil be reviewed by Procursrment
Managemen? Services, who will offar the protssting bidder the
opportunity o maesat and discuss the mesits of the protest. f the
protest is not resolved, the bidder may seek an adminisirativs
haaring pursuant to §120.57 Fia. Stat, by fling a formal writtan
protest within 10 days after fling the notice of prolest Petitions for
heating pursuant to §120.57 Fla, Stat., must be fiad in accordance
with School Board Ruls 63x13- §C-1 064,

AWARDS

A, RESERVATION FGR REJECTION OR AWARD. The Board
raservas the right te reject any or ali blde, to waive reguiaritas or
technicalities. and fo request rabids. The Board reserves the right
tc award on an individua! itern basis, any combination of ems. totai
low Bid or, if an alternate bid is accepied, on such terms a3 are
spacified for the altermata bid, whichever manner is in the best
Intecast of the Board,

B. NOTIFICATION OF INTENDED ACTION will be postad on the
District's wabshs 7-10 days prior lo a regularly schaduled Board
meating.

C. OFFICIAL AWARD DATE. Awards become official upon the
Board's formal approvai of the award,
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D. PURCHASE ORDERS. Purchasa orders mailed to succexsful
biddars ars the official notification to daliver materials describad
therein; and the tme allowed for dalivery bagine with the dats of
the purchase order. In the event that the successtul bidder fails to
deliver the materials m sccordance with the tams and condibomn of
the bid and purchase ordar, the bldder shall be comsidered to be In
default of the contract and subject to the default provixions slated in
Inatructions to Bidders, Section VI E.

E DEFAULT. A vendor who fals lo perforn sccording to tha
terms of the confract (bid} shall be considered in default In the
event of default, which may nciude, byt & nol Umited (o poor
performance and/or non-performance, a vendor shall either {1} pay
kjudaied damages of 10 parcent of the wunit price of the item(s}
awarded times tha quantity when no purchase onfer has bean
Bsued, 10 percent of the purchase order when a purchasa order
has bean izzusd or $100, whichever ls greater or (2) lose ekgibility
{0 ransact naw businesa with the Board for a pericd of 14 months
from date of termination of award by the Board, Bidders that are
daterminad insligible may request & hearing pursuant to Chapler
120 of the Florida Statutes, and Schoo! Board Rule 5Gx13- 8C-
1084,

F. The intant of the bid documents is o include only the written
raquirements for rmaterialy, equipmaent, systerns, stendards and
workmanship necassary for the propar executjon and completion of
tha work by the Bidder. The bid documents shall not ba construed
o create an entiderment to any othar scope of work excapt as
specifiad harem,

PERFORMANGE SECURITY (FOR SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS
ONLY}

A. PURPOSE A performance bond or check may be requirsd to
Quarantes porformance.

B. BONDING COMPANY. Parformance Bondy shall be written
through a reputable and responsibls sursly bond agency hcensed
10 do husiness in tha State of Florida and with a surety company or
corparation meeling both of the Following specifications:

1. Awnards Greator than $500,000

A rrinimurn rating in the latest revision of Besls Insurance Reporis
of:

Contract Amount Minimum Rating by A M, Bast
§  500,000.011c § 2,500,000 MNone
$2.500,000.01 to § 5,000,000 B + or NA-3

Mo Minimum Class
5 5,600,000.01 to $10,000,000 A- Class vV
$10,000,000.01 or rmores A- Clzss ¥V

Curtent certificate of authority a3 acceptable surety on Federat
Bonds in accordance with the latest ediion of the United States
Treasury Departrment Circular 570 enlitied "Companies Holding
Certificates of Authorily sy Accegtabie Suretias on Fadern) Bonds
and as Acceplable Reinsuring Companies” shail be accepted for an
amount not exceading the underwriting Yirmitation thereon.

Z Awwrds of $500,000 or Leas

Bonds ahal be writtan with 2 surely company or corporation
meating the qualifications ax set forth in Paragraph YILB. sbove or
the qualfications set forth in secton 2870535, Florida Slatutes,

€. AMOUNT, When required sy defined herein, tha fim or
ndividual{s) to whom an award has been mads shali execula and
deliver 1o Tha School Board of Miami- Dade County, Floride, a
Performance Bond, Cxshier's/Certified Check, or equal.

1, Awards less than $200,000 shall be exempt from performance
security. .

2. Performanca =acurity shall not be required, unless otherwis_e
defined in the bid specifications. M performance zecurity &
required, It zhall equal 100% of the &ward armount.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMANCE SECURITY. Return to the
Awardes of hivher cash secxiity, of notification 1o the Awardes and
tha bonding company o cancel the pecformance bond, will ba made
when all goodsservices have been acceptsd and Invoicas have
baen approved for payrmant

Ravised Sept 2005




VIIL, SAMPLES

When bid samples are raquirsd, the buyar will notify bidder 1o
subvmit sarmples of the items bid in Becordance with the fovowing
procedures:

A. Ali samples must be identified with tha bidder's name, bid
nurrber, iem number, wnd product name and number. Where non-
compliance with ths requirement is noted, said ikem may ba
considered By being unidentfiable and may not be afigible for
congideration in tha award recommendaton.

B. Al sarrplas are to be deliverad within 7 calendar days after
receipt of netification from buyer, uniesa otherwise ststed in the
Speclat Condifions of the bid. f tha bidder does nat submil
samples by the date and time indicated by the buyar, the bd
submitted for that item may not be cansidered for award.

C. Bidder mus! obtein, from Materials Testing and Evalustion, 2
signed racaipt acknowiedging defivery of samples. Bidder shall
include m seil-addraszed, stamped envelops for retum of sample
receipt whan submitiing samplas by mail of delivary sarvice. The
bidcar wik receive tha original copy of the receipt and the duplicate
copy will remain with the MiamiDada Counly Publie Schocis
recaiving departmant ms the fle copy. Bidder shall be solsty
responsible for delivery of samples and for retaining zample
delivery receipts, which must be prassnted in any dispute regarding
receipt of bid samples.

D. Samples should be delivared \q the following addrass:

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLYZ SCHOOLS
MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION
7040 West Flagler Streat
Wiami, Floride 33744
Talaphone Number: 786-275-0780

Miami-Dada County Pubfic Schools wii nol oe respansible for
samplea sent to a location other than ths location maentioned n e
bid,

E. PAYMENT FCOR SAMPLES, The Board wil buy no samples
and will axsume na cost Incidental thersto.

F. RETURN OF SAMPLES, Samples not destroyed i lesting may
be claimed by unsutcassful bidders 14 days aRer bid mward dats
and by successful bidders i days afier final payment but the
Board will assunva no respons!bility for samgfes not claimed within
the time specified, and it will pay for no samples damaged in
testing.

G. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS, If & sampla submitied for
tasting dony not camply, tha buyer will advise the biddac \o contact
Materialy Testing and Evaluation for further detais.

IX. SUBSTITUTIONS

Should the bidder find it nacesaary 1o use a material, aquipmaent,
product or system other than spacified, the bidder shall secure from
the Board, through Procurement Manageient Services, wriiten
approval for the use of the alternate matsrisls, sgquipment, product
of system, The Board B not obligated to spprove requests for
substtutions and has the discretion to require the bidder ko provida
the matsrialy as specified in the bid documents. In no case shatl
the bidder be entified to additional Sme and/or monay wrising out of
tha Boards fadure 1o approve requasts for subsBtutions.

X. PACKADING

A TYPE. ¥ packaging ks different from that specifled, the bidder
st note the mannes and amounts in which packaging = io bs
made: otherwise the succeasiul bidder shalt fumish packaging m
spacified. AJ packaging, wrapping and bundiing shall be adequate
1o Insurs that matarials will be received in undamaged condition.

The Board assumes no responsibiity for damages of any kind
incumred in ransit
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B. CONTAINER IDENTIFICATION., The follewing kentfication
shall be printed, siencied o lagibly written ln & conspicucus
locaton on each shipping container:

1. BID NUMBER AND/OR PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
2. VENDOR'S NAME AND/OR TRADEMARK

3, NAME(S) OF ITEM(S) CONTAINED

4, [TEM RUMBER(S) WITH QUANTITY(IES}

XL PURGCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

With the consent and agresment of the auccessiul bidders),
purchases may be made under this bid by Mismi Dade County,
Florida, and cther governmental agencies or pofticat subdivisions
within the Stale of Florida, Such purchases shal ba governed by
the same e and conditions stated hersin. This agreamaent in no
way resiricts or intarfares with the right of any State of Flarida
Agency or political subdiviaion to rebid any or all of thass tarm.

X1 RECYCLING REQUIREMENTS

MiamkDade County Public Schools suppers recycing and
recormmands the use of recycled products whers possibis.
Vendors are requested to submit a letter, along with their bid,
Indicating whether aach iem bid and/or its packaging contalns pre-
ecnsumer pr pest-consurmer wasts, and i the product andfor
packaging may be recycled.

XIII. ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCTS

Miami-Dade County Pubfic Schools encourages the use of
snvirpamentally safs products.

XIV. DELIVERY AND BILL!NG

A DELIVERY. Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays excepted,
deliveries shall be made as folowa: Schoois and Depertments -
800 AM, to 3:00 P.M, Merchandise zhall be unicades ol the
recaiving station of the designated delivery point and received
there by & dasignated agent of the Board. A delivery Scket, or one
copy of the invoice, prepared a3 indicatad below, shall accompany
each delivery.

g. RECEIVING INSPECTION AND TESTING. Daltvered Herms
which da not fulfil all reguiraments will be rejected. Rajectad
ltems shail ba removed and replaced promptly by the vendor, af
no coat 1o the purchaser,

C. INVOICES. Each Invoice shall be msued by the successhl
bidder and shak ba submitled in DUPLICATE to the Accounts
Payabla Section, P.O, Box 01-2570, Miarm, Florida 331031, Tobe
considerad for paymenl each invoice must show the folkwing
information, which appears on the Purchase Order

Purchase Order Number
Mem Descriptions
Quantities and Unils
Price Extenaions

ok W

Total price of all lters on inveice

D. PAYMENT. Unless otharwise speciied by Miami-Dade County
Pubfc Schools, payment wil be made only afier delvery,
authorized inspecion, and acceptance. Payment wil be made
only to he succassha bidder, unlass otherwise requasted. In
wriing, by the successiul bidder and sccepted by Miami-Dade
County Public Schools Adminbtration. Whaen bidders are diracted
to send invoicas 1o = school, tha school wil make direcied
payment to tha bidder,

X¥. NO GRATUITY POLICY
Itis the policy of Procurement Managemeni Services nol Lo ooept

gifts, pratulties, or lavors of any kind, or of any valus whatscevar
fram vandors, members of thek staffs, or families. -

Revised Sept. 2005




XVL COMPLIANCE WITH STATE/FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A AN contracis [nvolving federal funds will cenlain cettain
provisions requirsd by applicable sectiony of Title 34, Section
80.38(1) and Saction B4.510 Code of Faderal Regulations and are
incuded by refsrence hereln. The vendor certfies by signing the
bid that ts vendor and his/her principais are not presendy
debarred, suspendad, propoaed for debarmant, declared insiigible
or voluntarily excluded from participation in {ederaly funded
transactions and rnay, in certain instances, be required to provida
a separals written certification to thes sffect,

During tha tarm of any contract with tha Hoard, in the svent of
debarment, suspension, proposed debarment, daclared inefigible
or voluntarfly exciuded from participation in federaly funded
transactions, the vendor shall mmadiately notfy the Assisiant
Superintendent. Procuremanl Managament Services, in writing.
Vandors wil alzc be required 1o provide sccess to records, which
are directly pertinent to the contract and retain all required records
for threw yaars sfter the Board makes final payment.

B. For ai conwacts involving Federal funds In axcass of $10.000,
the Board reserves tha right o lsrminate the contract for cause, ax
well s for convenisnce, by issuing a cerlified notica to the vendor.

XVIL COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

Brddars shall comply with all federal, state of Florida and local
laws applicable to it and the performance of its obligations under
this bid.

XVII. BACKGROUND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS

In sccordance with the requirements o seclions 101232,
1012.465, and 435.04, Flarida Statutes (2004) as well as with the
raquiraments of HB 1877, Tha Jessica Lursford Act (2005),
elMactive Saptember 1, 2005, Bidder agraes to cerlify undsr oath
and penatty of periury by complating the attached Swom
Statament Pursuaritc Secwns 1012.32, 1012465, and 435.04,
Florida Statutes {2004) and HE 1877, The Jassica Luncford Act
{2005), which is incorporated fully herein by refersnce, that
Bidder and all of in emrployees who provide or may provide
services under this Agreemant hava completed ail background
screening requiremenis xs outiined in the above-refersnced
statutes.

Additionally, Bidder agroes that sach of jta smploysss,
representatives, agents, subcontractors or suppilers who
arw It 3 an /] w tudenis gre
present who have direct contact with students or who have
access (o of control of school funds_must meet jevel 2
screening ryquirements ps described in gections 1012.02
and 43804, Alorida Stalutes and further upon cblalning
fowve! 2 clewrance, must obialn a required Board jssusd
photo iMdentification badge which shall be worn by the
Individual at all Umes whie on Bosrd propetly when
students are prosent,

Bidder agress lo bear any and all cosix assoclaied with
acquiring the reguired background screening - Inciuding
any costs associsted with fingarprinting and obtaining the
required photo Idantiffcation badge, Bidder agress fo
raquire ali its affectsd amployees o sign a statement, as &
conditfon of employment with Bldder in relation fo
performance undsr this Agreement (bid), agresing that the
employss will abice by Lhe herelofore described tmchground
screening reguirements, and also agroaing that the
smplayse will notify the Sldder/Employer of any arresifs) or
conviction(s) of any offenise snumaeratsd in 3. 435.04, Flodde
Statutas within 48 houra of ity cccurrence.

Bidder agrees 1o provide tie Bosrd with a Tst of afl of I
employaes who have compleiad background screening as
requirsd by the above-relersnced statulas and who mest the
statutory raquiremants containad thersln, Bidder agrees that it
has an ongoing duty to maintain and update these listy a3 new
empioyees we hirsd and in the event that any previously
screensd amployes faily to meat e statutory standards. Bidder
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further agrees to notify the Beard Immedistely upen becoming
whatmoflsm’#mmwpnﬂuﬁycmﬁdn
completng the packground check and mwetng the statutory
standards is subsequenlly aested or comvicted ¢f any
disqualkying offense. Fafiure by Biddar lo notify the Board of
such arrest or conviction within 48 hours of baing put on
notice and wilhin 5 business deys of the occurrence cfa
qualifying arrest or conviction, shall constitute grounds for
immediate termination of this Agreament{bld) by the Board.

Faifure by Bidder 1o perform any of the dulias described in this
section shall consStute a materlal breach of the Agreement (bid)
and default entiting tha Boerd 1o yiiize the provizsions of section
Vi E of this bid =5 well aa entiting the Boand to terminats tha
Agreatment{bid) lmrmediately with no furthes responsiblity for tha
Board to maka paymant of perdform any other dufles under this
Agresment {bid}

XIX.COMPLIANCE WITH SCHOOL CODE

Sidder agress to comply with all sections of tha Florida K-20
Education Code, Title XLVII, Florda Statutes as it prasenty
wxsty, and further &3 it may be amendsd from time lo time.
Further Bidder agroas that falure to comply with the Florida K-20
Education Code shalt consttute a matefial breach of this
Agresmant (bid) and may resuit in the termination of this
Agreamaent {bid) by tha Boand.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

sUp ENT OF SCHQOLS

Ravised Sepl 2005



FROM:

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BUREAU OF PROCUREMENT AND MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2"° AVENUE
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO - 036-FF06

AFFIX
POSTAGE
HERE

BID TITLE: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

BID OPENING DATE: May 16, 2006




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Bureau of Procurement and Materials Management

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID
if not submitting a bid at this time, for informatienal purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the informaticn requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Our company does not handle this type of product/service,
We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.
Qur company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
QTHER, (Please spacify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service,

Sighature
Title
Company

NOTE: Failure to respond, either by submifting a bid or this completed form, may result in

your company being removed from the School Board’s bid list. To qualify as a
respondent to the bld, vendor must submit a NO BID.




Vendor Information Sheet

k]

3 g s

e

1A, 2. Telephone/Fax/Contact Person

Federal Employer Identification Number

Telephone number

Qr

Qwner's Social Security Number

Fax number

1B.

Name of Firm, Individual(s), Partners or Corporation

Contact Person

Street Address

City State Zip Code E-mail address
3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship,or joint venture, the full legal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director, or owner who helds, directly or indirectly the majority of the
stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with a trust, the full [egal name and address shall be provided for

each trustee and each beneficiary. Post Office addresses are not acceptable.

Race-
Name Title Address Gender  |ethnicity Stock Ownership

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided on the "Vendor's
Application”. All vendors must have a current vendor's application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be
famtliar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: (a} Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free Warkplace, (¢) Family Leave
Poticy, (d) Code of Business Ethics, (g) Conflict of Interest, (f) Perception, {g) Gratuities, and (h) Business Meals. Failure to
provide M-DCPS a current vendor application may cause the vendor not to be awarded any new business with M-DCPS.

Vendor applications can be downloaded at: http:/procurement dadeschools.net




Miami-Dade County Public Schools
SWORN STATEMENT - NEW CONTRACTS

ATTACHMENT _A
SWORN STATEMENT PURSUANT TO SECTION 1012.465,
FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY
HB 1877, THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT

THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED AND SWORN TO IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY
PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICIAL AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

1. This sworn statement is submitted to The Schoo! Board of Miami-Dade County, Fi

(Hereinafter “Board™ or “Schoo! Board”) by

(Print individual’s name and title)

for
(Print Name of entity submitting swom statement)

whose business address is

and its Federal Employer Identification  Number (FEIN) s
. If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security
Number (SSN) of the individual signing this sworn statement and so indicate.

2. I, , am duly authorized to make this
(Print individual’s name and title)
swom statement on behalf of
(Print Name of entity submitting swom statement)

3. I understand that during the 2005 Legislative Session, House Bill 1877, The Jessica Lunsford
Act (hereinafter “The Act” or “Act”) was passed and approved by Govemor Bush on May 2,
2005, with an effective date of September 1, 2005.

Page 1 of 3
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10.

Initials

I understand that the Act amends the background screening requirements of section
1012.465, Florida Statutes (2004) for all non-instructional school district employees or
“contractual persennel” by requiring all non-instructional school district employees or
contractual personnel who are permitted access on school grounds when students are present
to undergo and pass “level 2 background screening,” and further I understand the Act defines
“contractual personnel” to include any vendor, individual, or entity under contract with the
Board.

I understand that pursuant to section 1012.465, Florida Statutes as amended by the Act, non-
instructional school district employees or contractual personnel who are permitted access on
school grounds when students are present, who have direct contact with students or who
have access to or control of school funds must meet level 2 screening requirements as
described in sections 1012.32 and 435.04, Florida Statutes.

I understand that asa {eg. a private bus
Type of entity

service contractor) all contractual personnel, as defined in section 1012 465, Florida

Statutes, must meet level 2 screening requirements as outlined in sections 1012.32

and 435.04, Florida Statutes in order to do business with The School Board of

Miami-Dade County, Florida.

I understand that “level 2 screening requirements,” as defined in sections 1012.32 and
435,04, Florida Statutes means that fingerprints of all contractual personnel must be obtained
and submitted to the Florida Department of Law Enforcement for state processing and to the
Federal Bureau of Investigation for federal processing.

[ understand that the School Board will implement local procedures to comply with level 2
screening requirements, as defined in sections 1012.32 and 435.04. I understand that my
company must comply with these local procedures as they are developed.

[ understand that any costs and fees associated with the required background sereening will
be bome by my company.

I understand that any personnel of the contractor found through fingerprint processing and
subsequent level 2 background screening to have been found guilty of, regardless of
adjudication, or entered a plea of nolo contendere or guilty to any offense outlined in Section
435.04, Florida Statutes (or any similar statute of another jurisdiction), shall not be permitted
to come onto school grounds or any leased premises where school-sponsored activities are
taking place when students are present, shall not be permitted direct contact with students,
and shall not be permitted to have access to school district funds.

Page 2 of 3
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11.  Iunderstand that the failure of any of the company’s or my affected personnel to meet level
2 screening standards as required by section 1012.465, Florida Statutes, may disqualify my
company from doing business with The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Flonda.

12.  Ihereby certify that the foregoing statement is true and correct in relation to the company for
which I am submitting this swom statement. I further certify that this statement is being
given knowingly and voluntarily by me on behalf of my company.

The company submitting this sworn statement agrees to be bound by the provisions of SECTIONS
1012.32, 1012.465, AND 435.04 OF THE FLORIDA STATUTES AS AMENDED BY HB 1877,
THE JESSICA LUNSFORD ACT 2005.

ICERTIFY THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-
DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA ON BEHALF OF THE COMPANY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH
ONE (1) ABOVE BINDS THE COMPANY TO FULLY COMPLY WITH THE BACKGROUND
SCREENING REQUIREMENTS OF SECTIONS 1012.32, 1012.465, AND 435.04, FLORIDA
STATUTES.

{Signature)

Swom to and subscribed before me this day or , 20

Personatly known

OR Produced Identification

Notary Public -State of

(Type of Identification)
My commission expires

(Printed typed or stamped commissioned
name of notary public)

Page3 of 3
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BID

BUYER PAGE
036-FF06 G. Jackson SC1

SPRINKLERS, LAWN AND TURF

6.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract, at firm unit prices, for the purchase of estimated
requirements for the items listed. The term of the bid shall be for one year from the date of award, and may, by mutual
agreement between Miami-Dade County Pubiic Schools and the successful bidder(s), be extended for two (2)
additional one {1) year period(s} and, if needed, 90 days beyond the expiration date of the current contract period.
Procurement Management Services, may if considering to extend, request a letter of intent to extend from the
successful bidder(s), prior to the end of the current contract period. All prices shall be firm for the term of the contract,
The successful bidder(s) agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

AWARD: Contract will be awarded to the lowest bid from a responsive, responsible bidder, subject to the terms and
conditions contained herein. Items in groups will be awarded by group. Therefore, it is necessary for a bidder to
bid on every item in the particular group for which the bidder submits a bid in order to have a bid considered. Itis also
required that the bidder carefully consider each item, and make sure that each one meets the specifications as
indicated. In the event that one item does not meet such specifications the entire group bid will be disqualified.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES: The estimated quantities provided in the bid proposal are for bidder's guidance only. No
guarantee is expressed or implied, as fo quantities that will be used during the contract period. The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida is not obligated to place an order for any given amount, subsequent to the award of this
bid. Estimates are based upon M-DCPS's actual needs and usage during a twelve {12) month period, and include an
additional ten percent {o cover unanticipated increases in requirements.

NO SUBSTITUTE: Allitems are “no substitute” purchase specifications. Bidders must bid these items as specified.
Faifure to bid "no substitute” items as specified will result in rejection of items.

DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made as soon as possible, but not later than 30 days after receipt of the purchase
order.

DELIVER TO:

Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Maintenance and Materials Management
12525 NW 28D Avenue
Miami, FL 33167
Telephone (305) 995-7770

WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be for one
year or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater. The successfut vendor will be responsible for repairing each unit
during the warranty period, at no cost to the Board. Vendor agrees to repair and return equipment within five (5) days
from receipt of request or provide a temporary replacement.




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOCLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BID BUYER PAGE
036-FF06 G. Jackson SC 2ﬁ

SPRINKLERS, LAWN AND TURF

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

7. UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unautherized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination, Vendors shall be considered in default of the cantract and shall iose eligibility to fransact new business with
the Board for a period of fourteen (14) manths from the date of termination by the Board,

8. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS: When filling out the bid proposal form, bidders are requested to use & typewriter or
complete bid proposat in ink. :

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an error.
3. All changes must be crossed cut and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that da not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item{s). :

9. VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: Afl bidders are requested to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet. In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor(s) have a current vendor application on
file. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
vendor(s) not be awarded any new business. . Vendor - applications can be downloaded at
hito://procurement.dadeschools.net.

10.  OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Mizmi-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County's Occupational License Tax requirements in
accardance with Chapter 8A, Article X of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a location outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their Occupationat Tax requirements, A copy of the license is requested to be submitted
with the bid proposal. If the bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required while the
license is valid and in effect. It is the bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after expiration or
termination of the current ficense. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to be considered for
award.

1. CONE OF SILENCE: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this solicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or information
regarding this bid must be requested in writing by FAX or E-mail to;

Mr. Greg Jackson, Buyer
Procurement Management
Fax #305-523-2214

E-mail: gjackson@dadeschools.net

A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously to:




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

"BID

BUYER PAGE
036-FF06 G. Jackson SC3

SPRINKLERS, LAWN AND TURF

12.

13.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS CONTINUED

lleana Martinez, School Beard Clerk
Miami-Dade County Pubiic Schoals
1450 N.E. 2™ Avenue, Room 2688
Miami, Florida 33132

Fax #305-8995-1448

E-mail: marinez@dadeschools.net

_BID ADDENDUMS: All bidders should monitor continucusly, the M-DCPS, Procurement website, for any addendums

that may be posted, pricr to the opening of this soficitation. The procurement website, which list all bids, addendums,
and award information, is as follows: http://procurement.dadeschools.net, (click) bid solicitation.

CREDIT CARDS: Maintenance Materials Management may place some orders and utilize, as the form of payment, a

Distric-issued credit card, to the extent autharized by the School Board. These orders will be made via phone or fax for
direct delivery and billing to the requesting work location. Please note that credit card purchases will benefit all vendors
by providing immediate payment {i.e., within 48-72 hours), thereby eliminating the need to submit an invoice to the
District's Accounts Payable Department or reconcife receivable balances. For credit card purchases, alf vendors must
have the capability to accept fax orders, which must be confi rmed by ¢alling back the requesting work location to verify
prices and obtain a credit card number.

Only actual items shipped!delivered can be charged to the credit card account (i.e., no back-orders). All purchase
defiveries must include a packing slip or receipt/invoice listing the items and prices of goods delivered. For security
reasons, the credit card charge receipt showing the work location’s credit card number cannot be attached to the
packing siip or receipt/invoice submitted as part of the purchase delivery. District work locations may request that a
vendor maintains secure records of the credit card account assigned an alias or password, to avoid divulging the actual
card number upon every purchase,




The School Board of Mlami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #036-FF06

Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

8ID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

i er rint Lo e bax e PLEASE COMPLETE
""" phis ALL SHADED AREAS
Bid #036-FF06 OF BIDDES B
Titla: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf
Buyer: G. Jackson
ESTIMATED PRICE PER MANUFACTURER &
ITEM|| DCPS # DESCRIPTION GF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT UNIT MODEL NUMBER
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR
Items 1 through 12 will be award on a total low bid
basis. Vendor must bid all items.
1 || 559-0001 Sprinkler, head, 7/32" X 3/16", Rainbird 30H-TNT,no substitute 2 Each
2 || 558-0019 Sprinkler, lawn, Rainbird with 3/18" nezzle, no substitute 56 Each
Nozzle, Sprinkler, Rainbird, Plastic, 360 degree, Full Circle, 15°
3 | 889-0027 radius, 30 PSL. Model 15-F, 1300 seties, o substitute. 22 Bach
4 | 559-0080 Sprinkler, Rainbird, with 1/4" nozzle, Model 650, no substitute. 63 Each
5 | 558-0078 | Sprinkler, head, Rainbird, with 1/4" X /8" nozzle, no substimte. 44 Each
& || 553-0108 Sprinkier, Pop-up, full circle, 5.0, Rainbird, no substitute. 65 Each
7 | ssa-0180 Sprirkler, Rainbird, 4" stem, Pop-up. Plastic, without nozzle, 570-4P, 129 Each
no substitute.
) Nozzle, sprinkler, Rainbird, Plastic, 90 degree, Quarter Circle, 15'
8 || 859-1422 radius, 30 PSJ, model 15-Q, 570 series, no substitute. 24 Each
) Nozzle, Sprinkler, Rainbird, plastic, {80 degree, haif circle, 15'
9 || 859-1431 radiug, 30 P8I, model |5-H, no substitute. 509 Bach
10 || s59-1485 Sprinkler, pop-up, 3", Rainbird, without ‘mzzle, series C.O.M. (100 453 Each |F
per case}, no substitute.
_ Sprinkler, rotary, Rainbird, 180 degree, half circle, Falcon series F4
11 || 559-1481 with #12 nozzle, C.O.M,, no substitute. 214 Each
12 | s59-1511 Sprinkler, rotary, Rainbird, 360 degrces: full circle, Falcon, with #12 218 Each
nozzle, np subshilute.
Page 1 FM-3738 Rev. (05-5)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida
Bid #036-FF0€
Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

BID PROFPOSAL FORM {FORMAT 8)

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS

Bid #036-FFD8
[Title: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf
Buyer: G. Jackson

ren| ocPs # DESCRIFTION OF ITEM ESTIMATED | 1| PRICE PER| MANUFACTURER&

QUANTITY UNIT MODEL NUMBER

Items 13 through 21 will be awarded on a totsl Jow bid basis. 7
Veador must bid all items.

Sprinkler, Pop-Up, Taro, with 6.G part nozzle, ADJ. ARC, 150
13 || 589-1279 | degrees, Pant Circle, 4248 ft radius, 50 PSI, model #TR-50-P-6.0, 044 Each
TRS50P series, no substitute,

14 || 5581287 Sprinkler, Pop-Up, Toro, with 6.0 nozzle, 360 degree, Full Circle,

Commercial, model 8-700C-FC-6.0, 5700 series, no subsbinute. 222 Each

15 | s50-0205 Nozzle, Sprinkler, 360 degree, Full Circle 15F-Toro F 570 senies, nj 1,013 Each

substiture.

16 || 559-0264 Sprinkler, 4" stem, Toro, Pap-Up toro $70Z-4P, no substituts, 1206 Each

17 I 555.0299 Mozzle, Sprinkler, Toro, Pla‘stac, 90 degr_ees. Quaster Circle - Toro
570 series, no substitute.

Nozzle, Sprinkler, Toro, Half Circle, Plastic, 180 degeees, 15H, Toro
570 series, no substitute,

844 Each

18 || 559-0302 1,530 Each

19 || s59-0311 Sprinkler, Pop-Up, 3", Tore without nozzle - Toro “Z7 series 370-Z,

no substitute. 817 Each

20 { 559-0345 Sprirkler, rotary, Toro, with #42 nozzle and strator, 180 degrees,

Toro 640 saries, no substitute. i Fach

21 || s50-0353 Sprinkler, Rotary, Pop-Up, Toro Full Circle with 42 nozzle, 360

degrees, Toro 640 series, no substitute, % Each

Items 22 and 23 will be awarded on a tatal low bid basis. Both
items must be compatible and made by the same manufacturer.
Vendor must bid both items.

22 || 559-0035 Valve, Midget, Nelson 7642, no substitute (10/Bx) 100 Each

23 || 559-0051 Key, Midget, Nelson 7641, no substitute (for above valve). 106 Each

Items 24 and 25 will be awarded on a total low bid basis. Both
items must be compatible and made by the 1ame manufacturer,
Veador must bid both items,

24 || 559-0141 Valve. Midget, Toro 473-00, no substitute (10/Bx) 7 Each

251 5590159 Key. Midget, Toro 463-00, no substitute (for above vaive) i3 Each

Page 2 _ FM-3738 Rev, {06-38)
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