THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
SCHOOL BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING

1450 Northeast Second Avenue

Miami, FL 33132

Ml;r_nl-Da'ﬂe Ccu'n’ty‘uplic Sch!ouls _hh——— ek ki Bl
e e Direct all inquiries to ent Management
Services:
BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM BUYER NAME:

BID NO. 027-HH08
BID TITLE Music Furniture and Equipment

E-MAIL ADDRESS:
PHONE: (305)
FAX NUMBER
TDD PHONE (305) 995-2400

Bids will be accepted until 2:00 PM on October 9, 2007 in room 351, School Board Administration building, 1450 NE 2nd
Avenue, Miami, FL., 33132, at which time they will be publicly opened. Bids may not be withdrawn for __ 180 days after opening.
(Refer to Instructions to Bidders, para. {V.B.)

THE SUBMISSION OF THE BID BY THE VENDOR, ACCEPTANCE AND AWARD OF THE BID BY THE SCHOOL BOARD OF
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND SUBSEQUENT PURCHASE ORDERS ISSUED AGAINST SAID AWARD SHALL
CONSTITUTE A BINDING, ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE STIPULATED IN THE BID DOCUMENTS, NO
OTHER CONTRACT DOCUMENTS SHALL BE ISSUED,

. A, BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION

| certify that this bid is made without pnor understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or
person submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies, or equipment, and is in all respects fair and without collusion
or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid; and | certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder.

B. Vendor certifies that it satisfies all necessary legal requirements as an entity to do business with the School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida.

I INDEMNIFICATION

The Bidder shall hold harmless, indemnify and defend the indemnities {as hereinafter defined} against any claim, action, loss,
damage, injury, liability, cost or expense of whatsoever kind or nature including, but not by way of limitation, attorney's fees and
court costs arising out of hodily injury to persons, including death, or damage to tangible property arising out of or incidental to
the performance of this Contract (including goods and services provided thereto) by or on behalf of the Bidder, whether or not
due to or caused in part by the negligence or other culpability of the indemnity, excluding only the sole negligence or culpability
of the indemnity. The following shall be deemed to be indemnities: The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida and its
members, officers and employees.

i, PERFORMANCE SECURITY, is required on this bid.  YES [.F NO [ -}
Refer to INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS, para. VIl and Vi.
IF PERFORMANGE SECURITY IS REQUIRED, PLEASE INDICATE THE TYPE TO BE FURNISHED:

Performance Bond E Check {Cashier's, Certified, or equal)

An original, manual signature is required on the Bidder Qualificatlon Form.
{Bidder Is requested to use blue ink)
(Do not use pencil)

Legal Name of Vendor
Maijling Address
City State Zip Code

|| Telephone No. E-mail address
i By: Signature (Original)
| Of Authorized Representative
| Name (Typed or Printed)

Of Authorized Representative

FM-3191 Rev. (01-04)




INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

NOTICE OF ESTABLISHMENT OF A CONE OF SILENCE

The School Board of Miami-Dade Counly Public schools enacts a Cone
of Siencg from issuance of a solicitation to written recommendation of
award. All provisions of School Board Rule 6Gx13-8C-1.212 apply.

L  PREPARATION OF BIDS

A. BIDDER QUALIFICATICN FORM qualifies the bidder and the
bid and must be completed and submitted as page 1 of the bid.

1. PERFORMANCE SECURITY. The form of performance security
the bidder will submit, when required to do so0, must be furnished.
Performance security shall not be submitted with the bid.

2. BIDDER CERTIFICATION AND IDENTIFICATION. Bid must
contain an onginal manual signature from an authorized
representative. An unsigned bid will be considered non-responsive.

B. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS. Defines conditions of the bid.

1. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE. Any inconsistency in this bid shall
be resolved by giving precedence in the following order:

A. Specifications
B. Special Conditions
C. Instructions To Bidders

2. FOR MAWBE designated bids. The SPECIAL CONDITIONS-
Minority/Women oaned and controlled Business Participation
Statement and the MWBE Ceitification Application MUST be
completed and SUBMITTED with the bid if the bidder is not cenified
by Miami-Dade County Public Schools. Fallure to submit the
completed application with the bid will be considered non-
responsive.

C. BID PROPOSAL FORM. Defines requirement of items to be
purchased, and must be compleled and submitted as page 2 and
subsequenl pages, if any, of the bid. The bidder should indicale
his/her name in the eppropriate space on each page.

1. ITEM SPECIFICATION. Spedifying a certain brand, make or
manufacturer is to dencle the quality, type, and standard of the
article desired. Articles offered must be new merchandise only, of
equal or superior grade. On blank lines provided, the bidder is
requested to Inseri the brand name, manufacturer's number and
other inforrmation necessary to sufficlently identify aricle offered.
Failure to do so may prevent consideration of the item. Also, referto
paragraph X. Packaging.

2. PRICES. Prices are requested in units of quantity specified in
the bid specifications, In case of a discrepancy in computing the
total amount of bid, UNIT PRICE quoted will govemn. All prices bid
shall include detivery F_Q.B. destination, freight prepald (bidder pays
and bears freight charges. Bidder owns goods in transil and files
any claims) and shall mclude all carlage, drayage, packing, efc.,
delivered to and unloaded at the receiving sialion at the sile
designated in BID PROPOSAL FORMS and there received by the
designated agent of the Board.

3. TAXES. The Board does nol pay Federal Excisa and State taxes
on direct purchases of langible personal property, The applicable
tax exemplion number is shown on the purchase order, This
exemption does not apply to purchases of tangible personal propeny
made by contractors who use the tangible personal property in the
performance of contracts for the improvement of Board-owned real
property as defined in Chapter 192 of the Florida Statutes.

1. SUBMITTING OF BIDS

A. BID FORMS AND ENVELOPES. Bids must be subwnitted on
forms fumished by the Board and in sealed packages or envelopes.
Bid submissions must be clearly marked with bid number, bid title
and bid opening date.
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B. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS. When filling out the bid
proposal form, bidders are required to complete bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.
2. Do not erase or use comection fluid to correct an erfor.
3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with Rems 1, 2 and 3
above wilt be considered non-responsive for that tem({s).

C. PLACE, DATE AND HOUR. Bids shall be submitted by U.S. Mail,
Courier/Express Service, or deposited in the BID BOX located in Room
351, 8:00 AM. 1o 430 PM., Monday through Friday, SCHOOL
BOARD ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 145G N.E. Second Avenue,
Miami, Florida 33132. Bids received after the date and hour specified
in the BIDDER QUALIFICATION FORM will not be considered.

D. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES. Section 287.133{2){a) Fiorida Statute.
A person or affiliate who has been placed on the convicled vendor list
following a conviction for a public entity crime may not submit a bid on
a contract to provide any goods or services to a public entity, may not
submit a bid on a comtract with a public entity for the construction or
repair of a public building or public work, may not submit bids on
leases of real property t0 a public eniity, may not be awarded or
perform work as a contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or consullant
under a contract with any public entity, and may not transact business
with any public entily in excess of the threshold amount provided in
Section 287.017, for CATEGORY TWO for a period of 36 months from
the date of being placed on the convicted vendor list.

E. SUBMITTING A “NO BID.” if not submitling a bid al this time,
return the form entited "NOTICE TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS."
Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or the "NOTICE TO
PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS" form for three consecutive times, may
result in the company being removed from the School Board's bid lisL.

F. AVAILABILITY OF BID INFORMATION. Iimmediately following the
public opening, bids will be read, upon request, and then compiled in a
tabular form, a copy of which will be available for examination in
Procurement Managermnent Services.

CANCELLATION OF BIDS OR REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS

An invitation for bids may be canceled, in whole or in pari, as may be
specified in the solicitation, when it is in the best interest of the Board.
The reasons shall be made a part of the master bid file.

A. Prior to opening, a solicilation may be canceled in whole or in part,
prior to the date and hour specified in the Bidder Qualification Form for
receipt of bids, when lhe Assistant SuperimMendent, Procurement
Management Services, detemmines in writing, that such action is in the
best interest of the Board for reasons including, but not limited to:

i{. The Board no longer requires the supphlies, services, or
construction;

2. The Board no longer can reasonably expect to fund the
procurement;

3. A review of a valid protest filed by a bidder as may be determined
by the administrative staff, or

4. Proposed amendments to the solicitalion would be of such
magnitude that a new solicitation is desirable.

B. When a soficitation is canceled prior to opening, notice of
cancelation shall be posted on the District's website, and sent to all
businesses solicited, via facsimile or mail. Any bids or proposats
received for the cancelled solicitation shall be retumed to the vendor
unopenad.

The notice of cancellation shall:

1. Hentify the solicitation;

2. Briefly explain the reason for cancellation; and

3. Where appropriate, explain that an opportunity wil be given to
compete on any future re-solicitation for procurements of similar
supplies, services, or construction.

Revised June 2007
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V1.

CHANGE OR WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS

A. PRIOR TO BID OPENING. Should the bidder desire to change or
withdraw histher bid, hefshe shall do so in writing.  This
communication is to be received by the Diskict Direclor, of
Procurement Manggement, Room 352, School Board Adminisiration
Building, prior to date and hour of bid opening. The bidders name,
the bid number, the bid title and the date the bid is due must appear
on the envelope.

B. AFTER BID OPENING. After bids are opened, they may not be
changed, nor withdrawn, for 90 days after the determined opening
date, unless olherwise specified on the "BIDDER QUALIFICATION
FORM.”

C. FAILURE TO ACCEPT BID AWARD. Bidders who, prior to the
Bid Award by The Scheol Board of Miami-Dade Counly, Florida,
indicate that they are unable to accepl the bid award shall either:

1. Pay to the Board, as liquidated damages, an amount equal to
5% of the unit price bid, times the quantity, or $10, whichever
amount is larger, or

2. Lose eligibility to transact new business with the Board for a
period of 14 months from the date the Board acts on the
withdrawn bid.

PROTESTS TO CONTRACT SOLICITATION OR AWARD

A. The Board shall provide notice of a decision or intended decision
concerning a solicitation, contract award, or excaplional purchase by
electronic posting which can be accessed at the disirict’s website
www.dadeschools.net.

B. Any person who is adversely affected by the agency decision or
intended decision shall file with the agency a nolice of protest in
writing within 72 hours after the posting of ithe notice of decision or
intended decision. With respect to a protest of the terms, conditions,
and specifications contained In a solicitation, including any provisions
goveming the methods of ranking bids, proposals, or replies,

-awarding contracts, reserving rnights of further negoliation, or

modifying or amending any contract, the nolice of protest shall be
filed in writing within 72 hours after the posting of the soficitation. The
formal writlen protest shall be filed within 10 days after the date the
notice of protest is filed. The formal writlen prolest shall slate with
particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.
Salurdays, Sundays, and state holidays shall be excluded in the
computation of the 72-hour time periods established herein.

C. The protesting party shall be required to-post a bond
consistent with F.A.C. Rule 28-110.005{2}, and Board RAule 3G-
1.11. Failure to tile a protest within the time prescribed in
Saction 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or fallure to post the bond or
other security required by law within the time allowed for fiing a
bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120,
Florida Statutes.

D. Fomal, writlen protesis will be reviewed by Procurement
Management Services, who will offer the protesting bidder the
opportunity lo meet and discuss the merits of the protest, If the
protest is not resolved, the bidder may seek an administrative hearing
pursuant to §120.57 Fla. Stat Petitions for hearing pursuant to
§120.57 Fla. Stat., must be filed in accordance with Scheol Board
Rule 6Gx13- 8C-1.054.

AWARDS

A. RESERVATION FOR REJECTION OR AWARD. The Board
reserves ihe right to reject any or all bids, to waive megularities or
technicelities, and 1o request rebids. The Board reserves the right to
award on an individual item basis, any combination of items, tolal low
bid or, i an alternate bid is accepted, on such terms as are specified
for the altermate bid, whichever manner is in the best interest of the
Board.

The Board reserves the right to utilize other govemmentat contracts, if
in the besi interest of the Board.

B. NOTIFICATION OF INTENDED ACTION will be posted on the
District's webshe no later than the Friday preceding a regulary
scheduled Board meeting.

ViL
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C. OFFICIAL AWARD DATE. Awards become official upon the
Board's formal approval of the award.

D. TERMINATION FOR CONVENIENCE

The Board reserves the right 1o terminate this contract at any time and
for any reason upon giving thirty (30) days’ notice to the other party.
said contract should be terminated for convenience as provided hergin,
the Board will be relieved of all obligations under said contract. The
Board will only be required to pay that amount of the contract actually
performed to the date of termination. Upon such payment, both parties
shall be relieved of any further obligations under this contract.

E. PURCHASE ORDERS. Purchase orders malled to successful
bidders are the official notification to deliver materials described therein;
and the time allowed for delivery begins with the date of the pwichase
order, In the event that the successful bidder fails to deliver the
materials in accordance with the ferms and conditions of the bid and
purchase order, lhe bidder shall be considered to be in default of the
conlract and subject to the default provisions stated in Instructions to
Bidders, Section V1. G.

F. DEFAULT. A vendor who fails to perform according to the temms of
the contract (bid) shall be considered in default. In the event of default,
which may include, but is not limited to poor performance and/or non-
performance, a vendor shall either (1) pay fiquidaled damages of 10
percent of the unit price of the lem(s) awarded limes the quaniity when
no purchase order has been issued, 10 percent of the purchase order
when a purchase order has been issued or $100, whichever is greater
or {2) lose eligibility to transact new business with the Board for a period
of 14 months from date of termination of award by the Board. Bidders
that are determined ineligible may request a hearing pursuant lo
Chapter 120 of the Ficrida Statutes, and School Board Rule 6Gx13- BC-
1.064.

G. The intent of the bid documents is to include only the written
requirements for materials, equipment, systems, standards and
workmanship necessary for the proper execulion and compietion of the
work by the Bidder. The bid documents shall not be construed to create
an entitlement to any other scope of work except as specified herein.

PERFORMANCE SECURITY {FOR SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS ONLY)

A. PURPOSE. A performance bond or check may be required to
guarantee performance.

B. BONDING COMPANY. Performance Bonds shall be written through
a reputabie and responsible surety bond agency licensed to do
business in the Stale of Florda and with a surety company or
corporation meeting both of the foklowing specifications:

1. Awards Greater than 0,
A minimum rating in the latest revision of Best's Insurance Reports of:

Contrect Amount Minimum Rating by A.M. Best
$ 500,000.01 to $ 2,500,000 None
§ 2,500,000.01 to $ 5,000,000 B + or NA-3

No Minimum Class
$ 5,000,000.01 to $10,000,000 A-Class IV
$10,000,000.01 or more A-Class V

Cument certificate of authority as acceptable surety on Federal Bonds in
accordance with the lalest edition of the Uniled States Treasury
Department Circular 570 enttled "Companies Holding Cenrtificates of
Authority as Acceptable Sureties on Federal Bonds and as Acceptable
Reinsuring Companies” shall be accepted for an amounl not exceeding
the underwriting limitation thereon.

2. Awards of $500,000 or Less
Bonds shali be written with a surety company or corporation meeting the

qualifications as set forth in Paragraph VII.B. above or the qualifications
set forth in section 267.0935, Florida Stalutes.

C. AMOUNT. When required as defined herein, the firm or individual(s)
to whom an award has been made shall execute and deliver to The
School Board of Miami- Dade County, Florida, a Performance Bond,
Cashier's/Certified Check, or equal.

Revised June 2007




PACKAGING

A. I packaging is different from that specified, the bidder must note the
manner and amounts in which packaging is to be made; olherwise the
successful bidder shall fumish packaging as specified. Al packaging,
wrapping and bundling shall be adequate to insure that materials will be
recefved in undamaged condition. The Board assumes no responsibility
for damages of any kind incurred in transil.

B. The following identification shall be printed, stencited or legibly
written in a conspicuous location on each shipping container.

1. Awards less than $200,000 shall be exempt from performance X.
security.

2. Perfformance secwity shall not be required, untess otherwise
defined in the bid specifications. If pefformance security is required, it
shall equal 100% of the award amount.

D. RELEASE OF PERFORMANCE SECURITY. Relurn to the
Awardee of his/her cash security, or nolification lo the Awardee and
the bonding company to cancel the performance bond, will be made
when alt goodsiservices have been accepted and invoices have been

approved for payment 1. BID NUMBER AND/OR PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER

2. VENDOR'S NAME AND/OR TRADEMARK
3. NAME(S) OF ITEM(S) CONTAINED
4. ITEM NUMBER(S) WITH QUANTITY{IES)

YIIL.SAMPLES

When bid samples are required, the buyer will notify bidder to submit
samples of the items bid in accordance with the following pracedures:

X1. PURCHASES BY OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES

With the conseni and agreement of the successful bidder(s), purchases
may be made under this bid by Miami Dade County, Florida, and other
governmental agencies or political subdivisions within the Stale of
Florida. Such purchases shall be governed by the same terms and
conditions stated herein. This agreement in no way restricts or
interferes with the right of any State of Florida Agency or palitical
subdivision lo rebid any or all of these items.

A. All samples must be identified with the bidder's name, bid number,
ftem number, and product name and number. VWhere non-compliance
with this requirement is noted, said item may be considered as being
unidentifiable and may not be eligible for consideralion in the award
recommend ation.

B. Al samples are to be delivered within 7 calendar days after
receipt of notificalion from buyer, unless otherwise staled in the
Special Conditions of the bid. If lhe bidder does not submit samples
by the date and time indicated by the buyer, the bid submitted for that
item may not be considered for award. - RECYCLING REQUIREMENTS
Miami-Dade County Public Schools supports recycling and
recormimends the use of recycled products where possible. Vendors are
requested to submit a letter, along with their bid, indicating whether
each ftem bid and/or its packaging contains pre-consumer or post-
cansumer waste, and if the product and/or packaging may be recycled.

XI

C. Bidder must obtain, from Maleriais Tesling and Evalualion, a
signed receipt acknowledging delivery of samples. Bidder shalt
include a self-addressed, slamped envelope for return of sample
receipt when submitting samples by mail or delivery service. The
bidder will receive the original copy of the receipt and the duplicate
copy will remain with the Miami-Dade County Public Schools
receiving department as the fie copy. Bidder shall be solely
responsible for delivery of samples and for retaining sample delivery
receipts, which must be presented in any dispute regarding receipt of
bid samples.

X1, ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCTS

Miami-Dade County Public Schools encourages
environmentally safe products.

DELIVERY AND BILLING

A. DELIVERY. Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays excepted, deliveries
shall be made as follows: Schools and Depantments - 8:00 AM. to
3:00 P.M. Merchandise shall be unloaded at the receiving slation of

the use of

X1V,
D. Samples shoukl be delivered to the following address:

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

MATERIALS TESTING AND EVALUATION
7040 West Flagier Street
Miami, Florida 33144
Telephone Number. 786-275-0780

Miami-Dade County Public Schools will not be responsible for
samples sent to a location other than the location mentioned in the
bid.

E. PAYMENT FOR SAMPLES. The Board will buy no samples and
will assume no cost incidental Lhereto,

. RETURN OF SAMPLES, Samples not destroyed in lesting may
be claimed by unsuccessful bidders 14 days after bid award date and

the designated delivery point and received there by a designated agent
of the Board. A delivery ticket, or one copy of the invoice, prepared as
indicated below, shall accompany each delivery,

B. RECEIVING INSPECTION AND TESTING. Delivered items which
do not fuffill all requirements will be rejected. Rejected items shall be
removed and replaced prompily by the vendor, at no cost to the
purchaser.

C. INVOICES. Each invoice shall be issued by the successful bidder
and shall be submitted in DUPLICATE to the Accounts Payable
Section, P.O. Box 01-2570, Miami, Florida 33101. To be considered
for payment, each invoice must show the following information, which
appears on the Purchase Order:

by successful bidders 14 days after final payment; but the Board will 1. Purchase Order Number

assume no fesponsibility for samples not claimed within the time 2. Hem Descriplions

specified, and it will pay for no samples damaged in testing. a. Quantities and Units

G. EVALUATION AND TEST RESULTS. If a sample submitted for 4. Price Extensions

testing does not comply, lhe buyer will advise the bidder to contact 5. Tolal price of all iterns on invoice

Matenals Testing and Evaluation for further details.

D. PAYMENT. Unless otherwise specified by Miami-Dade County

IX. SUBSTITUTIONS Public Schools, payment will be made only after defivery, authorized

Should the bidder find it necessary 10 use a maleral, equipment,
product or system other than specified, the bidder shall secure from
the Board, through Procurement Management Services, written
approval for the use of the altemate materials, equipment, product or
syslem. The Board is not obligated to approve requests for
substitutions and has the discretion 10 require the bidder to provide
the materials as specified in the bid documents. In no case shall the

inspection, and acceplance. Payment wil be made only to the
successful bidder, unless otherwise requested, in writing, by the
successful bidder and accepled by Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Administration. When bidders are directed lo send invoices lo a
school, the school will make directed payment to the bidder.

XY. NO GRATUITY POLICY

bidder be entitied to additional time and/or money arising out of the
Board's failure to approve requests for substitutions.

It is the policy of Procurement Management Services not lo accept gifts,
gratuities. or favors of any kind, or of any value whatsoever, from
vendors, members of lheir staffs, or families.

Revised June 2007
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' XVL COMPLIANCE WITH STATE/FEDERAL REGULATIONS

A. Al contracts involing federal funds will conmtain certain
provisions required by applicable sections of Tite 34, Seclion
80.26(1) and Section 85.510 Code of Federal Regulations and are
included by reference herein. The vendor cerifies by signing the bid
that the vendor and hisMar principals are not presently debarred,
suspended, proposed for debarmaent, declared ineligible or
volunlarily excluded from participation in federally funded
transactions and may, in certain instances, be required to provide a
separate written centification 1o this effect.

During the term of any contract with the Board, in the event of
debarment, suspension, proposed debarment, declared ineligible or
voluntarity excluded from paricipation in federally funded
transactions, the vendor shafl immediately notify the Assistant
Superintendent, Procurement Management Services, in writing,
Vendors will also be required to provide access to records, which

are directly pertinent to the contract and retain all required records -

for three years after the Board makes final payment.

B.  For all contracts involving Federal funds in excess of $10,000,
the Board reserves the right to tarminate the contract for cause, as
well as for convenience, by issuing a certified notice to the vendor.

XVIL. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

Bidders shall comply with all federal, state of Florida and local laws
applicable to it and the performance of its obligations under this
bid.

XVII. BACKGROUND SCREENING REQUIREMENTS

In accordance with the requirements of sections 1012.32,
1012.485, and 435.04, Florida Statutes (2004) as well as with the
requirements of HB 1877, The Jessica Lunsford Act {2005),
effective September 1, 2005, Bidder agrees to certify under ocath
and penalty of perjury by completing the attached Swom Statément
Pursuant to Sections 1012.32, 1012465, and 43504, Florida
Statutes (2004) and HB 1877, The Jessica Lunsford Act (2005},
which is incorporated fully herein by reference, that Bidder and all
of its employees who provide or may provide services under this
Agreernent have completed all background screening requirements
ag outiinad in the above-referanced statutes.

Additionally, Bidder agrees that each of ils empioyees,
rapmsenratrves sgen:s subcontmctors or supphers m‘}_q__em
’ en o

who h . wfth nls or wha have aocess lo or

__eys_mmed_ma_ﬁ.
control of school funds_must meetl level 2 screening requirements

a3 described in sections 1012.32 and 435 04, Flonda Statutes, and
further upon oblsining level 2 clearance, must oblain a required
Board issued photo identification bedge which shall be wom by the
individual &t ell imes while on Boerd property when students are
presant.

Bidder agrees lo bear any and el costs associeled with ecquinng
the mquired background screening — including any costs
associafed with fingerprinting and cbtaining the required photo
entification badge. Bidder agrees 10 mquire all its affected
employaes lo sign a statemenl, as a condition of empioymant with
Biddar in relation to performance under this Agreement (bid),
agreeing that the employse will abide by the heretolore descnbed
background screening requirements, and also egreeing that the
employee will nofify the BiddenEmployer of any amesi(s) or
conviction{s) of any offense enumersled in s. 435.04, Fiorida
Statutes within 48 hours of s occurrence.

Bidder agrees to provide the Board with a list of all of its employees
who hava completed background screening as required by the above-
referenced statutes and who meet the statulory requirements
comtained therein. Bidder agrees .that # has an ongoing duty 10
maintain and update these lists as new empioyees ere hired and In the
avent that any previously screened employee fails to meet the
statutory standards. Bidder further agrees to nolify the Board

immediately upon becoming aware that one of its employees who was
previcusly certified as completing the background check and meeting the
statutory standards is subsequenlly arested or convicled of any
disqualifying offense. Failure by Biddsr to notify the Board of such ames!
ar conviction within 48 hours of being put on natice and within 5 business
days of the occumence of a qualifying arres! or conviction, shalf constiute
grounds for immediale termination of this Agreemeni({bid) by the Boartl

Failure by Bidder to perform any of the duties described in this section
shall constituta a material breach of tha Agreement (bid) end default
entitling the Board to ulilize the provisions of section V1. E of this bid as
wall as entilling the Board to terminate the Agreement({bld) immediately
with no further rasponsibility for the Board to make payment or perform
any other duties under this Agreement (bid).

XIX. COMPLIANCE WITH SCHOOL CODE

Bidder agrees to comply with all sections of the Florida K-20 Education
Code, Title XLVIN, Florida Statutes as it presently exists, and further as
it may be amended from time to time. Further Bidder agrees that failure
to comply with the Florida K-20 Education Code shall constiiule a
material breach of this Agresment (bid} and may result in the
termination of this Agreement {(bid} by the Board.

XX. CHARTER SCHOOLS

ftems or Services awarded under this contract shall be made available
to Charter Schools approved by the School Board of Miami-Dade
County Public Schools. M-DCPS is not responsible or liable for
purchases that may be made by Charter Scheols.

XX1. CONFLICT OF INTEREST

Former Miami-Dade County Public Schools employees, classified as
Managerial Exempl Personnel, Pay Grade 22 and above, Dade County
Scheol Administrators Association, Pay Grade 47 and above, and
other equivalent positions, are prohibited from personally representing
another person or entity or acting as an agent or attorney for
compensation in connection with any matter in whica " . Sehool
Board of Miami-Cede County, Florida, is interested, for two years after
the School Board employees’ sefvice terminates. This provision is
pursuant to School Board Rule 6Gx13 ~ 4A-1.212 and Florkla Slatute
§ 112.313(9).

XXIL PUBLIC RECORDS LAW

Pursuant to Fiorida Statute, # is the practice of M-ODCPS to make
available for public inspection and copying any information received In
response to an Invitation to Bid or Request for Proposals (RFP). No
action on the pant of the respondent to a Bid or RFP will create an
obligation of confidentiality on the part of the School Board, including
but not limited to, making a raference in the response to the trade
secret statutes. It is recommended ihat polential suppliers exclude
from their response any Information that, in their Judgment, may be
considered a trade secrel.

THE.SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

%0

NT-OF SCHOOLS

- Revised June 2007




Vendor Information Sheet

1A. 2. TelephonefFax/Contact Person
Federal Employer Identification Number
Or Telephone number

QOwner's Social Security Number
1B. Fax number

Name of Firm, Individual{e), Pariners or Gorporation

Contact Person

Street Address

City State Zip Code E-mail address
3. Ownership Disclosure

If the contract or business transaction is with a corporation, partnership, sole proprietorship,or joint venture, the full legal name
and business address shall be provided for the chief officer, director, or owner who holds, directly or indirectly the majority of the
stock or ownership. If the contract or business transaction is with a trust, the fult legal name and address shall be provided for

each trustee and each beneficiary. Post Office addresses are not acceptable.

Race-
Narne Titie Address Gender ethnicity Stock Ownership

NOTE: The information provided by the vendor on this form should be consistent with that provided con the "Vendor's
Application”. All vendors must have a current vendor’s application on file with M-DCPS, and have provided information and/or be
familiar with M-DCPS' policy regarding the following: {a) Employment Disclosure, (b) Drug Free Workplace, (¢) Family Leave
Policy, (d) Code of Business Ethics, (&) Conflict of Interest, (f) Perception, (g} Gratuities, and {(h) Business Meals. Faiiure to
provide M-DCPS a current vendor application may cause the vendor not to be awarded any new business with M-DCPS.

Vendor applications can be downloaded at: http://procurement.dadeschools.net




FROM:

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES

ROOM NO. 352 BID BOX
1450 N.E. 2P AVENUE

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33132

BID NO.: 027-HHO8

AFFIX
POSTAGE
HERE

BID TITLE: Music Furniture and Equipment

BID OPENING DATE: October 9, 2007




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Procurement Management Services

NOTICE OF PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

NO BID
If not submitting a bid at this time, for informational purpose only, detach this sheet from the
bid documents, complete the information requested, fold as indicated, staple, affix postage
and return address, and mail. NO ENVELOPE IS NECESSARY.

NO BID SUBMITTED FOR REASON(S) CHECKED AND/OR INDICATED:

Our company does not handle this type of product/service.
We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an alternate equal product.
Our company is simply not interested in bidding at this time.
OTHER, (Please specify)

We do not want to be retained on your mailing list for future bids for this type
or product and/or service.

Signature
Title

Company

NOTE: Failure to respond, either by submitting a bid or this completed form, may result in

your company being removed from the School Board's bid list. To qualify as a
respondent to the bid, vendor must submit a NO BID.




MIAMI-UADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BUYER PAGE
027-HHO8 D. Denson SCH1

TITLE

Music Furniture and Equipment

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

PURPOSE: The purpose of this bid is to establish a contract, at firm unit prices, for the purchase of estimated
requirements for the items listed. The term of the bid shall be two (2) years from the date of award, and may, by mutual
agreement between The School Board of Miami Dade County, Florida and the awardee, be extended for two (2)
additional one (1) year period(s) and, if needed, 90 days beyond the expiration date of the current contract period.
Procurement Management Services, may if considering to extend, request a letter of intent to extend from the awardee,
prior to the end of the current contract period. All prices shall be firm for the first two (2) years of contract period. In
the event that the prevailing market conditions warrant an adjustment in bid prices contained in the contract,
Procurement Management may approve price increases during each extension period (Please see special condition
12). The successful vendor(s) agrees to this condition by signing its bid.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES: The estimated quantities provided in the bid proposal are for bidder's guidance only. No
guarantee is expressed or implied, as to quantities that will be used during the contract period. The School Board of
Miami-Dade County, Florida is not obligated to place an order for any given amount, subsequent to the award of this
bid. Estimates are based upon M-DCPS’s actual needs and usage during a two (2) year period, and include an
additional ten (10}) percent to cover unanticipated increases in requirements.

DELIVERIES: Delivery shall be made in accordance with the delivery schedule listed on the purchase order.

SPECIFICATIONS: If anitemis to be considered as an equal to the specified item, complete technical specifications,
together with illustrative materials providing brand name and model number of the item, are requested to accompany
bid. Inaddition, samples of the items may be requested for bid evaluation. When requested, bidder(s) shall submit the
samples at no cost to M-DCPS within (10} working days after notification to the address specified on the request.
Failure to submit the samples within the specified period of time shall be cause for considering the bidder(s) non-
responsive and ineligible for award.

UNAUTHORIZED SHIPMENT/SUBSTITUTION: Unauthorized substitutions and shipments shall be grounds for
termination. Vendors shall be considered in default of the contract and shall fose eligibility to transact new business
with the Board for a period of fourteen (14) months from the date of termination by the Board.

DAMAGED GOODS: Awardees shall be responsible for filing, processing and collecting all damage claims against
the shipper for damaged materials. The awardee shall also be responsible for effecting an immediate replacement
shipment of damaged materials.




‘ MIAMI-DADE COUNITY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BUYER PAGE
027-HH08 D. Denson SC?

TITLE
Music Furniture and Equipment

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

7. Cone of Silence: A Cone of Silence is applicable to this competitive solicitation. Any inquiry, clarification or
information regarding this bid must be requested in writing by Fax or E-mail to:

Donna Denson, Buyer
Procurement Management
Fax No. (305) 523-3366
E-mail: ddenson@dadeschools.net

A copy of this written request must be sent simultaneously to:

lleana Martinez, School Board Clerk
Miami-Dade County Pubtic Schools
1450 N, E. 2 Avenue, Room 268B
Miami, Florida 33132
Fax No. (305) 995-1448
E-mail: martinez@dadeschools.net

8. VENDOR INFORMATION SHEET: All bidders are requested to complete the attached Vendor Information Sheet, In
order to conduct new business under this bid, M-DCPS requires that the vendor(s) have a current vendor application on
file. The information on both documents must be consistent. Failure to comply with this condition may cause the
Bidder{s) not to be awarded any new business.  Vendor applications can be downloaded at
procurement.dadeschools.net.

9. ERASURES OR CORRECTIONS: When filling out the Bid Proposal Form, bidders are required to use a
typewriter or complete bid proposal in ink.

1. Use of pencil is prohibited.

2. Do not erase or use correction fluid to correct an error.

3. All changes must be crossed out and initialed in ink.

Those bids for individual items that do not comply with items 1, 2 and 3 above will be considered non-responsive for
that item(s).

10. CREDIT CARDS: Some orders may be placed by schools or departments utilizing a district issued credit card as the
form of payment. These orders will be made via phone or fax for direct delivery and billing to the requesting work
location. Please note that credit card purchases will benefit all vendors by providing immediate payment (i.e., within 48-
72 hours) and eliminating the need to submit an invoice to the District's Accounts Payable Department or reconcile
receivable balances. For credit card purchases, all vendors must have the capability to accept fax orders, which must
be confirmed by calling back the requesting work location to verify prices and obtain a credit card number. Only actual
items shipped/delivered can be charged to the credit card account (.., no back-orders). All purchase




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA
BUYER PAGE
027-HHO8 D. Denson SC3
TTLE
Music Furniture and Equipment

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

deliveries must include a packing slip or receiptfinvoice listing the items and prices of goods delivered. For security

reasons, the credit card charge receipt showing the school's or department's credit card number cannot be
attached to the packing slip or receipt/invoice submitted as part of the purchase delivery. The school or department
may request for a vendor to maintain a secure record of their specific credit card account that can be used by
assigning an alias or password, to avoid having to divulge the actual credit card number each time a purchase is
made.

11. OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE: Any person, firm, corporation or joint venture, with a business location in Miami-Dade
County, Florida, which is submitting a bid, shall meet the County’s Occupational License Tax requirements in
accordance with Chapter 8A, Aticle 1X of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. Bidders with a location outside
Miami-Dade County shall meet their local Occupational Tax requirements. A copy of the license is requested to be
submitted with the Bid Proposal. If the bidder has already complied with this requirement, a new copy is not required
while the license is valid and in effect. It is the Bidder's responsibility to resubmit a copy of a new license after
expiration or termination of a current license. Non-compliance with this condition may cause the bid not to be
considered for award.

12. ESCALATION/DE-ESCALATION CLAUSE:
Escalation/De-escalation Clause: At the end of the initial two-year contract period, providing the options to extend is
exercised, and in the event that prevailing market conditions warrant an adjustment in bid prices contained in the
contract, the following escalation/de-escalation clause shall be the only clause applicable or acceptable to the Board:

» Such changes must be accompanied by a certified copy of the supplier's advisory or notification to the awardee
of price changes.

» No price escalation will be authorized in excess of the amount of the increase referred to on the supplier's
notice.

» The approved price change shall be honored for all orders received by the awardee after the effective date of
such price change.

» Approved price changes are not applicable to orders already issued and in process at time of price change.

e The Board reserves the right to audit and/or examine any pertinent books, documents, papers, records or
invoices relating directly to the contract transaction in question after reasonable notice and during normal
business hours.

» The Department of Procurement Management retains the right to determine whether or not such proposed
price changes are in the best interest of the District.

» Awardee must tie any price change clause to an industry-wide or otherwise nationally recognized index, or
some other form of verifiable documentation. Awardee will provide the Department of Procurement
Management a copy of such publication.




‘ MIAMI-DADE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT A) TO: THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FLORIDA

BUYER PAGE
027-HHO8 D. Denson SC4

TITLE
Music Furniture and Equipment

SPECIAL CONDITIONS
13. BID ADDENDUMS: All bidders should monitor continuously, M-DCPS, Procurement and Materials Management
website for any addendums that may be posted, prior to the opening of this solicitation. The Procurement and
Materials Management website, which list all bids, addendums, and award information, is as follows:

http:{/procurement.dadeschools.net

14, AWARD: The award of this bid may be made to two (2) responsive, responsible bidders, who offer the lowest price
for each item. If the primary awardee fails to perform under the terms and conditions of the contract, the secondary
awardee will be contacted.




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #027-HHO8
Music Furniture and Equipment

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or print in this box the PLEASE COMPLETE
complete name of the bidder: ALL SHADED AREAS
Bid #027-HH08 NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Music Furniture and Equipment
Buyer: D. Denson
ESTIMATE PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM D UNIT UNIT MANUFACTURER & MODEL #
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR
ALL PRICE MUST INCLUDE SHIPPING. FOR THOSE
ITEMS THAT REQUIRE INSTALLATION BY THE
VENDOR, PRICES MUST INCLUDE SHIPPING AND
INSTALLATION.
1 [|Cabinet: 100-Slot mobilc choral folic on casters with maple 60 Each |[$
doors. Installation required. Per cach
47 3/4"W x 17 538"D x 47 1/4"H.
Mfg: Wenger  Model # 146K002.106 or equal
2 |Cabinet: 75-5lot mobile band/orchestra folio on casters with 60 Each ||$
maple door. Installation required. Per each
47 3/4"W x 17 5/8"D x 47"H.
Mifg: Wenger  Model # 146K003.16 or equal
3 ||Cabinet: Guitar storage with Maple doors. Instaltation 60 Each |3
required. 27"W x 30"D x 96"H Per cach
Mfg: Wenger  Model # 250A019.101 or equal
4 (Cabinet: Instrument storage with Maple doors. 60 Each |%
Installation required. Per each
27 172"W x 19 1/4"D x 85 5/8"H.
Mifg: Wenger Model # 250A.001.101 or equal
5 [|Cabinet: Instrument storage with Maple doors . 60 Each ||$
Installation required. Per cach
27 1/2"W x 19 1/4"D x 85 5/8"H.
Mfz: Wenger Model # 250A004.101 or equal
6 |Cabinet: Instrument storage with Maple doors . Installation 60 Each |$
required. Per each
27 1/2"W x 19 1/4"D x 85 5/8"H.
Mfg: Wenger  Model # 250A002.101 or equal
7 ||Cabinet: Instrument storage with Grille doors . Installation 60 Each |8
required. Per each
27 1/2"°W x 29 1/4"D x 85 5/8"H.
Mifg: Wenger Model #: 250A010.101 or equal
B |[Cabinet: Instrument slorage with Maplc doors. Installation 60 Each |$
required. Per cach
27 1/2"W x 39 1/4"D x 85 5/8"H.
Mig: Wenger Model # 250A011.101 or equal

Page 1 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #027-HHO8
Music Furniture and Equipment

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or print in this box the
lcomplete name of the bidder:

Bid #027-HH08

Title: Music Furniture and Equipment

Buyer: D. Denson

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS

NAME OF BIDDER:

ESTIMATE PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM D UNIT UNIT MANUFACTURER & MODEL #

9 [|Cabinet: Instrument storage with Maplc doors . 60 Each ||$
Installation reqnired. Per each
27 1/2"W x 39 1/4"D x B5 5/8"H.
Mfg: Wenger Model # 250A007.101 or equal

10 (|Cabinet, Instrument Storage, Deluxe Percussion with Solid Doors 60 Each |§
(Acccssories included) 1nstallation required Per cach
48"W X 26"D
Mig: Wenger Model # 147G001.102 or equal

11 |iCabinet, Robe and Uniform Storagc with vents with Maple 60 Each [$
Poors. Installation required [Per cach
27-1/2"X29-1/4"D x 85-5/8"D
Mfg: Wenger Model #250A032.107 or equal

12 ||Cabinet, Instrument Storage with Maple Doors. 60 Each |$
27-1/2"W x 39-1/4"D x 85-5/8"H Per cach
Mfg: Wenger Model #250A005.101 or equal

13 [iCart, Music Stand Storage, Zine Plated Steel Tubing with Swivel 60 Each ||$
Casters. 68"L x 26"W. Per each
Mfg: Wenger Model # 039A203 or equal

14 |Stand, Roughneck (Adjustable Height 24" ta 46") 60 Each (%
20"W x 13-1/2"H Per each
Mig: Wenger Model # 037B001 or equal

15 ||Rack, Bass, Maplc Finish, Rollaway. Installation required 60 Each |§

Per each

Mfg: Wenger Model #148F003.101 or equal

16 ||Rack, Cello, Maple Finish, Rollaway. Installation required 60 Each |[$

Per cach

Mig: Wenger Model #148F001.102 or equal

17 |Rack, Violin/Viola, Maple Finish, Rollaway. Installation 18 Each [I$
required. Per each

Mfg: Wenger Model # 148F005.102 or equal

Page 2
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #027-HH08
Music Furniture and Equipment

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or print in this box the PLEASE COMPLETE
complete name of the bidder: ALL SHADED AREAS
Bid #027-HHO8 NAME OF BIDDER:
[Title: Music Furniture and Equipment
Buyer: D. Denson
ESTIMATE PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM D UNIT UNIT MANUFACTURER & MODEL #
18 |\Chair, Music Posture, Black. 1000 Bach ||
Mifg: Wenger Model # 0936121 or equal )
19 ||Chair, Music Posture, Chrome Frame 1000 Bach |$__
Pcr each
Mfg: Wenger Model # 0936921 or equal
20 ||Chair, Storage Cart (Holds 18 Music Posture Chairs) 1000 Each |$
Per each
Mfg: Wenger Model # 054C661 or equal
21 ||Chair, Accessory, Arm Folding Tablet, Left Hand 1000 Each ||$
Per each
Mig: Wenger Model # 0939015 or equal
22 ||Chair, Aceessory, Arm Folding, Tablet, Right. 1000 Each |%
Per each
Mig: Wenger Model #0939014 or equal
23 @ductor's System (Pcbble Desk, Stand, Podium and Chair). 50 Each |§
Per each
Mfg: Weuger Model # 1110225 or equal
24 |IConductor's System (Pebble Desk, Stand, Podium and Chair) 50 Each |[|§
Per each
Mfg: Wenger Model # 1110235 or equal
25 IMidi Workstation 10 Each |$
Per cach
Mig: Wenger Model # 225C10,101 or equal
26 |Risers, Band, Scated Vcsalite Black. lustallation required. 100 Each ||§
Per cach
Mfg: Weuger Model # GP615 or equal
27 [|Risers, Tourmaster 3-Step with 6" with 6' back rail. 1nstallation 100 Each |$
required. Per each
Mig: Wenger Model # 024F806 and
(24E0778 or equal
28 liRisers, Versalite Accessory Package, Installation required. 100 Each |[$
Per each
Mfg: Wenger Model # SPL2002 or eqnal
Page 3 FM-3738 Rev. {06-98)




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #027-HH08
Music Furniture and Equipment

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or print in this box the PLEASE COMPLETE

complete name of the bidder: ALL SHADED AREAS

Bid #027-HH08 NAME OF BIDDER:

Title: Music Furniture and Equipment

Buyer: D. Denson

ESTIMATE PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM D UNIT UNIT MANUFACTURER & MODEL #

29 |Legacy Acoustical Shell Unit, with Tapered Canopy {includes 25 Each [|$

canopy tool), Installation required. Per cach

Mig: Wenger Model # 186A302 or equal
30 ||Back rail 6' 100 Each ||$

Per cach

Mfg: Wenger Model # 024E778 or equal

31 |Portable Floor. Installation required. 20 Each [$
Per each

Mfg: Wenger Model # SPL2024 or equal

The award of item 32, will be awarded to all responsive % OAT List Priee

responsible bidders. or Catalog
32 |[Balance of Award: % off List Price or Catalog

Page 4 FM-3736 Rev. {06-98)




