
Date: 2/9/2004

Prepared by: R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #010-AA09

Plastic Can Liners Verified by:___________

Item #/Description:

Bidder's Name Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr.

AFP Industries, Inc. 5,550 $5.98 $33,189.00 Tyco Special #1- Does Comply 600 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID 5,000 $16.08 $80,400.00
Tyco Special #3 -Does not 
comply 8,000 $15.48 $123,840.00

Tyco LBF 3036 - Does not 
comply 30,300 $13.58 $411,474.00

Tyco Special #4 - 
No Sample

Biko, Inc 5,550 $7.20 $39,960.00 Essex EPM 24 - Does Comply 600 $17.85 $10,710.00
Essex Custom - Does 
Not Comply 5,000 $17.35 $86,750.00

Essex Custom - Does Not 
Comply 8,000 $20.40 $163,200.00

CAT 37XH - Does Not 
Comply 30,300 $15.08 $456,924.00

CAT 48XH - Does 
not comply

Colonial Paper, Inc. 5,550 $5.43 $30,136.50 Essex EPM 24 - Does Comply 600 $11.46 $6,876.00
JR Plastics #JRP 
43X52 as Spec. 5,000 $9.70 $48,500.00

JR Plastics #JRP3660R - 
Does not comply 8,000 $10.95 $87,600.00

JR Plastics JRP3037 1.2 
Mil - Does Not Comply 30,300 $8.45 $256,035.00

JR Plastics 
JRP4048 as Spec.

District Healthcare 5,550 $5.85 $32,467.50 Calico 9940187 as Spec. 600 $9.60 $5,760.00
Calico 9910783 as 
Spec. 5,000 $9.44 $47,200.00 Calico 36X60 as spec. 8,000 $11.60 $92,800.00

Calico 9910276 - Does 
Comply 30,300 $8.23 $249,369.00

Calico 40X48 as 
Spec

EMF Enterprises 5,550 $5.52 $30,636.00
Fortune Plastics #BR245BR 
15X19X23- Does Not Comply 600 $11.06 $6,636.00

Fortune Custom - No 
Sample 5,000 $10.94 $54,700.00

Fortune Custom 36X60 - 
No Sample 8,000 $13.41 $107,280.00

Fortune Custom 30X37- No 
Sample 30,300 $9.27 $280,881.00

Fortune Custom 
40X48 - No Sample

Fesco 5,550 $5.74 $31,857.00
Poly Plastics 24"X23" - No 
Sample 600 $10.75 $6,450.00

JR Plastics #JRP 
43X52 as Spec. 5,000 $10.55 $52,750.00

JR Plastics #JRP3660 - 
Does Not Comply 8,000 $12.62 $100,960.00 JR Plastics JRP3037 30,300 $8.86 $268,458.00

JR Plastics 
JRP4048 as Spec.

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation 5,550 $4.88 $27,084.00 INT-2423-R - No Sample 600 $11.74 $7,044.00 INT-4251 as Spec. 5,000 $9.48 $47,400.00

INT-3660 Super Tough - 
No Sample 8,000 $10.48 $83,840.00

INT- 3037 Super Exh - No 
Sample 30,300 $7.30 $221,190.00

INT-4048-SuperExh -
No Sample

Miritech International, 
Inc. 5,550 $4.90 $27,195.00

General Plastics 24X23 Clear -
Color Does Not Comply 600 $13.50 $8,100.00

General Plastics 
42.5X51.5  Black - 
Does Not Comply 5,000 $11.51 $57,550.00

General Plastics 36X60 - 
Does Comply 8,000 $11.39 $91,120.00

General Plastics 30X37 
Black- As Specified 30,300 $7.86 $238,158.00

General Plastics 
40X48 Black- As 
Specified

Miritech International, 
Inc. 5,550 $0.00 NO BID 600 $0.00 NO BID 5,000 $20.50 $102,500.00

General Plastics 36X60 - 
100 per case - Does not 
comply 8,000 $0.00 NO BID 30,300 $0.00 NO BID

Pabco Industries 5,550 $5.98 $33,189.00 Pabco 2423LT- As Specified 600 $10.60 $6,360.00
Pabco 43X52 - As 
Specified 5,000 $9.75 $48,750.00

JR Plastics JRP3660R - 
Does not comply 8,000 $11.00 $88,000.00

JR Plastics JRP 3037- 
Does Not Comply 30,300 $8.06 $244,218.00

JR Plastics 
JRP4048 - As Spec.

The Bear Group, Inc. 5,550 $34.65 $192,307.50
Champion Plastics, Champtuf- 
No Sample 600 $17.00 $10,200.00

Champion Plastics, 
Champtuf - No 
Sample 5,000 $15.22 $76,100.00

Champion Plastics, 
Champtuf- No Sample 8,000 $59.25 $474,000.00

Champion Plastics, 
Champtuf - No Sample 30,300 $14.06 $426,018.00

Champion Plastics, 
Champtuf No 
Sample

The Bear Group, Inc. 5,550 $6.12 $33,966.00
Flexible Packaging - No 
sample 600 $19.10 $11,460.00

Flexible Packaging - 
Qualified Bid 5,000 $14.07 $70,350.00

Flexible Packaging - 
Qualified Bid 8,000 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID 30,300 $10.11 $306,333.00

Flexible Packaging - 
No Sample

Total Connection 5,550 $5.09 $28,249.50
General Plastics 24X24 - Does 
Comply 600 $12.40 $7,440.00

General Plastics 
42.5X51.5, 3 mill 
case of 50 - Does Not 
Comply 5,000 $10.95 $54,750.00

GP Plastics 36X60 case 
of 50 - Does comply 8,000 $10.65 $85,200.00

General Plastics 30X37 - 
As Specified 30,300 $7.35 $222,705.00

General Plastics 
40X48 - As 
Specified

 = LOW BID

 Item 1: Liner, plastic 23"X24" or 24"X24"                    
(Unit of Measure = Case)                

 Item 2:  Liner, plastic 42.5"X51.5"                   
(Unit of measure = Case) 

Item 3: Liner, plastic 36"X60"                           
(Unit of measure = Case)  

Item 4: Liner, plastic 30"X37"                           
(Unit of Measure = Case) 

Item 5: Liner, plastic 40"X48"                         
(Unit of Measure = Case) 
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